
120870_COLD WATER METER ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME

Bid Date: 11/14/2012
Number: 120870
Title: COLD WATER METER ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME

Unit Qty Total Unit Qty Total Unit Qty Total
no bid 10 no bid $1,605.88 10 $16,058.80 $1,680.00 10 $16,800.00
no bid 10 no bid $1,810.32 10 $18,103.20 $1,890.00 10 $18,900.00
no bid 10 no bid $2,007.53 10 $20,075.30 $2,065.00 10 $20,650.00
no bid 10 no bid $2,970.33 10 $29,703.30 $3,025.00 10 $30,250.00
no bid 10 no bid $3,318.33 10 $33,183.30 $3,410.00 10 $34,100.00

no bid $117,123.90 $120,700.00

Bidder/Item Description

TOTAL BID PRICE

BIDDERS

1.0 2" ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME METER
2.0 3" ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME METER

4.0 6" ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME METER
5.0 8" ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME METER

3.0 4" ULTRASONIC TRANSIT-TIME METER

BADGERMETER INC
VENDOR 1 VENDOR 2 VENDOR 3

MASTER METER INC VELLANO BROS INC

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 

not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   
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