
121220_WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Bid Date: 1/30/2013
Number: 121220
Title: WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

ALUMINUM 
CHEMICAL 

SPECIALTIES
PRAXAIR INC

KUEHNE CHEMICAL 
CO INC

HOLLAND 
COMPANY INC

SLACK CHEMICAL 
CO INC

no bid no bid no bid $0.2000 no bid
no bid no bid no bid $0.1950 no bid

$0.2320 no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid $2.0000 no bid $0.9490

no bid no bid $2.5000 no bid $1.0490

no bid no bid $2.5000 no bid $0.9840

no bid no bid no bid no bid $699.4700

no bid no bid no bid no bid $864.3200

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

BIDDERS

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, B: 
PARTIAL (2,500-3,500 GAL) (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, C: 
FULL LOAD SPLIT DELIVERY (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
CATEGORY E: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
SODIUM HYDROXIDE, 50% (PER DRY TON)

ALUMINUM CHLORHYDRATE, 83% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY C: 2400 GALLON DELIVERY
CATIONIC POLYMER - LIQUID (PER GAL)
CATEGORY D: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

Bidder/Item Description

POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE, 70% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY B: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACTIY 4000

CATEGORY A: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

POLYALUMINUM HYDROXYCHLOROSULFATE, 70% BASICITY 
(PER LB WET)

CATEGORY H: 50 LB BAGS, 4X4 PALLET QUANTITIES
COPPER SULFATE (PER LB)

CATEGORY F: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
HYDROFLUOROSILICIC ACID, HFS, 25% (PER LIQ TON)
CATEGORY G: FULL LOAD @ 20 TON
CARBON DIOXIDE (PER LIQ TON)
OPTION FOR HALF LOAD QUANTITY (PER LIQ TON)

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, A: 
FULL LOAD UNIT PRICE (ANY SITE) (PER GAL)

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 

not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 



121220_WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Bid Date: 1/30/2013
Number: 121220
Title: WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, B: 
PARTIAL (2,500-3,500 GAL) (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, C: 
FULL LOAD SPLIT DELIVERY (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
CATEGORY E: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
SODIUM HYDROXIDE, 50% (PER DRY TON)

ALUMINUM CHLORHYDRATE, 83% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY C: 2400 GALLON DELIVERY
CATIONIC POLYMER - LIQUID (PER GAL)
CATEGORY D: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

Bidder/Item Description

POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE, 70% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY B: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACTIY 4000

CATEGORY A: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

POLYALUMINUM HYDROXYCHLOROSULFATE, 70% BASICITY 
(PER LB WET)

CATEGORY H: 50 LB BAGS, 4X4 PALLET QUANTITIES
COPPER SULFATE (PER LB)

CATEGORY F: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
HYDROFLUOROSILICIC ACID, HFS, 25% (PER LIQ TON)
CATEGORY G: FULL LOAD @ 20 TON
CARBON DIOXIDE (PER LIQ TON)
OPTION FOR HALF LOAD QUANTITY (PER LIQ TON)

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, A: 
FULL LOAD UNIT PRICE (ANY SITE) (PER GAL)

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

BIOSAFE SYSTEMS
THATCHER 

COMPANY OF NY
USALCO LLC

KEMIRA WATER 
SOLUTIONS

POLYDYNE INC

no bid no bid $0.1330 no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid $0.1380 no bid

no bid no bid $0.2169 $0.2360 no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid $5.4560

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid $526.0000 no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$1.4700 (alternate) no bid no bid no bid no bid

BIDDERS



121220_WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Bid Date: 1/30/2013
Number: 121220
Title: WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, B: 
PARTIAL (2,500-3,500 GAL) (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, C: 
FULL LOAD SPLIT DELIVERY (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
CATEGORY E: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
SODIUM HYDROXIDE, 50% (PER DRY TON)

ALUMINUM CHLORHYDRATE, 83% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY C: 2400 GALLON DELIVERY
CATIONIC POLYMER - LIQUID (PER GAL)
CATEGORY D: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

Bidder/Item Description

POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE, 70% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY B: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACTIY 4000

CATEGORY A: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

POLYALUMINUM HYDROXYCHLOROSULFATE, 70% BASICITY 
(PER LB WET)

CATEGORY H: 50 LB BAGS, 4X4 PALLET QUANTITIES
COPPER SULFATE (PER LB)

CATEGORY F: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
HYDROFLUOROSILICIC ACID, HFS, 25% (PER LIQ TON)
CATEGORY G: FULL LOAD @ 20 TON
CARBON DIOXIDE (PER LIQ TON)
OPTION FOR HALF LOAD QUANTITY (PER LIQ TON)

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, A: 
FULL LOAD UNIT PRICE (ANY SITE) (PER GAL)

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

SUMMIT RESEARCH 
LABS

JCI JONES 
CHEMICAL INC

COYNE CHEMICAL AIC BISON

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

$0.2750 no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid $0.5820 no bid no bid $0.7500

no bid $0.5820 no bid no bid $0.8500

no bid $0.5820 no bid no bid $0.7800

no bid $593.0000 no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

no bid no bid no bid $1.7200 no bid

BIDDERS



121220_WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Bid Date: 1/30/2013
Number: 121220
Title: WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, B: 
PARTIAL (2,500-3,500 GAL) (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, C: 
FULL LOAD SPLIT DELIVERY (CITY RESEVOIRS) (PER GAL)
CATEGORY E: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
SODIUM HYDROXIDE, 50% (PER DRY TON)

ALUMINUM CHLORHYDRATE, 83% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY C: 2400 GALLON DELIVERY
CATIONIC POLYMER - LIQUID (PER GAL)
CATEGORY D: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

Bidder/Item Description

POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE, 70% BASICITY (PER LB WET)
CATEGORY B: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACTIY 4000

CATEGORY A: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000

POLYALUMINUM HYDROXYCHLOROSULFATE, 70% BASICITY 
(PER LB WET)

CATEGORY H: 50 LB BAGS, 4X4 PALLET QUANTITIES
COPPER SULFATE (PER LB)

CATEGORY F: FULL TRUCKLOAD GALLON CAPACITY 4000
HYDROFLUOROSILICIC ACID, HFS, 25% (PER LIQ TON)
CATEGORY G: FULL LOAD @ 20 TON
CARBON DIOXIDE (PER LIQ TON)
OPTION FOR HALF LOAD QUANTITY (PER LIQ TON)

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 13.5 TRADE PERCENT AVAIL. C12, A: 
FULL LOAD UNIT PRICE (ANY SITE) (PER GAL)

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

BIDDERS

SOLDAY

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid


	121220

