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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING

oneci

ROCHEST

ty

Bureau of

Purchasing

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Title: VALVES

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY TI-SALES
GROUP A: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON
TAPPING SLEEVES UP TO 12" L.D. UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
0931 $ 753.00| 1 [S 753.00|S 650.06| 1 (S 650.06 NO BID 1 NO BID
0932 S 895.00| 1 |$ 89500 (S 77283 | 1 |$ 772.83 NO BID 1 NO BID
0933 S 895.00| 1 (S 895.00(S 77283 | 1 (S 772.83 NO BID 1 NO BID
0934 $ 1,098.00| 1 |$ 1,098.00 (S 949.23 | 1 |$ 949.23 NO BID 1 NO BID
0935 $ 1,109.00| 1 [S 1,109.00 S 949.23 | 1 S 949.23 NO BID 1 NO BID
0936 $ 1,190.00| 1 |$ 1,190.00 (S 1,02751| 1 |$ 1,027.51 NO BID 1 NO BID
0937 $ 2,175.00| 1 [S 2,175.00|S 1,877.41| 1 |S$ 1,877.41 NO BID 1 NO BID
0938 $ 2,310.00| 1 |$ 2,310.00 S 199487 | 1 |$ 1,994.87 NO BID 1 NO BID
0939 $ 2,175.00| 2 |S 4,350.00 S 1,877.41| 2 |S 3,754.82 NO BID 2 NO BID
0940 $ 2,311.00| 1 |$ 2,311.00 (S 1,99432| 1 |$ 1,994.32 NO BID 1 NO BID
0941 $ 2,748.00| 1 [S 2,748.00|S 2,372.42| 1 |$S 2,372.42 NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP A TOTAL S 19,834.00| $ 17,115.53 NO BID
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY TI-SALES
GROUP B: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON
TAPPING SLEEVES, 16" I. D. AND LARGER UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL
0943 $ 6,600.00| 1 [S 6,600.00(S 5,151.92| 1 |$ 5,151.92 NO BID 1 NO BID
0944 $ 6664.00| 1 [S 6,664.00|S 5,206.72| 1 |$ 5,206.72 NO BID 1 NO BID
0945 S 8,00400| 1 |S 8,00400|S 6,236.30| 1 |S 6,236.30 NO BID 1 NO BID
0946 $ 8151.00| 1 [S 8,151.00|S 6,368.53| 1 |S$S 6,368.53 NO BID 1 NO BID
0947 $10,314.00| 1 |$10,314.00|S 8,05898| 1 |S$ 8,058.98 NO BID 1 NO BID
0948 $10,314.00| 1 [S$10,314.00|S 8,058.98| 1 [S 8,058.98 NO BID 1 NO BID
0949 $22,644.00| 1 |$22,644.00| NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 NO BID
0950 $23,652.00| 1 |[S23,652.00| NOBID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP B TOTAL S 96,343.00 INCOMPLETE NO BID
GROUP C: RESILIENT-SEAT TAPPING VALVES UNIT QTyY TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL
0951 $ 607.00| 1 [S 607.00|S 47677 | 1 |S 476.77 NO BID 1 NO BID
1491 S 842.00| 6 |S 505200|S 673.62| 6 |S 4,041.72 NO BID 6 NO BID
1494 $ 1,249.00| 3 [S 3,747.00|S 1,000.40| 3 [S 3,001.20 NO BID 3 NO BID
0954 $ 1,870.00| 1 (S 1,870.00|S 1,508.53| 1 |S$ 1,508.53 NO BID 1 NO BID
1497 $ 2,859.00| 1 (S 2,859.00|S 2,376.08| 1 [S 2,376.08 NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP C TOTAL S 14,135.00| $ 11,404.30 NO BID
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY TI-SALES
GROUP D: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON
TAPPING SLEEVE END GLANDS UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL
2170 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2171 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2172 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2173 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2174 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2175 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2176 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2177 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2178 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
GROUP D TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP E: TAPPING SLEEVE GASKETS, ENDS
AND SIDE FOR DUCTILE IRON OR CAST IRON UNIT QTyY TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL
TAPPING SLEEVES
2180 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2181 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2182 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2183 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2184 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2185 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2186 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
2187 NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID NO BID 1 | NOBID
2188 NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID NO BID 1 |NOBID
GROUP E TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING

Title: VALVES

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY TI-SALES
GROUP F: STAINLESS STEL TAPPING SLEEVES UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL
1988 S 44130 1 (S 44130|S 35395| 1 (S 35395 (S 457.16| 1 |$ 457.16
1989 S 44130| 1 |$S 44130(S 35395| 1 |$S 35395|S$ 45716 1 [S 457.16
1992 S 45391 | 1 (S 45391 |S 36282 | 1 [S 36282 (S 47335 1 |$ 473.35
1993 S 45391 | 1 |$ 45391 (S 36282 | 1 |S 36282 |S$S 47335 1 S 47335
1994 S 491.08| 1 (S 491.08|S 39254 | 1 (S 39254 (S 52646 1 |S 526.46
1995 S 491.08| 1 |$S 491.08 S 39254 | 1 |S 39254 |S$S 52646 1 [S 526.46
1998 S 52226 | 1 (S 52226 |S 43282 | 1 [S 43282 (S 55832 1 |$ 55832
1999 S 52226 | 1 |$ 52226 (S 43282 | 1 |S 43282 |S 54824 1 (S 54824
2000 S 68817 1 [S 68817 |S 58220| 1 |S 58220(S 707.92| 1 |$ 707.92
2001 S 68817 | 1 |$S 688.17 (S 58220| 1 |$S 58220 |$ 73746 1 |S 737.46
2002 S 64371 | 1 S 643.71|S 457.01| 1 [S 45701 (S 669.15| 1 |$S 669.15
2003 S 64371 | 1 |$ 64371 S 45701 | 1 |$ 457.01|$ 57888 1 |S 578.88
2004 S 81426 | 1 (S 81426 |S 62587 | 1 [S 62587 S 809.06| 1 |[S 809.06
1973 S 81426 | 1 |S 81426 (S 62587 | 1 |S 62587 |S 79278 1 |[S 792.78
1976 S 94035| 1 |$ 94035(S 55298 | 1 |$S 55298 | S$ 1,03826( 1 [S 1,038.26
1977 S 94035| 1 |$ 94035(S 55298 | 1 |$ 55298 | $ 103826 1 [S 1,038.26
1978 S 96888 | 1 [S 96888 |S 70278 | 1 |S 70278 (S 1,236.67 | 1 |$S 1,236.67
1979 S 96888 | 1 |S 968.88 (S 70278 | 1 |$S 70278 | S 1,236.67 | 1 [S 1,236.67
1980 S 94234 | 1 (S 94234 |S 58265| 1 (S 58265 (S 1,202.22| 1 |$ 1,202.22
1981 S 94234 | 1 |$S 942.34 [ NOBID 1 [NOBID $1,202.22 | 1 |$ 1,202.22
1982 $ 1,100.27 | 1 |S 1,100.27 |S 74922 | 1 |S 74922 (S 1,469.20| 1 |$ 1,469.20
1983 $ 1,100.27| 1 |$ 1,100.27 [ NOBID 1 [NOBID $1,469.20| 1 |S$S 1,469.20
1984 S 92196 | 1 [S 92196 |S 65031 1 [S 65031 (S 1,256.10| 1 |$ 1,256.10
1985 S 92196 | 1 |$ 921.96 [ NOBID 1 [NOBID S 823.72| 1 |$ 823.72
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY TI-SALES
1986 $ 1,203.79| 1 [S 1,203.79 787.05| 1 |$ 787.05|$1,52895| 1 |[S 1,528.95
1987 $ 1,203.79| 1 |$ 1,203.79 787.05| 1 |$ 787.05(S 99694 | 1 |$S 996.94
GROUP F TOTAL S 20,264.56 INCOMPLETE S 22,814.16
GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING

Title: VALVES

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE EJ PRESCOTT BLAIR SUPPLY
GROUP A: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON

TAPPING SLEEVES UP TO 12" L.D. UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
0931 S 71150 1 [S 711501 S 62410 | 1 [S 624.10 NO BID 1 NO BID
0932 S 57240 1 |$ 572401 S 74260 | 1 |S 742.60 NO BID 1 NO BID
0933 S 57240 | 1 [S 572401 S 74260 | 1 [S 742.60 NO BID 1 NO BID
0934 S 707.00 1 |$ 707.00 | $ 912.01( 1 (S 912.01 NO BID 1 NO BID
0935 S 707.00| 1 [S 707.00 | S 912.01| 1 |$ 912.01 NO BID 1 NO BID
0936 S 75890 1 |$ 75890 | S 986.62 | 1 [S 986.62 NO BID 1 NO BID
0937 $ 1,391.00( 1 |$ 1,391.00(S 1,803.83| 1 |$ 1,803.83 NO BID 1 NO BID
0938 S 1,47960| 1 |S 1,47960| S 1916.18( 1 [S 1,916.18 NO BID 1 NO BID
0939 S 1,391.00( 2 |$ 2,782.00| S 1,803.83( 2 |S 3,607.66 NO BID 2 NO BID
0940 S 1,47960| 1 |S 1,47960| S 1916.18( 1 [S 1,916.18 NO BID 1 NO BID
0941 S 1,763.25| 1 |$ 1,763.25( S 2,27871 | 1 |$S 2,278.71 NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP A TOTAL S 12,924.65| S 16,442.50 NO BID
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE EJ PRESCOTT BLAIR SUPPLY
GROUP B: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON

TAPPING SLEEVES, 16" I. D. AND LARGER UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
0943 S 549550 1 [$ 549550(S 4,94550| 1 |S$S 4,945.50 NO BID 1 NO BID
0944 S 555385 1 |$ 5553.85|S 4,99860( 1 |$ 4,998.60 NO BID 1 NO BID
0945 S 6,652.00( 1 [$ 6652.00(S 6,298.20| 1 |S$S 6,298.20 NO BID 1 NO BID
0946 S 6,793.10( 1 |$ 6,793.10| S 6,113.70( 1 |$ 6,113.70 NO BID 1 NO BID
0947 S 8596.25| 1 |$ 8,596.25(S 7,736.40| 1 |$S 7,736.40 NO BID 1 NO BID
0948 S 8596.25( 1 |S$ 8596.25|S 7,736.40( 1 |$ 7,736.40 NO BID 1 NO BID
0949 S 18,870.20| 1 |$18,870.20| S 18,727.20 | 1 |$18,727.20 NO BID 1 NO BID
0950 $ 19,710.80 | 1 |$19,710.80| S 18,838.80| 1 S 18,838.80 NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP B TOTAL S 80,267.95| S 75,394.80 NO BID

GROUP C: RESILIENT-SEAT TAPPING VALVES UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
0951 S 44546 | 1 |S 44546| S 69940 | 1 (S 699.40|S 540.00| 1 (S 540.00
1491 S 617.31| 6 [S 3,703.86 S 955.06( 6 |S 5730.36|S 750.00( 6 |S 4,500.00
1494 S 91571 | 3 |$ 2,747.13 (S 1,486.33( 3 |S 4,45899 | $ 1,115.00( 3 |$ 3,345.00
0954 S 1,370.85( 1 |$ 1,37085(S 2,132.00| 1 |$ 2,132.00| $ 1,680.00| 1 |S$ 1,680.00
1497 $ 2,09532( 1 |$ 2,09532(S 2,691.00( 1 |$ 2,691.00|$ 2,53800( 1 |$ 2,538.00
GROUP C TOTAL S 10,362.62| $ 15,711.75| $ 12,603.00
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE EJ PRESCOTT BLAIR SUPPLY
GROUP D: CAST IRON OR DUCTILE IRON

TAPPING SLEEVE END GLANDS UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL
2170 S 7550 1 |S 7550 | S 89.24| 1 |S 89.24 | NO BID 1 | NOBID
2171 S 2035 1 |S$ 2035 | $ 112.20| 1 |$ 112.20 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2172 S 36.70| 1 |S 36.70 | S 11220 1 S 112.20 [ NOBID 1 | NOBID
2173 S 61.15| 1 |$ 61.15 | $ 31874 | 1 |$ 318.74 |NOBID 1 [NOBID
2174 S 7035 1 |S$ 7035 | S 45900 1 |S 459.00 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2175 S 42455 | 1 |S 42455 (S 57290 1 [S 572.90 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2176 S 1,397.05( 1 [$ 1,397.05| $ 71400 1 |S 714.00 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2177 $ 1,73830| 1 |$ 1,73830]| $ 85850 1 [S 858.50 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2178 NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 [NOBID
GROUP D TOTAL INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
GROUP E: TAPPING SLEEVE GASKETS, ENDS

AND SIDE FOR DUCTILE IRON OR CAST IRON UNIT Qry TOTAL UNIT Qry TOTAL UNIT Qry TOTAL
TAPPING SLEEVES

2180 S 5050 1 |$ 50.50 | S 4420 1 |S 44.20 | NO BID 1 [NOBID
2181 S 65.75| 1 |S$ 65.75 | S 51.84| 1 |S$ 51.84 | NO BID 1 |NOBID
2182 S 8870 1 |$ 88.70 | S 57.80| 1 |$ 57.80 | NO BID 1 [NOBID
2183 S 14985 1 S 14985 (S 5480 1 |$ 54.80 | NO BID 1 |NOBID
2184 S 172.80| 1 |$ 17280 | S 67.14| 1 |$ 67.14 | NO BID 1 | NOBID
2185 S 31150 1 |[$ 31150 S 7143 1 |S 71.43 | NOBID 1 [NOBID
2186 S 363.15 1 [S 363.15|S 89.04| 1 |S$ 89.04 [ NOBID 1 [NOBID
2187 S 45420 1 |S 45420 | S 12070 1 [$S 120.70 [ NOBID 1 [NOBID
2188 NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 [NOBID
GROUP E TOTAL INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280

TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING
Title: VALVES

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE EJ PRESCOTT BLAIR SUPPLY
GROUP F: STAINLESS STEL TAPPING SLEEVES UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
1988 S 39590 1 |[$ 39590 $ 38133 1 |$ 38133 |S$S 39600 1 [S 396.00
1989 S 39590 1 |$ 39590 S 38133 1 |$ 38133 |$S 39.00| 1 [S 396.00
1992 S 42950 1 |S 42950 | S 39483 | 1 |S 39483 |S 40600 1 [S 406.00
1993 S 42950 | 1 |$S 42950 ( S 39483 | 1 S 39483 |S 40600| 1 |S 406.00
1994 S 46850 1 |S 46850 | S 43912 1 |S 43912 |S 439.00( 1 |S 439.00
1995 S 46850 | 1 |S 46850 ( S 43912 | 1 |S 43912 (S 439.00| 1 |$ 439.00
1998 S 49690 1 |S 49690 | $ 46571 1 |S 46571 |S 48500 1 |S 485.00
1999 S 49690 | 1 |S 496.90 | S 465.71| 1 |S 46571 (S 485.00| 1 |$ 485.00
2000 S 61836 1 |S 61836 | S 590.51| 1 |[S$ 59051 (S 650.00| 1 |S 650.00
2001 S 61836 1 [S 61836 | S 59051 1 [S$ 59051 |$ 650.00| 1 |[S$ 650.00
2002 S 530.85| 1 |S 53085 (S 558.15| 1 |$ 55815 (S 512.00| 1 |$S 512.00
2003 S 53085 1 [S 53085 | S 558.15 1 [$ 558.15|$ 51200| 1 |$ 512.00
2004 S 64590 1 |S 64590 | $ 67486 | 1 |S 67486 |S 70000 1 [S 700.00
1973 S 64590 | 1 |$S 64590 | $ 67486 | 1 |S 67486 |S 70000 1 [S 700.00
1976 S 70850 1 |$ 708.50 | $ 87938 1 [S 87938 |S 619.00| 1 |$ 619.00
1977 S 70850 1 |$ 70850 | $ 87938 1 [S 87938 |S 619.00| 1 |$ 619.00
1978 S 772.85| 1 |S 77285 (S 1,047.42( 1 |S 1,047.42|S 789.00( 1 |S 789.00
1979 S 77285 1 [S 77285 |S$S 1,047.42| 1 |S 1,04742(S 789.00| 1 |$ 789.00
1980 S 81330 1 |$ 81330(S 1,01825( 1 |$ 1,01825|S 670.00| 1 |S 670.00
1981 S 81330 1 [S 81330 |S$ 1,01825| 1 |$ 1,01825( S 1,300.00| 1 |$ 1,300.00
1982 S 969.00 | 1 |S 969.00 (S 1,244.41( 1 |S 1,24441|S 850.00| 1 |S 850.00
1983 S 969.00 [ 1 [S 969.00 | S 1,24441| 1 |S 1,24441( S 1,300.00| 1 |$ 1,300.00
1984 S 87740 | 1 |S 87740(S 1,063.90( 1 |$ 1,06390|S 730.00( 1 |S 730.00
1985 S 87740 1 [S 87740 |S$ 1,06390| 1 |S$ 1,06390(S 730.00| 1 |$ 730.00
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TAPPING SLEEVES & TAPPING

Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121280
Title: VALVES

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE EJ PRESCOTT BLAIR SUPPLY
1986 $ 105130 1 |$ 1,051.30|S 1,29500| 1 |$ 1,295.00|S 88500 1 (S 885.00
1987 $ 105130 1 |$ 1,051.30|S 1,295.00| 1 |$ 1,295.00|S 88500 1 (S 885.00
GROUP F TOTAL S 17,556.52| S 20,105.74| S 17,342.00
GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
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