<>

City of Rochester

L

w

®  Department of Finance

City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street

Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

ROCHE

Bureau of
Purchasing

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they do
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121300
Title: PLASTIC WATER MAIN PIPE FITTINGS & SERVICE TUBING

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description BLAIR SUPPLY MJ PIPE VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY
GROUP A: PVC PRESSURE CLASS 305 PSI,
DR-14 AWWA C900 WATER MAIN PIPE UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
1833 S 32840 |$S 131.20(S 36840 |S 147.20 NO BID 40 NO BID S 371 40 |S 148.40
1834 S 6.30|200|S 1,260.00 (S 7.231200|S 1,446.00 NO BID 200 NO BID S 7.10 (200(S 1,420.00
1835 S 10.44 |600(S 6,264.00 | S 12.43 | 600 (S 7,458.00 NO BID 600 NO BID S 11.78 | 600 | S 7,068.00
1836 S 25.25 | 80 |$ 2,020.00 (S 26.74 |1 80 | S 2,139.20 NO BID 80 NO BID S 28.49 |1 80 |S 2,279.20
GROUP A TOTAL S 9,675.20| $ 11,190.40 NO BID S 10,915.60
GROUP B: PVCO PRESSURE CLASS 235 PSI,
AWWA C909 WATER MAIN PIPE UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTyY TOTAL
1837 NO BID 100 NO BID S 2.37(100|$ 237.00 NO BID 100 NO BID NO BID 100 NO BID
1838 S 4.891200|S 978.00 |S 4701200|S 940.00 NO BID 200 NO BID S 5.51 (200(S 1,102.00
1839 S 8.15|200|S 1,630.00|S 8.141200|$ 1,628.00 NO BID 200 NO BID S 9.19 (200(S$ 1,838.00
1840 S 18.22 |100|S$ 1,822.00 (S 17.27 [100|S$ 1,727.00 NO BID 100 NO BID S 20.55 |100|$ 2,055.00
GROUP B TOTAL INCOMPLETE S 4,532.00 NO BID INCOMPLETE
GROUP C: SDR-9, 200 PSI, CTS
POLYETHYLENE (PE) WATER SERVICE UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
TUBING
1844 S 0.40|700|S 280.00 | S 0.28|700|S 196.00 | S 0.84|700|S 588.00 | S 0.32|700|S 224.00
1845 S 0.90(100|$ 90.00 | S 0.38 (100 | $ 38.00 | S 1.29|100|S 129.00 | S 0.43 |100( S 43.00
1846 S 1.36|100(S 136.00 |$ 1.00|/100(S 100.00 | $ 3.09[/100(S 309.00 | S 1.10 |100|$ 110.00
GROUP C TOTAL S 506.00 | S 334.00| S 1,026.00| S 377.00

121300_PLASTIC WATER MAIN PIPE FITTINGS SERVICE TUBING




<>

City of Rochester

w

®  Department of Finance

City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street

Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they do

ROCH

oneci ty

{1ESTER

not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.
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Bid Date: 2/27/2013
Number: 121300
Title: PLASTIC WATER MAIN PIPE FITTINGS & SERVICE TUBING

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description BLAIR SUPPLY MJ PIPE VELLANO BROS HD SUPPLY
GROUP D: PVC INJECTION MOLDED
FITTINGS UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
1847 S 76,00 1 |$ 76.00 | S 3435 1 |$ 34.35 NO BID 1 NO BID S 5753| 1 |S 57.53
1848 S 102.00 1 |S 102.00 | $ 61.18 1 1S 61.18 NO BID 1 NO BID S 7721 1 |S 77.21
1849 S 147.00 2 |S 294.00 | S 11827 | 2 |S 236.54 NO BID 2 NO BID S 11127 2 |S 222.54
1850 S 7100 | 2 |S 142.00 | $ 34.35 2 |S 68.70 NO BID 2 NO BID S 53.74| 2 |S 107.48
1851 S 95.00 | 4 |$ 380.00|S 5960 | 4 |S 238.40 NO BID 4 NO BID S 7191 4 |S 287.64
1852 $ 130.00 | 10 |$ 1,300.00|S 11348 10 |$ 1,134.80 NO BID 10 NO BID S 98.40 | 10 |S 984.00
1853 S 95.00 | 1 |S$ 95.00 | $ 3572 1 |S$ 35.72 NO BID 1 NO BID S 7191| 1 |S 71.91
1854 S 95.00 | 4 |S 380.00|S 5960 | 4 |S 238.40 NO BID 4 NO BID S 7191 | 4 |S 287.64
1855 S 13000 4 |[$ 520.00|S 11348 4 |S 453.92 NO BID 4 NO BID S 98.40| 4 |S 393.60
1856 S 95.00 1 (s 95.00 | $ 35.72 1S 35.72 NO BID 1 NO BID S 7191 1 |S 71.91
1857 S 95.00 | 2 |$ 190.00 | S 59.60 [ 2 |$ 119.20 NO BID 2 NO BID S 7191 | 2 |S 143.82
1858 $ 13000 2 |$ 26000 (S 11348 2 |$S 226.96 NO BID 2 NO BID S 98.40 | 2 |$ 196.80
1859 S 10400 1 |$S 104.00|S 4735 | 1 |S$ 47.35 NO BID 1 NO BID S 7872 1 |S 78.72
1860 S 13400 1 |$ 13400(|S 103.00| 1 |$ 103.00 NO BID 1 NO BID S 10143 1 |$ 101.43
1861 S 14600| 6 |[S 876.00|S 10585| 6 [S 635.10 NO BID 6 NO BID S 11051 6 [S 663.06
1862 S 182.00 2 |S 364.00 | S 17875 | 2 |S 357.50 NO BID 2 NO BID S 13776 2 |S 275.52
1863 $ 196.00 (10 |$ 1,960.00|S 183.10 10 |$ 1,831.00 NO BID 10 NO BID S 14836 10 [$ 1,483.60
1864 S 204.00 (10 |$ 2,040.00|S 187.25( 10 |$ 1,872.50 NO BID 10 NO BID S 154.41| 10 |$ 1,544.10
1865 S 56.00 [ 1 |$ 56.00 | S 1850 | 1 (S 18.50 NO BID 1 NO BID S 4239 1 |S 42.39
1866 S 75.00 2 |$ 150.00 |S 2835 2 |S 56.70 NO BID 2 NO BID S 5677 2 |$ 11354
1867 S 96.00 | 2 |S 192.00|S 6785 | 2 |S 135.70 NO BID 2 NO BID S 7267 | 2 |S 14534
1868 S 56.00 | 1 |S 56.00 | $ 2125 | 1 |S$ 21.25 NO BID 1 NO BID S 4239 1 (S 42.39
1869 S 75.00 | 4 |S 300.00 | $ 3265 | 4 |S 130.60 NO BID 4 NO BID S 56.77 | 4 |S$ 227.08
1870 S 103.00| 4 |S 412.00(S 7870 | 4 |S 314.80 NO BID 4 NO BID S 7796 4 |S 31184
1871 S 18.00 | 1 (S 18.00 | S 1845 | 1 |S 18.45 NO BID 1 NO BID S 13.72| 1 S 13.72
1872 S 29.00 [ 1 |S 29.00 | S 3325 1 |$ 33.25 NO BID 1 NO BID S 2195| 1 |S 21.95
1873 S 4100 1 |S 41.00 (S 5650 [ 1 |$ 56.50 NO BID 1 NO BID S 31.03| 1 |S 31.03
1874 S 82.00 1 1S 82.00 | S 56.75 1 1S 56.75 NO BID 1 NO BID S 62.07 ] 1 |S 62.07
1875 S 131.00| 1 |S 131.00 | $ 96.45 1S 96.45 NO BID 1 NO BID S 99.16 | 1 |S$ 99.16
GROUP D TOTAL S 10,779.00( S 8,669.29 NO BID S 8,159.02
GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE INCOMPLETE S 24,725.69 INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
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