
121340_AUTOMOTIVE WHEELS ACCESSORIES

Bid Date: 3/12/2013
Number: 121340
Title: AUTOMOTIVE WHEELS & ACCESSORIES

 UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL 
 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 99.95$        2  $       199.90 
 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 105.00$      2  $       210.00 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $       409.90 
 UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL 

 NO BID 4  NO BID  INFORMAL 4  INFORMAL 87.75$        4  $       351.00 
 NO BID 4  NO BID  INFORMAL 4  INFORMAL 248.95$      4  $       995.80 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $    1,346.80 
 UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL 

 NO BID 10  NO BID  INFORMAL 10  INFORMAL 45.00$        10  $       450.00 
 NO BID 10  NO BID  INFORMAL 10  INFORMAL 60.00$        10  $       600.00 
 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 60.00$        2  $       120.00 

 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 71.74$        2  $       143.48 

 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 60.00$        2  $       120.00 

 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 58.50$        2  $       117.00 
 NO BID 2  NO BID  INFORMAL 2  INFORMAL 87.95$        2  $       175.90 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $    1,726.38 

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description JOHNSTONE SUPPLY KEYSTONE AUTOMOTIVE FREY HEAVY DUTY

G. 200-2003 FORD 1/2 T (F150) 15" X 7"
TOTAL GROUP III

B. 2010-2013 CHEVY IMPALA 17" X 7 1/2"
C. 2003-2006 FORD TAURUS 16"
D. 1999-2005 FORD DUAL HUB TYPE 
MOUNTING 16" X 6"

E. 200-2006 GMC/CHEVY 3/4 T&T DUALS 16" 
X 6"

F. 200-2006 FORD 3/4 T&1T 16" X 6"

GROUP I - TRUCK TUBELESS RIMS
A. 22.5 X 8.25 FIRESTONE
B. 24.5 X 8.25 TBLS
TOTAL GROUP I
GROUP II - WHEELS
A. 22.5 X 8.25 UNIMOUNT 10 HOLE
B. 22.5 X 9.99 10 HOLE
TOTAL GROUP II
GROUP III - WHEELS
A. 2002-2009 CHEVY IMPALA 16" X 6 1/2"
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121340_AUTOMOTIVE WHEELS ACCESSORIES

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description JOHNSTONE SUPPLY KEYSTONE AUTOMOTIVE FREY HEAVY DUTY

 UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL 
 NO BID 100  NO BID  INFORMAL 100  INFORMAL 0.30$           100  $          30.00 
 NO BID 12  NO BID  INFORMAL 12  INFORMAL 4.00$           12  $          48.00 
 NO BID 100  NO BID  INFORMAL 100  INFORMAL 0.53$           100  $          53.00 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $       131.00 

 UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL  UNIT QTY  TOTAL 

 NO BID 5  NO BID  INFORMAL 5  INFORMAL 30.00$        5  $       150.00 
 NO BID 5  NO BID  INFORMAL 5  INFORMAL 27.75$        5  $       138.75 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $       288.75 

NO BID  INFORMAL 65.00%GROUP V

PART 2 - DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE
GROUP I
GROUP II
GROUP III
GROUP IV

NO BID  INFORMAL 65.00%
NO BID  INFORMAL 65.00%

NO BID  INFORMAL 65.00%
NO BID  INFORMAL 65.00%

A. SB4022K (ACCURIDE)
B. SB4020K (ACCURIDE)

GROUP IV
NUTS - A. E4963 (EUCLID)
WEDGES & CLAMPS - B. RG 138
STUDS - C. E4956A (EUCLID)
TOTAL GROUP IV
GROUP V - SPACERS (CHANNEL ONLY - 
STANDARD TYPE

TOTAL GROUP V

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                          409.90 

TOTAL BID PRICE

TOTAL GROUP IV
TOTAL GROUP V

SUMMARY
TOTAL GROUP I
TOTAL GROUP II
TOTAL GROUP III

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                      1,346.80 
 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                      1,726.38 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                      3,902.83 

 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                          131.00 
 NO BID  INFORMAL  $                                          288.75 
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