VA

# Department of Finance

City of Rochester

City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281

www.cityofrochester.gov

Bid Date: 3/11/2013
Number: 121460
Title:

HORTICULTURAL SUPPLIES

one cfty

ROCHESTER

Bureau of
Purchasing

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

NORTHERN NURSERIES OF NY

HELENA CHEMICAL CO

THE GARDEN FACTORY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

GROUP 1: FERTILIZERS/ PESTICIDES/

ADDITIVES UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
1. GRANULAR (5-10-5, 8-16-8, OR 7-7-
7) S 21.00(25|S$ 525.00 NO BID 25 NO BID INFORMAL | 25 | INFORMAL 14.65| 25 | S 366.25
2. GRANULAR WITH ZERO S 30.00(50|S 1,500.00f NOBID 50 NO BID NO BID 50 NO BID 14.65| 50 | S 732.50
PHOSPHOROUS ' AR ' '
3. FERTILIZER: SOLUBLE FOR TANK
MIXING NO BID 25 NO BID S 2435(25|S 608.75 NO BID 25 NO BID 27.89| 25 | S 697.25
4. FERTILIZER POLY COATED SLOW
NO BID 5 NO BID S 48.00( 5 | $ 240.00 NO BID 5 NO BID 1288 5 | S 6440

RELEASE
5. GRANULAR W/ ZERO $ 30.00(15|S 450.00(S 1890| 15| S 283.50 NO BID 15 NO BID 16.88| 15 | S 253.20
PHOSPHOROUS 14-0-14 ' ' ' ' ' '
6. ORGANIC FERTILIZER W/

S 3265[10|S 32650(S 29.90| 10 | S 299.00 NO BID 10 NO BID 22.40| 10 | $ 224.00
MICROBES
7. ORGANIC FERTILIZER W/ NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID 36.00 10 | S 360.00
MICROBES, ZERO PHOSPHOROUS ) ’
8. BROADLEAF WEED KILLER S 14.00| 5 |S 70.00( S 1400| 5 | $ 70.00| INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL 3262 5 | $ 163.10
9. PRE-EMERGENT, GRANULAR S 13.00( 5 | S 65.00| S 53.55( 5 | $ 267.75| INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL 11.70( 5 | S 5850
10. NON-SELECTIVE HERBICIDE, 41%

S 69.00({10|S$S 690.00] S 14.60( 10 | S 146.00| INFORMAL| 10 | INFORMAL 39.55| 10 | $ 395.50

CONCENTRATION
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

NORTHERN NURSERIES OF NY

HELENA CHEMICAL CO

THE GARDEN FACTORY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

11. INSECTICIDE, GRANULAR,

IMIDACLORPRID NOBID | 75 NO BID NOBID | 75| NOBID | INFORMAL| 75 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 75 NO BID
12. INSECTICIDAL SOAP NOBID | 2 NOBID |$ 6370| 2 |$ 127.40 2 NO BID 2 NO BID
13. DORMANT/HORTICULTURALOIL | NOBID | 2 NOBID |$ 2470| 2 | $ 49.40| INFORMAL| 2 | INFORMAL| NOBID 2 NO BID
14. PRODUECE - HERBICIDE NOBID | 5 NOBID |$ 3050| 5 |$ 152.50| INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL| NOBID 5 NO BID
15. BENEFICIAL NEMATODES 30
NOBID | 5 NOBID |$ 3780 5 |$ 189.00 5158 -| NOBID 5 NO BID

MILLION
GROUP 1 TOTAL Aty N/A e e e N/A et INFORMAL |- N/A
GROUP 2: GRASS SEED/SOIL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL
AMENDMENTS
16. BARK MULCH, PINE, 1/4" TO
1/2" $ 5.90 | 30 177.00 NOBID | 30| NOBID | INFORMAL| 30 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 30 NO BID
17. BARK MULCH, PINE, 1/2"TO1" | $ 5.90 | 30 177.00 NOBID | 30| NOBID | INFORMAL| 30 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 30 NO BID
18. PINE BARK MULCH, SHREDDED | $ 5.90 | 30 177.00| NOBID |30 | NOBID | INFORMAL| 30 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 30 NO BID
19. CEDAR, SHREDDED $ 5.90 | 30 177.00| NOBID | 30| NOBID | INFORMAL| 30 | INFORMAL| $ 345|130 | $ 103.50
20. POTTING SOIL, PROMIX OR
EQUAL $ 2650/ 25 662.50| NOBID | 25| NOBID | INFORMAL| 25 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 25 NO BID
21. ROLL OF BURLAP $ 89.00| 2 178.00| NOBID | 2 NOBID | INFORMAL| 2 | INFORMAL| $ 12.88| 2 |$ 25.76
22. LANDSCAPE FABRIC $ 67.00] 2 134.00 NoBID | 2 NOBID | INFORMAL| 2 | INFORMAL| NOBID 2 NO BID
23. POLYPROPYLENE GROUND

$ 220.00]| 2 440.00| NOBID | 2 NOBID | INFORMAL| 2 | INFORMAL| NO BID 2 NO BID

COVER
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

NORTHERN NURSERIES OF NY

HELENA CHEMICAL CO

THE GARDEN FACTORY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

24. ANNUAL RYE GRASS $ 3200| 5 |$ 16000|$ 5250 5 |$ 262.50| INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL| S 28.00| 5 |[$ 140.00
25. ATHLETIC PRO MIXTURE $ 72.00|20|$ 1,44000|$ 90.00| 20 | $ 1,800.00| INFORMAL| 20 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 20 NO BID
26. SHADY TURF MIXTURE $ 67.00] 5 |$ 33500|$ 56.25| 5 |$ 281.25| INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL| NO BID 5 NO BID
27. GENERAL TURF MIX $ 66.00]20|S$ 1,32000|$ 222.50| 20 | $ 4,450.00| INFORMAL| 20 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 20 NO BID
28. TRIPLE PERENNIAL RYEGRASS

MIX $ 64.00|20|$ 1,280.00| $ 64.00| 20 | $ 1,280.00| INFORMAL| 20 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 20 NO BID
29. HYDROSEED/HYDROLIZER 16-32-

15 $ 21.00/50|$ 1,05000| $ 19.95|50 | $ 997.50| INFORMAL| 50 | INFORMAL| $ 34.00| 50 | $ 1,700.00
30. HYDROSEED/HYDROLIZER ZERO $ 23.00/50|$ 1,150.00| $ 18.90| 50 | $ 945.00| INFORMAL| 50 | INFORMAL| $ 27.89| 50 | $ 1,394.50
PHOSPHOROUS ' S ‘ ' ' oo
31. BULKMULCH - DOUBLE $ 23.00/20|$ 460.00] NOBID |20 NOBID | INFORMAL| 20 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 20 NO BID
SHREDDED HARDWOOD, PICK-UP : :

32. BULKMULCH - DOUBLE $ 28.00|20|% 560.00f NOBID |20 NOBID | INFORMAL| 20 | INFORMAL| NOBID | 20 NO BID
SHREDDED HARDWOOD,DELIVERY : :

33. TACKIFIER GRANULAR $ 11000| 5 |$ 55000/ NOBID | 5 NOBID | INFORMAL| 5 | INFORMAL| $ 36.00( 5 |$ 180.00
GROUP 2 TOTAL ] S 10,427.50 [ vt N/A st INFORMAL b e N/A
ROUP 3: SHRUBS/PERENNIAL

GROUP 3: SHRUBS/ S 15.00% NO BID INFORMAL NO BID

DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG PRICE
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