
121540_TRANSIT-MIX CONCRETE

Bid Date: 3/27/2013
Number: 121540
Title: TRANSIT-MIX CONCRETE

1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD 1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD 1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD
 $            99.00 99.00$              $            89.00 89.00$             101.50$          101.50$          
 $            88.00 88.00$              $            84.50 84.50$             95.00$             95.00$             
 $            88.00 88.00$              $            84.50 84.50$             95.00$             95.00$             
 $            67.00 67.00$              $            61.50 61.50$             70.00$             70.00$             
 $          106.00 106.00$           $            97.50 97.50$             104.50$          104.50$          
 $          125.00 125.00$           NO BID NO BID 124.50$          124.50$          

 $          106.00 106.00$           $            97.00 97.00$             105.50$          105.50$          

 $          106.00 106.00$           $            97.00 97.00$             105.50$          105.50$          
 $          112.00 112.00$           $          101.00 101.00$          108.00$          108.00$          
 $          105.00 99.00$              $          100.00 100.00$          108.00$          108.00$          

 $            89.00 79.00$              $            77.50 75.50$             84.50$             84.50$             
 $          122.00 107.00$           $          107.00 102.00$          118.00$          118.00$          
 $          139.00 125.00$           NO BID NO BID 143.00$          143.00$          

 $          112.00 106.00$           $          102.00 102.00$          121.00$          121.00$          

BIDDERS

GROUP 10: EXPOSED AGGREGATE CA1/CA1A 
CONCRETE (DELIVERED)

GROUP 9: STATE CLASS D (DELIVERED)
GROUP 9: STATE CLASS DP (DELIVERED)

GROUP 5: EXPOSED AGGREGATE CA1 CONCRETE  
(PLANT)
GROUP 6: PERVIOUS CONCRETE  (PLANT)
GROUP 7: CITY - CLASS K (DELIVERED)

GROUP 8: CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL (DELIVERED)

GROUP 1: CITY - CLASS K (PLANT)
GROUP 1: CITY - CLASS L  (PLANT)
GROUP 2: CITY - CLASS L DRY  (PLANT)
GROUP 3: CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL  (PLANT)
GROUP 4: STATE CLASS D  (PLANT)
GROUP 4: STATE CLASS DP  (PLANT)

GROUP 5: EXPOSED AGGREGATE CA1/CA1A 
CONCRETE  (PLANT)

MANITOU CONCRETE FULMONT READY MIX HANSON AGGREGATES
Bidder/Item Description

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 



121540_TRANSIT-MIX CONCRETE

1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD 1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD 1-6 CU YD 7+ CU YD

BIDDERS
MANITOU CONCRETE FULMONT READY MIX HANSON AGGREGATES

Bidder/Item Description

 $          112.00 106.00$           $          101.00 101.00$          121.00$          121.00$          
 $          112.00 112.00$           $          109.00 109.00$          123.00$          123.00$          

ACCELERATOR D: 4%

ACCELERATOR B: 1%
ACCELERATOR C: 2%

GROUP 11: EXPOSED AGGREGATE - CA1 CONCRETE 
(DELIVERED)
GROUP 12: PERVIOUS CONCRETE (DELIVERED)
ADDITIONAL WINTER HEAT CHARGE (PER CU YD)
ACCELERATOR A: 0.5%

 $                                         11.00  $                                         10.00  $                                         10.00 
 $                                           3.00  $                                           2.00  $                                           4.00 
 $                                           5.00  $                                           4.00  $                                           5.00 
 $                                         10.00  $                                           8.00  $                                         10.00 
 $                                         20.00  $                                         16.00  $                                         20.00 

TRUCK WASHOUT CHARGE BETWEEN LOADS AT 
PLANT  $                                         45.00  $                                         50.00  $                                         50.00 

ACCELERATOR, PER 0.5% INCREMENTS  NO BID  $                                           2.25  $                                           2.50 
ADDITIONAL CEMENT, PER LB  NO BID  $                                           0.06  NO BID 
SYNTHETIC FIBER REINFORCEMENT  $                                         11.00  $                                         10.00  $                                         10.00 
DELIVERY TRUCK WASHOUT CHARGE PER LOAD  $                                         45.00  $                                         50.00  $                                         50.00 
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