
121960_STREET TREE PRUNING - 2012-2013

Bid Date: 12/17/2012
Number: 121960
Title: STREET TREE PRUNING - 2012-2013

VENDOR 1 VENDOR 2 VENDOR 3 VENDOR 4
BIRCHCREST TREE COVEY TREE TERRY TREE HIGH FALLS

Y N/A Y Y
$410,000.00 $91,270.00 $600,000.00 $180,000.00
$109,248.00 NO BID $88,807.00 $160,922.82
$57,330.00 NO BID $50,466.00 $49,758.76

$109,120.00 NO BID $104,319.00 $85,501.71
$69,724.00 $91,270.00 $65,715.00 $63,174.66
$96,850.00 NO BID $84,102.00 $77,513.49
$70,656.00 NO BID $74,401.00 $67,335.28
$83,220.00 NO BID $89,400.00 $89,890.15TOTAL BID SECTION F6

TOTAL BID SECTION F5

TOTAL BID SECTION E4
TOTAL BID SECTION E6

TOTAL BID SECTION E1

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

TOTAL BID SECTION B1

BID BOND
MAX AMOUNT

TOTAL BID SECTION B2

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 

not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 
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