{% City of Rochester o,ﬁ;ty pureauof

Department of Finance
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281

www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 2/20/2013
Number: 122000
Title: GRAY-IRON AND DUCTILE-IRON WATER MAIN FITTINGS

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY
GROUP 1: BENDS, 90 DEG MECHANICAL JOINT
BY MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0702 - 6" $ 14145 |10 | S 1,41450|$ 19152 [ 10 | $ 1,91520|$ 131.43| 10 | $ 1,314.30
0703 - 8" $ 18699 | 1 |$ 18699|$ 257.04 | 1 |$ 257.04|S% 17812 1 | S 178.12
0704 - 10" $ 30222 | 1 |$ 30222|S 40824 | 1 |S 40824|S 29384 1 | S  293.84
0705 - 12" $ 40434 | 1 |$ 40434|$ 551.04| 1 |$ 551.04|$ 39855| 1 |$ 39855
0706 - 16" $ 88618 | 1 | S 886.18|S 1,21044 | 1 |$ 1,21044|S 868.16| 1 | $ 868.16
0707 - 24" $ 2,173.08| 1 | $ 2,173.08($ 2,94045| 1 |$ 2,940.45| S 2,213.35| 1 |$ 2,213.35
GROUP 1 TOTAL SRSt ¢ § 367,31 [SEaNEREE § 7,082 .41 (IRl & 5 266.32
GROUP 2: BENDS, 90 DEG MECHANICAL JOINT
BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0709 - 6" $ 11316 | 2 |$ 22632($ 157.08| 2 |$ 31416|$ 110.06| 2 | $ 220.12
0710 - 8" $ 18768 | 1 | S 187.68|S 25788 | 1 |$ 257.88|S 18748 1 |$ 187.48
0711 - 10" $ 30498 | 1 |$ 30498|S 42084 | 1 |S 42084|S$ 307.72| 1 |$ 307.72
0712-12" $ 32292 | 1 |$ 32292|$ 44520 | 1 |$S 44520|S$ 32546 1 | S  325.46
0713 - 16" $ 92405| 1 |$ 92405|S$ 1,27025| 1 |$ 1,27025|$ 94711 1 | $ 94711
0714 - 24" $ 2,169.84 | 1 | S 2,169.84|$ 2,84232| 1 |$ 2,84232($ 2,09452| 1 | S 2,094.52
GROUP 2 TOTAL IHBeREREEEE ¢ 413579 [PEEBSBEEEEY ¢ 555065 [rrronaaned ¢ 408241
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY
GROUP 3: BENDS, 45 DEG MECHANICAL JOINT

BY MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0716 - 6" $ 12627 | 2 |$ 252548 17052 | 2 |$ 341.04|$ 11557 2 | $ 231.14
0717 - 8" $ 16146 | 2 | S 32292|$ 22008 | 2 |$ 440.16|S$ 15148 2 | S 302.96
0718 - 10" $ 22908 | 1 |$S 229.08($ 31332 | 1 |$ 31332($ 21741| 1 |$ 217.41
0719 - 12" $ 39948 | 1 | S 399.48($ 46032 | 1 |$ 46032(S$ 33077| 1 |$ 33077
0720 - 16" $ 699.94| 1 |$S 69994(S 96214 | 1 | S 962.14(S 69438| 1 | S 694.38
0721 - 24" $ 1,535.52| 1 |$ 1,535.52($ 2,080.02| 1 |$ 2,080.02|S 1,547.09| 1 |$ 1,547.09
GROUP 3 TOTAL Gl § 343048 [EiREi $ 4,597.00 |.-.c.c. S 3,323.75
GROUP 4: BENDS, 45 DEG MECHANICAL JOINT

BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0723 -6" $ 10074 | 1 |$ 100.74|$ 13860 | 1 |$ 13860(S 97.08| 1 |S 97.08
0724 - 8" $ 13248 | 1 |$ 13248(S$ 18480 | 1 | S 18480(S$ 12980| 1 | S 129.80
0725 - 10" $ 23667 | 1 |S 236.67|S 32424 | 1 |S 324245 23634 1 |S 23634
0726 - 12" $ 29946 | 1 | S 299.46(S 41244 | 1 |S 412445 39500 1 |$  395.00
0727 - 16" $ 59216 | 1 |$ 592.16(S$ 83597 | 1 |$ 83597(S$ 60028| 1 |$ 60028
0728 - 24" $ 1,42464| 1 | S 1,42464|$ 195432 1 |$ 1,95432|$ 1,45999| 1 |$ 1,459.99
GROUP 4 TOTAL et & 2.786.15 [ $ 3,850.37 |.-.cl|$ 2,918.49
GROUP 5: BENDS, 22-1/2 DEG MECHANICAL

JOINT BY MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0729 - 4" $ 86.94| 1 |$ 86.94|$ 11592 | 1 [$ 11592|$ 7860 1 [ 78.60
0730- 6" $ 12006 | 1 |$ 12006(S 16128 1 |$ 16128 S 109.07| 1 | $  109.07
0731-8" $ 15939 | 1 |$ 159.39|$ 21756 | 1 |$ 21756(S$ 169.11| 1 | S  169.11
0732 -10" $ 22494 | 1 |S 22494($ 30408 | 1 |S 30408(S$ 213.08| 1 |$ 213.08
0733 -12" $ 30153 | 1 |$ 30153($ 40656 | 1 |$ 406566 291.12| 1 | S  291.12
0734 - 16" $ 67717 | 1 |S 677.17|S 92602 | 1 |$ 926.02|S$ 67059| 1 |$ 670.59
0735 - 24" $ 148998 | 1 |$ 1,489.98|$ 2,05295| 1 |[$ 205295 S 1,49951| 1 |$ 1,499.51
GROUP 5 TOTAL B et S 3,060.01 [ty $ 4,184.37 [HENENEEEEE] S 3,031.08
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY

GROUP 6: BENDS, 22-1/2 DEG MECHANICAL

JOINT BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0736 - 4" S 7107 1 | 71.07($ 9576 | 1 |$ 95.76| $ 6762| 1 | 67.62
0737 -6" $ 96.60| 1 [ 96.60($ 13104 | 1 |$ 131.04| S 9276 | 1 |$ 92.76
0738-8" $ 16560 | 1 |[$ 165.60|$ 22680 | 1 | S 226.80|S 16441| 1 |$ 164.41
0739 - 10" $§ 20355| 1 [$ 20355|$ 27804 | 1 |S 27804|$ 201.73| 1 |$ 20173
0740 - 12" $ 23529 | 1 [$ 23529|$ 32256 | 1 |$S 322565 23388| 1 |$ 233.88
0741 - 16" $ 79226 | 1 |$ 792.26|S$ 1,06865| 1 | S 1,06865|S 809.39| 1 |$  809.39
0742 - 24" $ 1,44120| 1 S 1,441.20|$ 1,920.07 | 1 |$ 1,92007| S 1,477.29| 1 | $ 1,477.29
GROUP 6 TOTAL ol § 0 3005.57 [ $ 4,042.92 |- - S 3,047.08
GROUP 7: BENDS, 11-1/4 DEG MECHANICAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
JOINT BY MECHANICAL JOINT

0743 - 4" $ 8280 1 |$ 82.80($ 10920 | 1 |[$ 109.20] $ 7322 1 |$ 73.22
0744 - 6" $ 12213 | 1 |$  122.13|$ 16212 | 1 |S  162.12(S$ 11124 1 | S 111.24
0745 - 8" $ 15111 | 1 [$ 151.11|$ 20496 | 1 | S 20496 14062 | 1 |$ 14062
0746 - 10" $ 23046 | 1 |$ 23046|$ 30744 | 1 |S 307.44|S 21885| 1 |$ 21885
0747 - 12" $ 29049 | 1 [$ 290.49|S 39144 | 1 |S 391.44(S$ 27958| 1 |$ 27958
0748 - 16" $ 67717 | 1 |$ 677.17|$ 91426 | 1 | S 91426|S$ 67059| 1 |$  670.59
0749 - 24" $ 1,394.76 | 1 |$ 1,394.76|S 1,906.27 | 1 |$ 1,906.27| $ 1,400.00| 1 |$ 1,400.00
GROUP 7 TOTAL Ty $ 2,948,092 [wiiouimii $ 3,995.69 |-.c.c.ci $ 2,894.10
GROUP 8: BENDS, 11-1/4 DEG MECHANICAL

JOINT BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0750 - 4" $ 7107 1 |$ 71.07($ 9576 | 1 |$ 95.76| $ 6762| 1 |$S 67.62
0751-6" $ 9936| 1 | 99.36($ 13440 | 1 |$ 134.40| S 9564 | 1 |$ 95.64
0752 -8" $ 13869 | 1 |$ 138.69|$ 189.00 | 1 |$ 189.00(S$ 136.28| 1 |[S$ 136.28
0753 - 10" $ 189.06 | 1 |$ 189.06|S 25788 | 1 |$S 257.88|S% 186.68| 1 |$ 186.68
0754 - 12" $ 23736 | 1 |$ 23736|$ 32508 1 |$ 32508|S$ 23605| 1 |$ 236.05
0755 - 16" $ 53903 | 1 [$ 539.03|$ 74861 | 1 |S 74861|S$ 54476| 1 |$ 54476
0756 - 24" $ 145776 | 1 | S 1,457.76|$ 2,013.63| 1 |$ 2,013.63| S 1,49460| 1 |$ 1,494.60
GROUP 8 TOTAL ook 802,732,338 iy § 0 3,764.36 | § 0 2,761.63
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY

GROUP 9: TEES, MECHANICAL JOINT BY

MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL
0757 -4" X 4" $ 13800 | 1 |$ 138.00[$ 18396 | 1 |$ 183.96|$ 12425| 1 [$ 124.25
0758 - 6" X 4" $ 19389 | 2 |$ 387.78[$ 25452 | 2 [$ 509.04|$ 173.81| 2 | S 347.62
0759 - 6" X 6" $ 20769 | 1 |$ 20769($ 27972 | 1 |$ 279.72|$ 192.45| 1 [$  192.45
0760 - 8" X 6" $ 24426 | 1 |$ 24426($ 33516 | 1 [$ 33516 229.77| 1 | $ 229.77
0761-8" X 8" $ 27669 | 2 |$ 553.38[$ 38052 2 |$ 761.04[$ 26320 2 [$ 526.40
0762 - 10" X 6" $ 35397 | 1 |$ 353.97($ 47628 | 1 [$ 47628|$ 33973 1 |$ 339.73
0763 - 10" X 8" $ 39882 | 1 |$ 39882|$ 53844 | 1 |$ 53844[$ 386.15| 1 |$ 386.15
0764 - 10" X 10" $ 44919 | 1 |$ 449.19[$ 60648 | 1 |$ 60648|S$ 43644 1 [ S 43644
0766 - 12" X 6" $ 40779 1 |$ 407.79|$ 55104 | 1 |$ 551.04[$ 39396 1 |$ 393.96
0767 - 12" X 8" $ 42711 1 |$ 42711|$ 57708 | 1 |$ 577.08[$ 41369| 1 |$ 413.69
0768 - 12" X 10" $ 51883 | 1 |$ 51883[$ 70392 | 1 |[$ 703.92|$ 507.25| 1 |$ 507.25
0769 - 12" X 12" $ 53889 | 1 |$ 53889|$ 73164 | 1 |$ 73164[$ 52716 1 | S 52716
0979 - 16" X 16" $ 1,30590| 1 |$ 1,305.90($ 1,832.88| 1 |$ 1,832.88|$ 1,309.08| 1 [$ 1,309.08
1975 - 16" X 6" $ 83794 | 1 |$ 83794|$ 1,147.78| 1 |$ 1,147.78|$ 83040| 1 | $ 830.40
GROUP 9 TOTAL oo o|S 6,769.60 | 1S 923446 || S 6,564.35
GROUP 10: TEES, MECHANICAL JOINT BY

ANCHOR ROTO-RING UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL
0772-6" X 6" $ 19803 | 3 |$ 594.09[$ 273.00| 3 |$ 819.00($ 203.03| 3 [$ 609.09
0773 -8" X 6" $ 23943 | 2 |$ 47886[$ 33012 2 |$ 660.24|S 24539| 2 [$ 490.78
1206 - 12" X 6" $ 41262 | 1 |$ 41262|$ 53928 | 1 |$ 539.28($ 41967| 1 [$ 419.67
0978 - 16" X 6" $ 72547 | 1 |$ 72547[$ 102262 1 |$ 1,022.62|$ 73354| 1 [$ 733.54
GROUP 10 TOTAL ] § 2,211,084 [Rnmmnn ] § 3,041.14 [l ¢ 2,253,08
GROUP 11: OFFSETS, MECHANICAL JOINT BY

MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT  [Qry| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL
0776 - 6" X 12" $ 36156 | 3 |$ 1,084.68[$ 44016 | 3 |$ 1,32048[$ 361.44| 3 [$ 1,084.32
0777 - 6" X 18" $ 42918 | 2 | $ 85836[$ 52248 | 2 [$ 1,04496|$ 43211| 2 | S 864.22
0778 - 8" X 12" $ 51336 1 |$ 51336[S 62496 1 |$ 62496|$ 519.17| 1 [$ 519.17
0779 - 8" X 18" $ 61479 | 1 |$ 61479[$ 74844 | 1 [ S 74844|S$ 62517| 1 | $ 625.17
0780 - 12" X 12" $ 1,037.07| 1 | $ 1,037.07[$ 126252 1 |$ 1,26252|$ 1,059.76 | 1 [$ 1,059.76
0781 -12" X 18" $ 1,443.48| 1 | $ 1,443.48[$ 153720 1 [$ 1,537.20| $ 1,29554| 1 | $ 1,295.54
GROUP 11 TOTAL s §5 551,74 [l § 0 6,538.56 [ ] § 5,448.18
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY
GROUP 12: OFFSETS, MECHANICAL JOINT BY

UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
PLAIN END
0784 -6" X 12" $ 33741 | 1 |$S 33741|$ 54264 | 1 | S 542645 34419| 1 | S 344.19
0785 - 6" X 18" $ 369.15| 1 |$ 369.15($ 60396 | 1 |$ 60396(S 37757| 1 |$S 37757
0786 - 8" X 12" $ 49818 | 1 | S 498.18($ 79464 | 1 | S 794645 51196| 1 |$ 51196
0787 - 8" X 18" $ 66792 | 1 |$ 667.92|$ 1,077.72| 1 |$ 1,077.72|$ 68934| 1 |$ 689.34
0788 -12" X 12" $ 1,21233| 1 | $ 1,212.33($ 1,958.88| 1 |$ 1,958.88| S 1,254.89| 1 |$ 1,254.89
0789 - 12" X 18" $ 1,21785| 1 |$ 1,217.85($ 1,96896| 1 |$ 1,968.96| S 1,260.66| 1 |$ 1,260.66
GROUP 12 TOTAL rosEsi it § 4 302.84 [RiEiaeiemEeani ©  6,046.80 [ iaaneiaiiei] & 4438 61
GROUP 13: OFFSETS, PLAIN END BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0792 -6" X 12" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
0793 -6" X 18" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
0794 - 8" X 12" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
0795 - 8" X 18" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
0796 - 12" X 12" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
0797 - 12" X 18" NO BID 1 NOBID |NOBID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
GROUP 13 TOTAL SHIESRREESE NO BID HESURLSLNSYY NO BID HimGanusssd NO BID
GROUP 14: REDUCER, MECAHNICAL JOINT BY
MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0798 - 6" X 4" $ 9936 | 4 | $ 397.44|$ 13356 | 4 | S 534.24| S 88.99| 4 | $ 35596
0799 - 8" X 4" $ 12903 | 1 |$ 129.03|$ 17472 | 1 |$ 17472|$ 11954| 1 |$ 11954
0800 - 8" X 6" $ 14076 | 3 |$ 422.28|$ 189.84 | 3 | S 569.52|S% 13025| 3 |$  390.75
0802 - 10" X 8" $ 17112 | 1 |$ 171.12($ 23436 | 1 | S 23436(S$ 159.19| 1 |$  159.19
1082-12" X 6" $ 22908 | 1 |$S 229.08($ 30828 | 1 |S$ 30828($ 21920 1 |$ 219.20
0013 -12" X 8" $ 23598 | 1 |$ 23598($ 31752 | 1 |$ 31752|$ 22596 | 1 |$ 22596
GROUP14TOTAL b $ 1,584.93 |1t $ 2,138.64 |0t $ 1,470.60
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY

GROUP 15: REDUCER, MECAHNICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
(LARGE END) BY PLAIN END

0807 - 6" X 4" $ 91.77| 1 | $ 91.77|$ 12343 | 1 |$ 123435 8771 1 | s 87.71
0808 - 8" X 4" $ 10350 | 1 |[$ 10350|$ 14280 | 1 |S 142.80( S 9952 1 |$ 99.52
0809 -8" X 6" $ 109.02 | 1 |$ 109.02|($ 14952 | 1 |$ 14952($ 10528| 1 |$  105.28
0810 - 10" X 8" $ 14904 | 1 |$ 149.04|S 20496 | 1 |S 20496(S 14476| 1 |$ 14476
1216 - 12" X 6" $ 19872 | 1 |$ 198.72|$ 27048 | 1 |$ 270485 19567| 1 | S 19567
0811-12"X 8" $ 19596 | 1 [$ 19596|$ 26712 | 1 |S 267.12|S 19279 1 |$  192.79
GROUP 15 TOTAL bt & 848,01 [EiRErim $ 1,15831|.-.c..c.lS 825.73
GROUP 16: REDUCER, PLAIN END BY PLAIN END UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0812 -6" X 4" S 5313 1 [$ 53.13($ 7476 | 1 | S 74.76| S 5553 1 |$ 55.53
0813-8"X 6" S 7452 1 |$ 7452|$ 10500 | 1 [$ 105.00| S 7735| 1 | S 77.35
0814 -10" X 8" $ 11454 | 1 |$ 11454|$ 16128 | 1 | S 161.28|S% 11969 1 |$ 119.69
GROUP 16 TOTAL S S 24229 |-l S 34104 |- ---lenn1S 252,57
GROUP 17: CAP, LINE MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0815 - 4" $ 4692 2 | S 93.84($ 6216 2 | $ 124321 S 4238 2 |$ 84.76
0816 - 6" S 62.10| 4 | $ 24840 84.00 4 |$ 336.00|5S 56.71| 4 | $ 226.84
0817 -8" $ 84.18| 2 | $ 16836|$ 11508 | 2 [$ 23016/ S 7933 2 | $ 158.66
0818 - 10" $ 12075 | 1 |$ 12075|$ 16212 | 1 |$ 162.12($ 11520| 1 [ $  115.20
0819 - 12" $ 14421 | 1 |$ 14421|$ 19656 | 1 |$ 19656|S 13871 1 |$ 138.71
GROUP 17 TOTAL ] 8 775.56 | e $ 1,04916 ... S 72417
GROUP 18: PLUG, LINE MECHANICAL JOINT UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT QTY| TOTAL
0820 - 4" $ 31.74| 1 | S 31.74|$ 4368 1 |S 43.68| $ 3317 1 |$ 33.17
0821-6" $ 51.06| 1 |$ 51.06($ 7056 | 1 |$ 70.56| S 5336 1 |$ 53.36
0822 -8" $ 7245| 1 |$ 72.45]$ 99.96| 1 |$ 99.96| $ 7572 1 |$ 75.72
0823 - 10" $ 93.15| 1 |$ 93.15($ 13020| 1 |$ 130.20]| S 9735 1 |$ 97.35
0824 -12" $ 11178 | 1 |$ 111.78($ 15792 | 1 |$ 15792|S$ 116.81| 1 |$ 116.81
GROUP 18 TOTAL ] § 0 360018 [y § 0 502,32 [y § 0 376.41
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description MJ PIPE BLAIR SUPPLY HD SUPPLY
GROUP 19: NITRILE (BUNA-N) MECHANICAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL UNIT  [QTY| TOTAL
JOINT GASKET ONLY

1790 - 4" $ 1153 6 |$  69.18[$ 1366 6 | S 81.96| S 758| 6 |$ 4548
1791-6" $ 12.80| 12 | $ 153.60($ 1517 12 | $  182.04| $ 863| 12 | § 103.56
1792 - 8" $ 1855| 12 | $ 222.60($ 2199 |12 |$ 263.83|$ 1258|112 [ $  150.96
1793 - 10" $ 2496 | 3 |S  7488|$  2959| 3 |$ 8877($ 1647| 3 [$ 4941
1794 - 12" $ 3805|12|S$ 456.60[S 379412 | S 45528|S$  21.85| 12 |$  262.20
GROUP 19 TOTAL o] $ 0 976.86 finiuiininiiinii] § 1,071,983 Pliieiuiniuininiuid 8 611.61
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