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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 5/28/2013
Number: 400100
Title: ALLISON TRANSMISSION PARTS & TRANSMISSION EXCHANGE & INSTALL
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description O'CONNOR CHEVROLET PENN DETROIT DIESEL
DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST NO BID -25.00%
DELIVERY ARO NO BID 5 DAYS
GROUP I: PUBLIC WORKS VEHICLES NO BID UNIT Qry TOTAL
1.A AT 500 SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $1,283.26 P S e s A R
1.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $1,958.26 I T I
TOTAL NO BID $3,241.52 1 $3,241.52
2.A MT 640 SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $1,761.09 e A
2.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $2,571.09 R D e S
TOTAL NO BID $4,332.18 1 $4,332.18
3.A MT 643 SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $1,972.42 i I A
3.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $2,962.42 T
TOTAL NO BID $4,934.84 1 $4,934.84
4.A MT 650 EXCHANGE NO BID $2,079.37 R e R S
4.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,069.37 sy T T e s S
TOTAL NO BID $5,148.74 1 $5,148.74
5.A MT 653 EXCHANGE NO BID $2,079.37 D o o s S S
5.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,114.37 e e S
TOTAL NO BID $5,193.74 1 $5,193.74
6.A MT 654 EXCHANGE NO BID $2,875.47 T R
EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,955.47 D D S S
TOTAL NO BID $6,830.94 1 $6,830.94
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description O'CONNOR CHEVROLET PENN DETROIT DIESEL
7.A HT 740 SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $3,736.91 S R
7.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $5,086.93 e e
TOTAL NO BID $8,823.84 $8,823.84
8.A HT 750 SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $4,752.83 bt s e
8.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $6,192.83 R
TOTAL NO BID $10,945.66 $10,945.66
9.A MD 3060 OR 3000RDS EXCHANGE NO BID $4,291.98 e ey
9.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $5,911.98 e Sy s
TOTAL NO BID $10,203.96 $10,203.96
10.A MD 3060PR OR 3000RDS EXCHANGE NO BID $4,379.91 Ty s s s ey
10.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $5,999.91 o i s Vet
TOTAL NO BID $10,379.82 $31,139.46
11.A 1000 RDS EXCHANGE NO BID $2,250.00 B
11.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,015.00 T e
TOTAL NO BID $5,265.00 $5,265.00
12.A 2100 RDS SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $2,250.00 S S
12.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,150.00 R
TOTAL NO BID $5,400.00 $5,400.00
13.A 2200 RDS SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $2,272.00 T e e
13.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,172.00 R
TOTAL NO BID $5,444.00 $5,444.00
14.A 2300 RDS SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $2,250.00 T e 7 s Sk R
14.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,150.00 e Ve
TOTAL NO BID $5,400.00 $5,400.00
15.A 2350 RDS SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $2,250.00 e
15.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $3,150.00 e e et
TOTAL NO BID $5,400.00 $5,400.00
16.A 4500 RDS SERIES EXCHANGE NO BID $7,248.50 S R
16.B EXCHANGE AND INSTALL NO BID $9,048.50 b LR
TOTAL NO BID $16,297.00 $16,297.00
TOTAL BID PRICE NO BID R e $134,000.88
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BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description 0'CONNOR CHEVROLET PENN DETROIT DIESEL
GROUP II: MISC IN-CHASSIS REPAIRS NO BID R
LABOR RATE PER HOUR NO BID $90.00
MISC PARTS DISCOUNT NO BID -25.00%
ALLISON EXT OIL FILTER DISCOUNT NO BID -25.00%
ALLISON INT OIL FILTER DISCOUNT NO BID -25.00%
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