
400240_RADIATOR REPAIRING RECORING AND REPLACEMENT

Bid Date: 5/21/2013
Number: 4000240
Title: RADIATOR REPAIRING RECORING AND REPLACEMENT

% DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT
44.00%
NO BID
NO BID

DISCOUNT NET EST QTY TOTAL DISCOUNT NET EST QTY TOTAL
SUG LIST $244.00 141.25$      8 1,130.00$      44% 235.00$      8 1,880.00$      
SUG LIST $238.00 165.47$      4 661.88$          44% 178.00$      4 712.00$          
SUG LIST $165.00 114.00$      2 228.00$          44% 126.00$      2 252.00$          
SUG LIST $164.00 112.19$      4 448.76$          44% 128.00$      4 512.00$          

2,468.64$      3,356.00$      
% DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT

41.00%
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BIDDER INDICATES "SEE ATTACHED LETTER"

BIDDER INDICATES "SEE ATTACHED LETTER"

MANUFACTURER

MANUFACTURER

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER

THERMASYS
NO BID
NO BID

BJR AUTO RADIATOREMPIRE RADIATOR
MANUFACTURER

KEYO RAD
NO BID

GROUP 1 TOTAL

GROUP 1 - CARS AND LIGHT TRUCKS

C
B

5. NON-SPECIFIED RADIATORS
A
B
C
D

Bidder/Item Description
BIDDERS

A

1. 2009 CHEVROLET IMPALA
2. 2009 CHEVROLET SILVERADO
3. 2009 CHEVROLET HHR
4. 2009 FORD ESCAPE HYBRID

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 



400240_RADIATOR REPAIRING RECORING AND REPLACEMENT

BJR AUTO RADIATOREMPIRE RADIATORBidder/Item Description
BIDDERS

% DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT
41.00%
NO BID
NO BID

DISCOUNT NET EST QTY TOTAL DISCOUNT NET EST QTY TOTAL
SUG LIST $1408.04 $990.00* 4 3,960.00$      41% 539.00$      4 2,156.00$      

NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 41% 388.00$      2 776.00$          
3,960.00$      2,932.00$      
6,428.64$      6,288.00$      

*BIDDER INDICATES APPLICATION HAS MORE THAN ONE 
PART DEPENDING ON WHETHER THERE IS AN OIL COLLER 
AND OTHER FACTORS

NOTES

BIDDER INDICATES "SEE ATTACHED LETTER"

MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
THERMASYS

NO BID
NO BID

40.00$                                                                                   

40.00$                                                                                   

80.00$                                                                                            

80.00$                                                                                            

C

TOTAL FOR GROUPS 1 & 2
GROUP 3 - REPAIRS LABOR RATE/HR

GROUP 4 - NON-SPECIFIED REAPIRS 
LABOR RATE/HR

6. 2007 NAVISTAR 7400
7. 2009 CRANE CARRIER CUMMINS ISC
GROUP 2 TOTAL

GROUP 2 - MEDIUM & HEAVY TRUCKS
A
B
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