
400330_SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

Bid Date: 6/10/2013
Number: 400330
Title: SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
580.00$        20 11,600.00$  3.76$            20 75.20$          

NO BID 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID

? 10 ? 3.49$            10 34.90$          
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID
NO BID 10 NO BID 1.19$            10 11.90$          
NO BID 10 NO BID 0.89$            10 8.90$            
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID
NO BID 2 NO BID 15.95$          2 31.90$          
NO BID 6 NO BID NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 6 NO BID NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 6 NO BID NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 2 NO BID 88.95$          2 177.90$        
3,150.00$     1 3,150.00$     1,695.00$     1 1,695.00$     

257.60$        1 257.60$        220.00$        1 220.00$        
230.30$        1 230.30$        220.00$        1 220.00$        

NO BID 1 NO BID 295.00$        1 295.00$        
NO BID 6 NO BID 4.95$            6 29.70$          

BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

GROUP A - MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT, PARTS, AND SUPPLIES
1. HAYWARD INLET FITTINGS SP1023

24. AMERICAN PRODUCTS SKIMMER COVER

20. CHEMICAL CONTROLLER CHEMTROL MODEL 350
21. PH SENSOR FOR CHEMTROL MODEL 350

16. INLET "V" VALVE
17. 3/16" O.D. CLEAR PLASTIC BLEEDER HOSE
18. BROMINATOR GASKET

2. GE 3/4 HP MOTOR
3. BOXER POOL REPAIR LISTS
4. ALADDIN MAGIC LUBE
5. IN-WALL SKINNER W/ 1-3/4 STAINLESS SCREWS
6. TRITON AIR BLEEDER ASSEMBLY

22. ORP SENSOR CHEMTROL MODEL 350
23. ANALYZER BOOSTER PUMP 3/4 HP

7. BROMINATION CB8-14 BP8-2
8. TANK GASKET
9. 1-1/2'  X 1-1/2' FITTING ELBOW
10. 1-1/2'  X 1-1/2' FITTING ST
11. DOUGHBOY PATCHES
12. ITT MARLOW MARDUR MODEL 1-3 STRAINER

14. COMPLETE BROMINATOR MODEL BP8-3
15. CALIBRATED PVC "W" VALVE

19. STRAINER BASKET - STAINLESS STEEL

13. COMPLETE BROMINATOR MOPDEL BP8-2.5
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400330_SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

       NO BID 4 NO BID 5.95$            4 23.80$          
NO BID 6 NO BID 4.39$            6 26.34$          
NO BID 6 NO BID 8.95$            6 53.70$          

23.00$          8 184.00$        18.95$          8 151.60$        
8.95$            6 53.70$          3.75$            6 22.50$          

13.65$          10 136.50$        15.95$          10 159.50$        
4.45$            24 106.80$        5.95$            24 142.80$        

NO BID 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID
NO BID 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID

2.05$            12 24.60$          NO BID 12 NO BID
2.90$            12 34.80$          2.09$            12 25.08$          

12.95$          12 155.40$        6.95$            12 83.40$          
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID 420.00$        1 420.00$        
NO BID 1 NO BID 430.00$        1 430.00$        

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
NO BID 25 NO BID NO BID 25 NO BID
NO BID 50 NO BID 145.00$        50 7,250.00$     
NO BID 2,000 NO BID NO BID 2,000 NO BID
NO BID 240 NO BID NO BID 240 NO BID
NO BID 60 NO BID 17.95$          60 1,077.00$     
NO BID 50 NO BID 79.95$          50 3,997.50$     
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID
NO BID 5 NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID
NO BID 10 NO BID NO BID 10 NO BID
NO BID 35 NO BID 4.95$            35 173.25$        
NO BID 35 NO BID 8.95$            35 313.25$        
NO BID 50 NO BID 19.45$          50 972.50$        

INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE

52. POOL CLEANER - BIODEGRADABLE, PER GAL
53. METHANOL - POOL ANTI-FREEZE, PER GAL

48. BI-CARBONATE OF SODA PER 50 LB BAG
49. SHOCK TREATMENT PER GAL.
50. SODIUM CHLROIDE - BUTTON SALT, PER 50 LB BAG
51. POOL CLEANER - DIODEGRADABLE PER QT

42. ACID PUMP STENNER PUMP CO
43. CHLORINE PUMP STENNER PUMP CO
TOTAL GROUP A
GROUP B - WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES
44. 2" BROMINE TABLETS PER 45 LB PAIL
45. AQUABROME 1" BROMINE TABLETS PER 50 LB PAIL
46. CHLORINE - 15% CONC. PER GAL.
47. MURIATIC ACID PER GAL.

54. POOL WINTERIZING SOLUTION PER GAL.
55. CALCIUM CHLORIDE PER 25 LB BAG

41. NATIONAL 2 FILTER PILOT VALVE ASSEMBLY

39. SIEMENS CHLORINE STRANTROL SYSTEM
40. FILTER BACKWASH CONTROL 

35. HAYWARD DISCHARGE FITTING SP1419D
36. POOL TERMOMETER
37. VACUUM PUMP ASSEMBLY
38. DUAL DIAPHRAGM VALVE

27. WIER EQUALIZER
28. HAYWARD SKIMMER COVER SP1084-R
29. HAYWARD BASKET SP1082-C
30. RELIEF VALVE SP1078
31. SLIDE PLATE SP1082-H-1
32. FILTERING SYSTEM TANK
33. COMPLETE BROMINATOR MODEL RB 8-45
34. HAYWARD INLET FITTING SP 1026

26. BASKET
25. DIVERTER



400330_SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

       NO BID 6 NO BID 42.95$          6 257.70$        
59.80$          6 358.80$        315.00$        6 1,890.00$     
59.80$          6 358.80$        59.95$          6 359.70$        

NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID 13.95$          4 55.80$          
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID

6.90$            1 6.90$            5.95$            1 5.95$            
7.10$            1 7.10$            NO BID 1 NO BID
7.45$            1 7.45$            2.09$            1 2.09$            
2.90$            100 290.00$        3.29$            100 329.00$        
9.55$            6 57.30$          6.45$            6 38.70$          

NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 30 NO BID NO BID 30 NO BID
NO BID 750 NO BID 5.45$            750 4,087.50$     

139.05$        12 1,668.60$     NO BID 12 NO BID
NO BID 12 NO BID NO BID 12 NO BID
NO BID 8 NO BID NO BID 8 NO BID
NO BID 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID

29.95$          4 119.80$        18.95$          4 75.80$          
6.90$            2 13.80$          4.89$            2 9.78$            
7.10$            2 14.20$          4.89$            2 9.78$            
7.45$            2 14.90$          4.89$            2 9.78$            
4.45$            2 8.90$            3.09$            2 6.18$            
4.55$            2 9.10$            3.29$            2 6.58$            
4.40$            2 8.80$            3.00$            2 6.00$            
5.60$            2 11.20$          3.89$            2 7.78$            
8.05$            2 16.10$          5.59$            2 11.18$          
5.00$            2 10.00$          3.59$            2 7.18$            
6.60$            2 13.20$          6.95$            2 13.90$          
6.25$            2 12.50$          6.29$            2 12.58$          
5.60$            2 11.20$          3.95$            2 7.90$            

39.75$          12 477.00$        5.29$            12 63.48$          
33.10$          2 66.20$          8.95$            2 17.90$          

NO BID 8 NO BID 9.95$            8 79.60$          
INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE

59.1 TAYLOR K2001
59.2 TAYLOR K555
59.3 TAYLOR K2002

61. TAYLOR R-0004 PH INDICATOR
62. REPLACEMENT COMPARATORS FOR 2000 SERIES TEST KITS
63. EXTRA FINE PARTICLE SAND 30 MM 50 LB BAG
64. FILTER SAND 45-55MM 50 LB BAG
65. FILTER SAND BROWN 50 LB BAG

78. R-0011L CALCIUM INDICATOR
79. R-0012 HARDNESS INDICATOR
80. R-0853 ACID DEMAND
81. R-0862 BASE DEMAND
82. R1003J PHENOL RED INDICATOR

73. R-0003 DPD NO 3
74. R-0007 THIOSULPHATE
75. R-0008 TOTAL ALKALINITY

60.1 DPD TABLETS #1
60.2 DPD TABLETS #2

66. FILTER CLEANSE 25 LB CONATINER
67. ALGYCIDE 10% PER QT
68. ALGYCIDE 10% PER GAL
69. ALMUNIUM SULFATE 100 LB BAG
70. SODA ASH LIGHT 50 LB BAG

85. COPPER ALGAECIDE 4 ONE GAL CASE
GROUP B TOTAL BID PRICE

71. R-0001 DPD NO 1
72. R-0002 DPD NO 2

76. R-0009 SULFURIC ACID
77. R0010 CALCIUM BUFFER

83. CHLORINE/BROMINE NEUTRALIZER 3 LB BAG
84. WATER CLARIFIERS 94 PZ BOTTLE

56. WATER TEST KITS - TAYLOR K2005 DPD
57. WATER TEST KITS - TAYLOR "PROFESSIONAL"
58. WATER TEST KITS - TAYLOR K2105 DPD BROMINE

60.3 DPD TABLETS #3

59.4 TAYLOR K2003
59.5 TAYLOR K2008



400330_SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

       UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
NO BID 18 NO BID 42.95$          18 773.10$        

79.75$          12 957.00$        15.95$          12 191.40$        
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 12 NO BID 6.95$            12 83.40$          
NO BID 12 NO BID NO BID 12 NO BID

19.85$          12 238.20$        NO BID 12 NO BID
24.40$          6 146.40$        14.95$          6 89.70$          
19.75$          6 118.50$        11.95$          6 71.70$          
11.80$          6 70.80$          NO BID 6 NO BID
35.65$          12 427.80$        NO BID 12 NO BID
15.05$          6 90.30$          7.00$            6 42.00$          

NO BID 6 NO BID NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 6 NO BID NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 4 NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID
NO BID 5 NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID
NO BID 5 NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID
NO BID 200 NO BID NO BID 200 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 100 NO BID NO BID 100 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 200 NO BID NO BID 200 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

0.10$            200 20.00$          NO BID 200 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

0.20$            100 20.00$          NO BID 100 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

0.35$            200 70.00$          0.25$            200 50.00$          
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

12.00$          6 72.00$          NO BID 6 NO BID
60.00$          12 720.00$        NO BID 12 NO BID
60.00$          4 240.00$        NO BID 4 NO BID

112. 5-16" NYLON ROPE TWISTED
113. 3/8" NYLON ROPE TWISTED
114. 7/16" NYLON ROPE TWISTED

92. LEAF SKIMMER
93. RUST STONE
94. NYLON BRUSH 12"
95. CURVED WALL BRUSH 18"

115 1/2" NYLON ROPE TWISTED
116. 5/8" NYLON ROPE TWISTED
117. 9/16" NYLON ROPE TWISTED
118. THERMOMETER

107 1/2" NYLON ROPE
108. 5/8" NYLON ROPE
109. 9/16" NYLON ROPE
110. 3/4" NYLON ROPE
111. 1/4" NYLON ROPE TWISTED

119. RING BUOY 18-1/2" WALL MOUNTED
120. RING BUIY 18-1/2" GUARD TOWER MOUNTED

102. 50' BY 3/4" GARDEN HOSE
103. 1/4" NYLON ROPE

96. NYLON BRISTLE BRUSH 18"
97. DELUXE CURVED WALL BRUSH 18"
98. STAINLESS STELL 6" BRUSH
99. STAINLESS STEEL 9" BRUSH
100. STAINLESS STEEL 12" BRUSH
101. 25' BY 5/8" GARDEN HOSE

104. 5-16" NYLON ROPE

87. SOLID ALUMINUM POLE - 18'
88. ALGAE BRUSHES 4"
89. ALGAE BRUSHES 6"
90. ALGAE BRUSHES 9"
91. LEAF RAKE

GROUP C - MISC POOL SUPPLIES
85. TELESCOPIC ALUMINUM POLES 12' BY 23'
86. TELESCOPIC ALUMINUM POLES 8' BY 15'

106. 7/16" NYLON ROPE
105. 3/8" NYLON ROPE



400330_SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS PARTS AND SUPPLIES - REBID

BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

       66.40$          12 796.80$        42.95$          12 515.40$        
66.40$          12 796.80$        42.95$          12 515.40$        
44.35$          4 177.40$        NO BID 4 NO BID
50.55$          4 202.20$        13.00$          4 52.00$          

127.60$        6 765.60$        NO BID 6 NO BID
NO BID 12 NO BID 24.95$          12 299.40$        

27.55$          12 330.60$        21.95$          12 263.40$        
14.50$          6 87.00$          5.29$            6 31.74$          
13.65$          6 81.90$          NO BID 6 NO BID
37.28$          6 223.68$        8.29$            6 49.74$          
48.60$          25 1,215.00$     41.95$          25 1,048.75$     

287.50$        12 3,450.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

NO BID 30 NO BID 16.95$          30 508.50$        
NO BID 22 NO BID 79.95$          22 1,758.90$     

30.85$          3 92.55$          104.95$        3 314.85$        
NO BID 3 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID

89.95$          3 269.85$        119.95$        3 359.85$        
12.15$          3 36.45$          NO BID 3 NO BID
12.40$          12 148.80$        NO BID 12 NO BID
17.45$          10 174.50$        NO BID 10 NO BID
17.45$          10 174.50$        NO BID 10 NO BID
19.90$          10 199.00$        NO BID 10 NO BID
19.90$          10 199.00$        NO BID 10 NO BID
19.90$          10 199.00$        NO BID 10 NO BID
19.90$          10 199.00$        NO BID 10 NO BID

253.75$        6 1,522.50$     137.67$        6 826.02$        
21.10$          18 379.80$        4.87$            18 87.66$          
69.95$          12 839.40$        110.00$        12 1,320.00$     
22.00$          6 132.00$        NO BID 6 NO BID

NO BID 12 NO BID NO BID 12 NO BID
48.60$          12 583.20$        47.95$          12 575.40$        

7.95$            24 190.80$        NO BID 24 NO BID
39.95$          12 479.40$        NO BID 12 NO BID
91.40$          12 1,096.80$     64.00$          12 768.00$        
13.20$          30 396.00$        7.95$            30 238.50$        

6.08$            200 1,216.00$     1.45$            200 290.00$        

133. FOLLOWING MUST COMPLY W/ NYS SANITARY CODE 6-123B

152. RESCUE TUBES 48" LONG W. 6" STRAP
153. LIFEGUARD FANNY PACKS
154. AIR HORNS
155. UMBRELLAS 6' DIAMETER

147. SPINE BOARD 6'X16"
148. BODY RESTRAINT STRAPS FOR SPINE BOARD
149. UNIVERSAL FIT HEAD IMMODOLIZERS
150. REPLACEMENT CHIN STRAPS FOR ITEM 25
151. ADHESIVE FASTENER KIT

140. AMBU RESUSCITATOR W/ CARRYING CASE
141. TYPE III LIFE VEST CHILD SIZE 30-50 LB
142. TYPE III LIFE VEST CHILD SIZE 50-90 LB
143. TYPE III LIFE VEST ADULT SMALL

136. METAL CHECK TAGS, BRASS 1" ROUND (100 BOX)
137. METAL CHECK TAGS ASSORTED ALUMINUM 1" (100 BOX)
138. ELASTIC WRIST BANDS W/ S HOOKS (100 BOX)
139. BRASS S HOOKS (100 BOX)

129. ROPE HOOKS CLAMP TYPE 1/2"
130. ROPE HOOKS CLAMP TYPE 3/4"

144. TYPE III LIFE VEST ADULT MEDIUM
145. TYPE III LIFE VEST ADULT LARGE
146. TYPE III LIFE VEST ADULT X-LARGE

125. DOUBLE LIFE HOOK 16" W/ 12' POLE
126. POOL RACE STARTER FLAGS WITH LINE 50'

131. RESCUE TUBE - CLOSED CELL, VINYL SKIN
132. 16" X 72" POLYETHYLENE BACKBOARD

134. POCKET CPR MASK IN CASE
135. FIRST AID KITS (24 UNIT)

127. POOL RACE STARTER FLAGS WITH LINE 100'
128. ROPE HOOKS STANDARD 3/4"

156. KICK BOARDS
157. WATER NOODLES 62"

121. RING BUIY 20" WALL MOUNTED
122. RING BUOY 20" GUARD TOWER MOUNTED
123. THROW LINE WITH BALL, 30'
124. THROW LINE WITH BALL 60'
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BIDDERS
LESLIE'S POOL MARTRECREATION SUPPLYBidder/Item Description

       162.60$        4 650.40$        NO BID 4 NO BID
2.80$            300 840.00$        NO BID 300 NO BID
1.95$            200 390.00$        NO BID 200 NO BID

NO BID 50 NO BID NO BID 50 NO BID
NO BID 50 NO BID NO BID 50 NO BID

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
NO BID 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID

554.65$        2 1,109.30$     520.00$        2 1,040.00$     

INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE

INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE

NO BID 20.00%
164. POOL PUMP WHISPER-FLO
165. DISCOUNT CURRENT WHISPER-FLO PUMP PARTS CATALOG
GROUP D TOTAL BID PRICE
GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE ( NO %)
GRAND TOTAL GROUP D % OFF

158. NOODLE STORAGE BIN 2 1/2" HOLDS UP TO 50
159. GOGGLES
160. SWIM CAPS
161. RUBBER FINS MEN
162. RUBBER FINS WOMEN
GROUP C TOTAL BID PRICE
GROUP D - WHISPER-FLO PUMP AND PARTS
163. MAGNETEK MOTOR
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