
400420_SNOW PLOWS, HYDRAULICALLY REVERSIBLE, 10' 11'

Bid Date: 7/16/2013
Number: 400420
Title: SNOW PLOWS, HYDRAULICALLY REVERSIBLE, 10' & 11'

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
$9,082.00 25 $227,050.00 $7,736.00 25 $193,400.00 $7,950.00 25 $198,750.00
$8,734.00 4 $34,936.00 $7,747.00 4 $30,988.00 $7,410.00 4 $29,640.00
$7,478.00 11 $82,258.00 $6,047.00 11 $66,517.00 $6,010.00 11 $66,110.00

NO BID HENDERSON - LOOP HITCH VIKING CIVES - VQL PLOW HALF
NO BID

HENDERSON - PIN HITCH
$614.00

VIKING CIVES - VQL TRUCK HALF
$615.00

NO BID $419.00 $290.00

90 DAYS 90 DAYS
$250.00 $0.00 $0.00

OPTION 2 PRICE (EACH)

VIKING CIVESHENDERSON TRUCK EQUIPMENTSTS TRUCK EQUIPMENTBidder/Item Description

SNOW PLOWS
11' SNOW PLOW

NO BID

$33,736.00 $39,190.00

OPTION 2 MAKE & MODEL

COST PER HOUR OF TRAINER
OPTION 1 MAKE & MODEL
OPTION 1 PRICE (EACH)

10' SNOW PLOW W/ KUPER BLADE
10' SNOW PLOW W/ STEEL BLADE

PLOW PARTS & COMPONENTS LUMP 
SUM BID
TOTAL BID PRICE
DELIVERY ARO

$28,777.00
$377,980.00 $330,095.00 $323,277.00

90 DAYS

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 



400420_SNOW PLOWS, HYDRAULICALLY REVERSIBLE, 10' 11'

Bid Date: 7/16/2013
Number: 400420
Title: SNOW PLOWS, HYDR     

OPTION 2 PRICE (EACH)

Bidder/Item Description

SNOW PLOWS
11' SNOW PLOW

OPTION 2 MAKE & MODEL

COST PER HOUR OF TRAINER
OPTION 1 MAKE & MODEL
OPTION 1 PRICE (EACH)

10' SNOW PLOW W/ KUPER BLADE
10' SNOW PLOW W/ STEEL BLADE

PLOW PARTS & COMPONENTS LUMP 
SUM BID
TOTAL BID PRICE
DELIVERY ARO

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Chu  
Rochester, New York 14614-1
www.cityofrochester.gov 

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
$8,598.00 25 $214,950.00 NO BID 25 NO BID $11,087.00 25 $277,175.00
$6,999.00 4 $27,996.00 NO BID 4 NO BID $10,692.00 4 $42,768.00
$5,440.00 11 $59,840.00 NO BID 11 NO BID $9,411.00 11 $103,521.00

$399.00 NO BIDNO BID

SNOWFIGHTING EQUIPMENT & 
CONSULTANTS OF BUFFALO

$29,023.00
$331,809.00

90 DAYS
$95.00

BONNELL - BON-001042
$596.00

BONNELL - BON-003680
NO BID
NO BID

MDI TRUCK

$38,526.00
$461,990.00
90-120 DAYS

$72.00

NO BID
NO BID

WILLIAM WASHBURN/ SAXBY 
IMPLEMENT CORP

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BIDDERS

NO BID NO BID



400420_SNOW PLOWS, HYDRAULICALLY REVERSIBLE, 10' 11'

Bid Date: 7/16/2013
Number: 400420
Title: SNOW PLOWS, HYDR     

OPTION 2 PRICE (EACH)

Bidder/Item Description

SNOW PLOWS
11' SNOW PLOW

OPTION 2 MAKE & MODEL

COST PER HOUR OF TRAINER
OPTION 1 MAKE & MODEL
OPTION 1 PRICE (EACH)

10' SNOW PLOW W/ KUPER BLADE
10' SNOW PLOW W/ STEEL BLADE

PLOW PARTS & COMPONENTS LUMP 
SUM BID
TOTAL BID PRICE
DELIVERY ARO

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Chu  
Rochester, New York 14614-1
www.cityofrochester.gov 

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL
$7,010.31 25 $175,257.75 NO BID 25 NO BID
$6,836.37 4 $27,345.48 NO BID 4 NO BID
$5,363.11 11 $58,994.21 NO BID 11 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

GEORGIAN SWEDE

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

90 DAYS
$0.00

NO BID

TENCO INDUSTRIES INC

$32,038.94
$293,636.38


	400420

