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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

SNOW PLOW REPLACEMENT BLADES, STEEL AND RUBBER PARTS

BIDDERS

SNOWFIGHTING

Bidder/Item Description NORTHEAST PLOW PARTS EQUIPMENT CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP CROSS BROTHERS WINTER EQUIPMENT
GROUP 1 - STEEL BLADES UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL
A-170" BOMBADIER, STRAIGHT $90.00 2 $180.00 $59.35 2 $118.70 $65.00 2 $130.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID | NOBID| 2 [ NOBID

B-135-1/2" BOMBADIER, "V" $47.50 2 $95.00 $25.90 2 $51.80 $35.00 2 $70.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID [NOBID| 2 | NOBID
C-172" TRACKLESS MT STRAIGHT $90.00 2 $180.00 $59.80 2 $119.60 $67.00 2 $134.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID | NOBID| 2 [ NOBID
D-1 34" TRACKLESS MT "V" $47.50 2 $95.00 $29.35 2 $58.70 $33.00 2 $66.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID [NOBID| 2 | NOBID
E-190-1/4" WESTERN STRAIGHT $75.00 | 20 [ $1,500.00 | $75.75 | 20 | $1,515.00 | $86.00 | 20 | $1,720.00 | NOBID | 20 NOBID | NOBID| 20 | NOBID
F-1 132" AASHO HOLE PUNCH $116.38 | 50 | $5,819.00 | $112.50 | 50 [ $5,625.00 [ $117.00 | 50 | $5,850.00 | NOBID | 50 NOBID | NOBID| 50 | NOBID
G-1120" AASHO HOLE PUNCH $106.25 | 100 $10,625.00| $99.00 [100| $9,900.00 | $108.00 | 100 $10,800.00| NOBID |100| NOBID | NOBID |100| NO BID
I-1 120" RETAINER $59.38 2 $118.76 $39.00 2 $78.00 $68.00 2 $136.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID | NOBID| 2 [ NOBID
J-1 132" RETAINER $65.63 | 30 [ $1,968.90 | $43.00 | 30 | $1,290.00 | $77.00 | 30| $2,310.00 | NOBID | 30 NOBID | NOBID| 30 | NOBID
K-133-1/2" BOMBADIER "V" $47.50 2 $95.00 $25.35 2 $50.70 $29.00 2 $58.00 NOBID | 2 NOBID | NOBID| 2 [ NOBID
L-1 96" FISHER $80.00 6 $480.00 $84.90 6 $509.40 $78.00 6 $468.00 NOBID | 6 NOBID [NOBID| 6 | NOBID
M-1 72" BOBCAT $90.00 6 $540.00 $59.90 6 $359.40 $58.00 6 $348.00 NOBID | 6 NOBID | NOBID| 6 [ NOBID
0-17-1/2" WESTERN PRO-PLUS $75.00 | 10 [ $750.00 §77.75 | 10 | $777.50 $96.00 [ 10 [ $960.00 NOBID | 10 NOBID | NOBID| 10 | NOBID
P-18" WESTERN PRO-PLUS $80.00 | 10 [ $800.00 $82.95 [ 10 | $829.50 | $104.00 | 10 | $1,040.00 | NOBID | 10 NOBID | NOBID| 10 | NOBID
TOTAL GROUP 1 $23,246.66 $21,283.30 $24,090.00 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 2 - RUBBER BLADES UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL
A-2 70" BOMBADIER STRAIGHT $183.54 | 2 $367.08 | $210.00 | 2 $420.00 | $145.00 | 2 $290.00 | $105.00 | 2 $210.00 [ NOBID| 2 | NOBID
B-2 35-1/2" BOMBADIER "V" $91.74 2 $183.48 | $108.00 | 2 $216.00 $75.00 2 $150.00 $42.00 2 $84.00 NOBID| 2 | NOBID
C-2 72" TRACKLESS MT STRAIGHT $183.54 | 2 $367.08 | $164.00 | 2 $328.00 | $149.00 | 2 $298.00 | $108.00 | 2 $216.00 [ NOBID| 2 | NOBID
D-2 34" TRACKLESS MT "V" $91.74 2 $183.48 $78.00 2 $156.00 $72.00 2 $144.00 $41.00 2 $82.00 NOBID| 2 | NOBID
E-2 90-1/4" WESTERN STRAIGHT $238.72 | 5 | $1,193.60 | $193.00 | 5 $965.00 | $184.00 | 5 $920.00 $90.00 5 $450.00 [ NOBID| 5 | NOBID
F-2 132" VIKING R1142TEP $336.49 | 100 $33,649.00 | $499.43 [ 100 $49,943.00| $264.00 | 100| $26,400.00 | $178.00 | 100| $17,800.00 | NO BID | 100| NO BID
G-2 120" GOODROADS $305.90 | 10 | $3,059.00 | $215.00 | 10 | $2,150.00 | $240.00 | 10 | $2,400.00 | $162.00 | 10 | $1,620.00 | NOBID | 10 [ NO BID
K-2 33-1/2" BOMBADIER "V" $91.74 2 $183.48 $79.90 2 $159.80 $71.00 2 $142.00 $41.00 2 $82.00 NOBID| 2 | NOBID
L-2 96" FISHER $244.72 | 30 | $7,341.60 | $212.00 | 30 | $6,360.00 | $194.00 | 30 | $5,820.00 | $121.00 | 30 | $3,630.00 | NOBID | 30 [ NO BID
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BIDDERS

SNOWFIGHTING

Bidder/Item Description NORTHEAST PLOW PARTS EQUIPMENT CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP CROSS BROTHERS WINTER EQUIPMENT
M-2 72" BOBCAT $183.54 | 6 | $1,101.24 | $169.00 [ 6 [ $1,014.00 | $144.00 | 6 $864.00 | $107.00 | 6 $642.00 | NOBID| 6 | NOBID
0-2 7-1/2" WESTER PRO-PLUS $238.72 | 10 | $2,387.20 | $199.00 | 10 [ $1,990.00 | $180.00 | 10 | $1,800.00 | $119.00 | 10 | $1,190.00 | NO BID | 10 | NO BID
P-2 8" WESTERN PRO-PLUS $244.72 | 10 | $2,447.20 | $212.00 | 10 | $2,120.00 | $192.00 | 10 | $1,920.00 | $121.00 | 10 | $1,210.00 | NOBID | 10 [ NO BID
TOTAL GROUP 2 $52,463.44 $65,821.80 $41,148.00 $27,216.00 NO BID
GROUP 3 - MISCELLANEOUS UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL
MISC-11-1/2" X 10" X 50' ROLL
UNCUT RUBBER BLADE MATERIAL |$1,450.00f 1 | $1,450.00 [$1,625.00| 1 | $1,625.00 |$1,197.50| 1 | $1,197.50 | $787.00 | 1 $787.00 | NOBID| 1 | NOBID
TOTAL GROUP 3 $1,450.00 $1,625.00 $1,197.50 $787.00 NO BID
GROUP 4 - NON-SPECIFIED RUBBER UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL UNIT |QTY| TOTAL
PLOW BLADES
NS-1 STRAIGHT CUT PUNCH
RUBBER BLADES, PER FT $30.58 | 40 | $1,223.20 | $32.50 | 40 | $1,300.00 | $25.95 | 40 | $1,038.00 | $16.25 | 40 [ $650.00 [ NOBID| 40 | NO BID
NS-2 ANGLE CUT PUNCH RUBBER
BLADES FOR V-PLOWS, PER FT $30.58 | 20 [ $611.60 $32.50 | 20 | $650.00 $25.95 | 20 | $519.00 $16.50 | 20 | $330.00 | NOBID| 20 | NOBID
TOTAL GROUP 4 $1,834.80 $1,950.00 $1,557.00 $980.00 NO BID
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