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Department of Finance

City of Rochester

City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281

www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.
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ROCHESTER

Bureau of
ty Purchasing

Bid Date: 10/10/2013
Number: 400810
Title: RESIDENTIAL ROADWAY SNOWPLOWING, 2013-14 SEASON 2ND ROUND
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description KEN'S SNOWPLOWING SERVICE TRIMALDI ROADWAYS DAVID KRENZER JOE WELCH JJ CONSTRUCTION/FREY STREET
SECTION 1 DD EEEODDE EEEE DD 0L DDDE D0 EEEED DEEEEE
MAXIMUM NUMBER OF ROUTES 1 1 1 1 6
TOTAL BID SECURITY $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00
CASH, CHECK, LETTER OF CREDIT CHECK CHECK LETTER OF CREDIT CASH CHECK
SECTION 2 - ROUTES PER VEHICLE e o e M M e RES i
A. 6-WHEEL DUMP 1 1 1 5
B. 10-WHEEL DUMP
C. 24,000 LB FRONT END LOADER 1 1
SECTION 3 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
20 $1,300.00 6-WHEEL $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,625.00 FRNT END LDR
22 $1,300.00 6-WHEEL $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
29 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,625.00 FRNT END LDR
30 $1,300.00 6-WHEEL $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,500.00 6-WHEEL
32 $1,300.00 6-WHEEL $1,250.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $925.00 6-WHEEL $1,500.00 6-WHEEL
34 NO BID $1,250.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $925.00 6-WHEEL $1,500.00 6-WHEEL
36 $1,300.00 6-WHEEL $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,500.00 6-WHEEL
37 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
39 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
42 NO BID $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,385.00 6-WHEEL
43 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
a7 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
48 NO BID $1,150.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,385.00 6-WHEEL
49 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
50 NO BID $1,250.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,385.00 6-WHEEL
51 NO BID NO BID $1,467.00 | FRNTENDLDR | $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,300.00 6-WHEEL
52 NO BID $1,250.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,385.00 6-WHEEL
54 NO BID $1,250.00 6-WHEEL NO BID $1,000.00 6-WHEEL $1,385.00 6-WHEEL
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