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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/11/2013
Number: 400830
Title: SIDEWALK SNOWPLOWING, 2013-14 SEASON
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description BELAIRE CONSTRUCTION LLOYD CHRIST WALTER CHRIST J SCOTT KRENZER DAVID KRENZER MARIE KRENZER CJ KRENZER JJ CONSTRUCTION/FREY STREET
SECTION 1 T D D e el e et e e e e R R B
MAXIMUM NUMBER OF ROUTES 13 18 3 12 2
TOTAL BID SECURITY $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,000.00 $15,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,000.00 $14,000.00 $2,000.00
CASH, CHECK, LETTER OF CREDIT CHECK CHECK CHECK LETTER OF CREDIT LETTER OF CREDIT LETTER OF CREDIT LETTER OF CREDIT CASH
SECTION 2 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
1 NO BID $1,456.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,442.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,669.00 $989.00 TRACKLESS
2 $1,200.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,456.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,095.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $994.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,569.00 $989.00 TRACKLESS
3 $1,200.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,256.00 RUBBER TIRE $995.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $927.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,469.00 $869.00 TRACKLESS
SECTION 3 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
4 $1,200.00 RUBBER TIRE $975.00 RUBBER TIRE $882.00 TRACTOR $1,099.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID $869.00 TRACKLESS
5 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $975.00 RUBBER TIRE $882.00 TRACTOR $1,099.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID $989.00 TRACKLESS
6 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $975.00 RUBBER TIRE $862.00 TRACTOR $1,099.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID $989.00 TRACKLESS
7 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $886.00 RUBBER TIRE $792.00 TRACTOR $879.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID $989.00 TRACKLESS
8 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $975.00 RUBBER TIRE $895.00 TRACTOR $929.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $931.00 NO BID
9 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $924.00 RUBBER TIRE $995.00 TRACTOR $949.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $947.00 NO BID
10 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $839.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,025.00 TRACTOR $879.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $937.00 NO BID
11 $1,200.00 RUBBER TIRE $879.00 RUBBER TIRE $995.00 TRACTOR $929.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $946.00 NO BID
12 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $859.00 RUBBER TIRE $995.00 TRACTOR $929.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $917.00 NO BID
13 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $824.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,075.00 TRACTOR $919.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $1,212.00 NO BID
14 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $895.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,055.00 TRACTOR $949.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $936.00 NO BID
15 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE $919.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,075.00 TRACTOR $1,049.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $1,129.00 NO BID
16 NO BID $969.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,055.00 TRACTOR $1,049.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $1,139.00 NO BID
17 NO BID NO BID $1,180.00 TRACTOR $959.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 NO BID NO BID $1,180.00 TRACTOR $959.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 NO BID NO BID $1,180.00 TRACTOR $1,011.00 TRACTOR $1,274.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 NO BID NO BID $1,180.00 TRACTOR $1,059.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $1,089.00 NO BID
21 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $887.00 NO BID
SECTION 4 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
22 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,155.00 TRACTOR $1,274.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,189.00 NO BID
24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,009.00 NO BID
25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $889.00 NO BID
28 $1,000.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $992.00 TRACTOR $1,061.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 $950.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,042.00 TRACTOR $1,209.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 $825.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,019.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,142.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 $825.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,099.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,142.00 TRACTOR NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 $1,000.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,199.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,049.00 TRACTOR $1,069.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 $900.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,199.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,089.00 TRACTOR $1,129.00 TRACTOR $1,274.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 $900.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,199.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,125.00 TRACTOR NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 $1,100.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,199.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,100.00 TRACTOR $1,019.00 TRACTOR $1,274.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,069.00 NO BID
37 $950.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,199.00 RUBBER TIRE $1,125.00 TRACTOR $1,019.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $1,067.00 NO BID
38 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID $1,029.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 $900.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/11/2013
Number: 400830
Title: SIDEWALK SNOWPLOWING, 2013-14 SEASON
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description BELAIRE CONSTRUCTION LLOYD CHRIST WALTER CHRIST J SCOTT KRENZER DAVID KRENZER MARIE KRENZER CJ KRENZER JJ CONSTRUCTION/FREY STREET
40 $900.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID $949.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 $1,300.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID $954.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 $1,000.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
SECTION 4 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
44 $875.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 $875.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,099.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 $900.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,039.00 NO BID
49 $1,000.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $1,041.00 NO BID
50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $925.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $917.00 NO BID
51 NO BID NO BID NO BID $972.00 TRACTOR $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $947.00 NO BID
52 $1,306.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $911.00 NO BID
53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $967.00 NO BID
54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $932.00 NO BID
55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,015.00 NO BID
56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,174.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $929.00 NO BID
57 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR $1,274.00 RUBBER TIRE NO BID $918.00 NO BID
58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 TRACTOR NO BID NO BID $917.00 NO BID
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