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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/29/2013
Number: 400940
Title: SNOW PLOWING CITY PARKING GARAGES, 2013-2014 SEASON
BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description ROCHESTER PLOW RM LANDSCAPE INC ACME POWERWASHING INC

MAXIMUM FACILITIES 3 1 8
BID SECURITY AMOUNT $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $8,000.00
BID SECURITY TYPE CASH CHECK CHECK

PLOW & | LOAD & PLOW & | LOAD & PLOW & | LOAD &
GARAGES DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL
1. HIGH FALLS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
2. SISTER CITIES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
3. COURT ST NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
4. WASHINGTON SQ NO BID NO BID NOBID | $495.00 |$1,300.00]51,795.00( $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
5. MORTIMER ST NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
6. EAST END NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
7. MIDTOWN ENTRY/EXITS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $25.00 $775.00
GARAGES SUBTOTAL NO BID $1,795.00 $5,575.00

PLOW & | LOAD & PLOW & | LOAD & PLOW & | LOAD &
PARKING LOTS DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL DE-ICE HAUL TOTAL
6. PLYMOUTH ST $194.00 | $710.00 | $904.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. BLOCK F LOT $194.00 | $710.00 | $904.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. WADSWORTH $94.00 $630.00 | $724.00 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $750.00 $50.00 $800.00
PARKING LOTS SUBTOTAL $2,532.00 NO BID $800.00
TOTAL BID PRICE $2,532.00 $1,795.00 $6,375.00
PROPOSED VEHICLE GARAGES BOBCAT S250 PICKUP/SKID STEER
PROPOSED VEHICLE PARKING LOTS PICKUP OR LOADER PICKUP/SKID STEER
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