
400950_WORK CLOTHING

Bid Date: 1/9/2014
Number: 400950
Title: WORK CLOTHING

 UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL
18.95$   100 1,895.00$  22.50$    100 2,250.00$  15.78$   100 1,578.00$  21.40$   100 2,140.00$  
22.95$   50 1,147.50$  26.50$    50 1,325.00$  18.18$   50 909.00$     24.05$   50 1,202.50$  
24.95$   1 24.95$       29.50$    1 29.50$       23.00$   1 23.00$       28.20$   1 28.20$       
18.25$   100 1,825.00$  21.85$    100 2,185.00$  14.62$   100 1,462.00$  20.25$   100 2,025.00$  
21.25$   50 1,062.50$  24.25$    50 1,212.50$  16.81$   50 840.50$     22.95$   50 1,147.50$  
24.25$   10 242.50$     27.95$    10 279.50$     15.65$   10 156.50$     25.60$   10 256.00$     
28.00$   50 1,400.00$  25.00$    50 1,250.00$  18.38$   50 919.00$     22.85$   50 1,142.50$  

32.00$   10 320.00$     26.95$    10 269.50$     14.70$   10 147.00$     22.85$   10 228.50$     
32.00$   5 160.00$     26.95$    5 134.75$     14.70$   5 73.50$       24.55$   5 122.75$     
37.95$   1 37.95$       22.50$    1 22.50$       14.70$   1 14.70$       18.30$   1 18.30$       
26.00$   30 780.00$     24.50$    30 735.00$     11.35$   30 340.50$     21.90$   30 657.00$     
29.00$   15 435.00$     25.50$    15 382.50$     12.65$   15 189.75$     22.60$   15 339.00$     
32.00$   5 160.00$     25.50$    5 127.50$     12.65$   5 63.25$       23.40$   5 117.00$     
34.00$   1 34.00$       18.80$    1 18.80$       24.00$   1 24.00$       17.55$   1 17.55$       
25.50$   10 255.00$     29.50$    10 295.00$     21.98$   10 219.80$     23.99$   10 239.90$     
28.50$   10 285.00$     35.00$    10 350.00$     23.15$   10 231.50$     25.85$   10 258.50$     
25.50$   5 127.50$     29.50$    5 147.50$     21.98$   5 109.90$     23.99$   5 119.95$     
28.50$   5 142.50$     35.00$    5 175.00$     23.15$   5 115.75$     25.85$   5 129.25$     

DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

GROUP A - WORK CLOTHING

6. SHORT SLEEVE OXFORD, 4XL-6XL
7. LONG SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, S-XL
8. LONG SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, S-XL
9. LONG SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, 2XL-3XL
10. LONG SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, 4XL-5XL

1. LONG SLEEVE OXFORD, S-XL
2. LONG SLEEVE OXFORD, 2XL-3XL
3. LONG SLEEVE OXFORD, 4XL-6XL
4. SHORT SLEEVE OXFORD, S-XL
5. SHORT SLEEVE OXFORD, 2XL-3XL

16. MEN'S POLO, S-XL
17. MEN'S POLO, 2XL-4XL
18. LADIES POLO, XS-XL
19. LADIES POLO, 2XL-4XL

11. LONG SLEEVE RED KAP STYLE, 6XL
12. SHORT SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, S-XL
13. SHORT SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, 2XL-3XL
14. SHORT SLEEVE DICKIES STYLE, 4XL-5XL
15. SHORT SLEEVE RED KAP STYLE, 6XL

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 



400950_WORK CLOTHING

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

19.50$   10 195.00$     25.95$    10 259.50$     15.97$   10 159.70$     18.30$   10 183.00$     

22.50$   10 225.00$     29.75$    10 297.50$     17.10$   10 171.00$     20.25$   10 202.50$     

25.50$   10 255.00$     32.00$    10 320.00$     20.79$   10 207.90$     24.20$   10 242.00$     

23.50$   5 117.50$     32.00$    5 160.00$     17.10$   5 85.50$       20.25$   5 101.25$     

26.50$   5 132.50$     34.50$    5 172.50$     20.79$   5 103.95$     26.00$   5 130.00$     

19.50$   5 97.50$       25.75$    5 128.75$     15.97$   5 79.85$       18.30$   5 91.50$       

22.50$   5 112.50$     29.50$    5 147.50$     17.10$   5 85.50$       20.25$   5 101.25$     

24.50$   5 122.50$     30.50$    5 152.50$     21.09$   5 105.45$     22.90$   5 114.50$     

27.50$   5 137.50$     34.50$    5 172.50$     22.30$   5 111.50$     24.85$   5 124.25$     

30.50$   5 152.50$     36.50$    5 182.50$     25.91$   5 129.55$     28.80$   5 144.00$     

28.50$   5 142.50$     36.00$    5 180.00$     22.30$   5 111.50$     22.90$   5 114.50$     

31.50$   5 157.50$     37.00$    5 185.00$     25.91$   5 129.55$     30.10$   5 150.50$     

24.50$   5 122.50$     30.00$    5 150.00$     21.09$   5 105.45$     22.90$   5 114.50$     

27.50$   5 137.50$     34.50$    5 172.50$     22.30$   5 111.50$     23.99$   5 119.95$     
15.25$   250 3,812.50$  12.45$    250 3,112.50$  12.35$   250 3,087.50$  13.90$   250 3,475.00$  
17.25$   25 431.25$     13.70$    25 342.50$     13.65$   25 341.25$     15.30$   25 382.50$     
13.75$   250 3,437.50$  12.85$    250 3,212.50$  10.75$   250 2,687.50$  12.40$   250 3,100.00$  
15.75$   30 472.50$     15.45$    30 463.50$     13.00$   30 390.00$     15.00$   30 450.00$     

20. MEN'S PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, S-XL

26. LADIES PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, 2XL-
4XL

27. MEN'S PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, S-XL
28. MEN'S PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, 2XL-
4XL
29. MEN'S PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, 5XL-
6XL
30. MEN'S PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, L-2XL 
(TALL)

21. MEN'S PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, 2XL-
4XL
22. MEN'S PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, 5XL-
6XL
23. MEN'S PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, L-
2XL (TALL)
24. MEN'S PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, 3XL-
6XL (TALL)
25. LADIES PIQUE SHORT SLEEVE GOLF, XS-
XL

36. HEAVY DUTY WORK PANTS, 28-42
37. HEAVY DUTY WORK PANTS, 44-52

31. MEN'S PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, 3XL-
6XL (TALL)

32. LADIES PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, S-XL
33. LADIES PIQUE LONG SLEEVE GOLF, 2XL-
3XL
34. DENIM JEAN, STRAIGHT LEG, 30-42
35. DENIM JEAN, STRAIGHT LEG, 44-52



400950_WORK CLOTHING

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

14.75$   10 147.50$     15.25$    10 152.50$     13.25$   10 132.50$     17.00$   10 170.00$     
26.75$   200 5,350.00$  26.50$    200 5,300.00$  24.00$   200 4,800.00$  30.50$   200 6,100.00$  
30.75$   5 153.75$     29.95$    5 149.75$     26.50$   5 132.50$     33.45$   5 167.25$     
34.75$   1 34.75$       27.72$    1 27.72$       30.00$   1 30.00$       37.00$   1 37.00$       

48.95$   35 1,713.25$  39.60$    35 1,386.00$  35.90$   35 1,256.50$  60.00$   35 2,100.00$  

49.95$   1 49.95$       43.00$    1 43.00$       37.00$   1 37.00$       65.00$   1 65.00$       
16.75$   1 16.75$       13.50$    1 13.50$       13.00$   1 13.00$       14.95$   1 14.95$       
14.75$   1 14.75$       13.00$    1 13.00$       13.00$   1 13.00$       14.15$   1 14.15$       
17.75$   1 17.75$       16.00$    1 16.00$       15.00$   1 15.00$       19.00$   1 19.00$       
18.75$   1 18.75$       17.50$    1 17.50$       18.00$   1 18.00$       19.99$   1 19.99$       
17.75$   20 355.00$     17.50$    20 350.00$     13.00$   20 260.00$     14.50$   20 290.00$     

14.75$   10 147.50$     14.00$    10 140.00$     13.00$   10 130.00$     14.00$   10 140.00$     

61.00$   20 1,220.00$  72.50$    20 1,450.00$  53.50$   20 1,070.00$  71.00$   20 1,420.00$  

66.00$   10 660.00$     77.00$    10 770.00$     61.50$   10 615.00$     77.50$   10 775.00$     

69.00$   1 69.00$       83.00$    1 83.00$       64.50$   1 64.50$       84.00$   1 84.00$       
34.75$   125 4,343.75$  39.00$    125 4,875.00$  32.47$   125 4,058.75$  38.30$   125 4,787.50$  
39.75$   50 1,987.50$  47.75$    50 2,387.50$  38.25$   50 1,912.50$  47.45$   50 2,372.50$  
44.75$   1 44.75$       52.00$    1 52.00$       45.00$   1 45.00$       54.25$   1 54.25$       
44.70$   100 4,470.00$  46.50$    100 4,650.00$  39.76$   100 3,976.00$  40.30$   100 4,030.00$  
50.70$   10 507.00$     49.50$    10 495.00$     42.58$   10 425.80$     43.70$   10 437.00$     
55.70$   10 557.00$     55.75$    10 557.50$     47.00$   10 470.00$     50.90$   10 509.00$     
52.70$   10 527.00$     55.75$    10 557.50$     42.58$   10 425.80$     46.30$   10 463.00$     
44.70$   1 44.70$       48.00$    1 48.00$       40.00$   1 40.00$       42.30$   1 42.30$       
50.70$   1 50.70$       56.00$    1 56.00$       44.00$   1 44.00$       44.30$   1 44.30$       
19.50$   50 975.00$     26.75$    50 1,337.50$  15.75$   50 787.50$     20.50$   50 1,025.00$  

23.50$   50 1,175.00$  29.50$    50 1,475.00$  15.75$   50 787.50$     22.50$   50 1,125.00$  

61. LADIES 3 SEASON JACKET, 2XL-4XL
62. FLANNEL LINED NYLON JACKET, S-XL

63. FLANNEL LINED NYLON JACKET, 2XL-4XL

38. JEAN CUT WORK PANTS, 28-50
39. FLANNEL LINED JEANS, 30-46
40. FLANNEL LINED JEANS, 48-54

46. CLASSIC CARPENTER JEAN, 28-42
47. CLASSIC CARPENTER JEAN, 44-60
48. WOMEN'S RELAX FIT JEANS, 2-20
49.WOMEN'S HEAVY DUTY WORK PANTS, 2-
20
50. INSULATED ZIP TO WAIST COVERALLS, S-
2XL

41. FLANNEL LINED JEANS, 56-60
42. INSULATED SANDED DUCK OVERALL, 30-
60 (SHORT, REGULAR)
43. INSULATED SANDED DUCK OVERALL, 30-
50 (TALL)
44.CLASSIC WORK JEANS, 28-54
45. RELAX FIT JEANS, 28-54

56. MEN'S 3 SEASON JACKET, S-XL
57. MEN'S 3 SEASON JACKET, 2XL-3XL
58. MEN'S 3 SEASON JACKET, 4XL-6XL
59. MEN'S 3 SEASON JACKET, XL-2XL (TALL)
60. LADIES 3 SEASON JACKET, XS-XL

51. INSULATED ZIP TO WAIST COVERALLS, 
3XL-4XL
52. INSULATED ZIP TO WAIST COVERALLS, 
5XL-6XL
53. UNISEX ZIPPER CARDIGAN, XS-XL
54. UNISEX ZIPPER CARDIGAN, 2XL-4XL
55. UNISEX ZIPPER CARDIGAN, 5XL-6XL



400950_WORK CLOTHING

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

25.50$   5 127.50$     31.25$    5 156.25$     15.75$   5 78.75$       24.50$   5 122.50$     
74.50$   15 1,117.50$  90.65$    15 1,359.75$  72.20$   15 1,083.00$  81.65$   15 1,224.75$  
88.50$   2 177.00$     106.00$  2 212.00$     89.00$   2 178.00$     96.65$   2 193.30$     
81.50$   5 407.50$     106.00$  5 530.00$     72.20$   5 361.00$     92.65$   5 463.25$     
70.50$   15 1,057.50$  81.90$    15 1,228.50$  58.55$   15 878.25$     76.50$   15 1,147.50$  
79.50$   15 1,192.50$  87.00$    15 1,305.00$  63.00$   15 945.00$     87.30$   15 1,309.50$  
13.95$   150 2,092.50$  15.20$    150 2,280.00$  9.50$     150 1,425.00$  14.50$   150 2,175.00$  
16.95$   50 847.50$     18.20$    50 910.00$     11.77$   50 588.50$     17.10$   50 855.00$     
18.95$   50 947.50$     18.90$    50 945.00$     12.60$   50 630.00$     17.40$   50 870.00$     

32.95$   50 1,647.50$  39.90$    50 1,995.00$  26.94$   50 1,347.00$  34.50$   50 1,725.00$  

34.95$   40 1,398.00$  43.75$    40 1,750.00$  29.28$   40 1,171.20$  37.00$   40 1,480.00$  

37.95$   5 189.75$     46.50$    5 232.50$     32.00$   5 160.00$     39.75$   5 198.75$     

34.95$   20 699.00$     46.50$    20 930.00$     26.94$   20 538.80$     37.00$   20 740.00$     

37.95$   10 379.50$     46.50$    10 465.00$     29.28$   10 292.80$     37.00$   10 370.00$     

39.95$   1 39.95$       46.50$    1 46.50$       32.00$   1 32.00$       39.75$   1 39.75$       
22.50$   100 2,250.00$  23.50$    100 2,350.00$  17.59$   100 1,759.00$  25.25$   100 2,525.00$  
25.50$   75 1,912.50$  26.00$    75 1,950.00$  17.59$   75 1,319.25$  26.25$   75 1,968.75$  
28.50$   10 285.00$     28.00$    10 280.00$     17.59$   10 175.90$     26.25$   10 262.50$     
31.95$   1 31.95$       43.00$    1 43.00$       29.00$   1 29.00$       40.45$   1 40.45$       

4.00$     400 1,600.00$  3.95$      400 1,580.00$  1.85$     400 740.00$     2.70$     400 1,080.00$  
COMPUTED TOTAL FOR ABOVE ITEMS IN 
GROUP A 67,952.77$                             50,914.10$                            63,646.90$                            64,627.79$                            

65,337.79$                            
1.25$                                      
2.90$                                      

50,914.00$                            
2.00$                                      
2.00$                                      

89,483.80$                             
8.00$                                       

12.00$                                     

63,646.90$                            

N/A
N/AADDITIONAL SCREENPRINTING, 1 SIDE

ADDITIONAL SCREENPRINTING, 2 SIDES

66. HEAVYWEIGHT PARKA, 2XL-4XL
67. HEAVYWEIGHT PARKA, L-2XL (LONG)
68. HEAVYWEIGHT WATERPROOF NYLON, 
69. HEAVYWEIGHT WATERPROOF NYLON, 
70. CREWNECK PULLOVER, S-XL

80. PULLOVER 1/4 ZIP, 2XL-3XL
81. PULLOVER 1/4 ZIP, 4XL-5XL
82. FLEECE PULLOVER 1/4 ZIP, 6XL
83. KNIT CAP

TOTAL GROUP A AS READ AT BID OPENING

64. FLANNEL LINED NYLON JACKET, 5XL-6XL
65. HEAVYWEIGHT PARKA, S-XL

76. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT, M-
XL (TALL)
77. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT 
2XL-4XL (TALL)
78. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT, 
5XL-6XL (TALL)
79. PULLOVER 1/4 ZIP, S-XL

71. CREWNECK PULLOVER, 2XL-3XL
72. CREWNECK PULLOVER, 4XL-5XL
73. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT, S-
2XL
74. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT, 
3XL-4XL
75. HOODED THERMAL LINED ZIP FRONT, 
5XL-6XL



400950_WORK CLOTHING

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

 UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL
59.50$   20 1,190.00$  72.00$    20 1,440.00$  59.00$   20 1,180.00$  62.95$   20 1,259.00$  

69.50$   15 1,042.50$  77.50$    15 1,162.50$  65.00$   15 975.00$     69.75$   15 1,046.25$  

75.50$   10 755.00$     74.00$    10 740.00$     68.00$   10 680.00$     73.00$   10 730.00$     

82.50$   10 825.00$     61.50$    10 615.00$     73.00$   10 730.00$     79.50$   10 795.00$     

87.50$   10 875.00$     95.50$    10 955.00$     84.00$   10 840.00$     89.35$   10 893.50$     

92.50$   1 92.50$       102.00$  1 102.00$     89.00$   1 89.00$       95.90$   1 95.90$       
43.50$   15 652.50$     51.50$    15 772.50$     46.00$   15 690.00$     51.95$   15 779.25$     
48.50$   5 242.50$     53.75$    5 268.75$     48.50$   5 242.50$     52.10$   5 260.50$     
22.50$   50 1,125.00$  23.00$    50 1,150.00$  21.00$   50 1,050.00$  23.85$   50 1,192.50$  
25.50$   5 127.50$     25.00$    5 125.00$     23.25$   5 116.25$     28.90$   5 144.50$     

22.50$   50 1,125.00$  22.50$    50 1,125.00$  21.00$   50 1,050.00$  23.70$   50 1,185.00$  

25.50$   5 127.50$     25.00$    5 125.00$     23.25$   5 116.25$     26.35$   5 131.75$     
22.50$   25 562.50$     25.00$    25 625.00$     21.00$   25 525.00$     23.70$   25 592.50$     
25.50$   5 127.50$     23.00$    5 115.00$     NO BID 5 NO BID 17.00$   5 85.00$       
22.50$   20 450.00$     23.00$    20 460.00$     21.00$   20 420.00$     23.70$   20 474.00$     
25.50$   5 127.50$     30.00$    5 150.00$     23.25$   5 116.25$     17.00$   5 85.00$       
67.50$   20 1,350.00$  70.50$    20 1,410.00$  65.50$   20 1,310.00$  72.40$   20 1,448.00$  
73.50$   5 367.50$     76.25$    5 381.25$     71.50$   5 357.50$     78.99$   5 394.95$     
40.00$   10 400.00$     50.00$    10 500.00$     42.00$   10 420.00$     42.60$   10 426.00$     

44.00$   5 220.00$     55.00$    5 275.00$     49.00$   5 245.00$     46.60$   5 233.00$     

DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE DUPLICATE OF ABOVE

2.50$                                      
1.00$                                      

3.75$                                      
N/A

2.00$                                       
-$                                         

N/A
N/A

16. MEN'S TRADITIONAL FIT JEANS, 
17. MEN'S TRADITIONAL FIT JEANS, 
18. MEN'S DUCK BIB OVERALLS, 30-50
19. MEN'S DUCK BIB OVERALLS, 52-58
20. MEN'S CHAMOIS LONG SLEEVE, S-2XL
21. MEN'S CHAMOIS LONG SLEEVE, 3XL-
4XL, L-3XL (TALL)

3. MEN'S DUCK TRADITIONAL JACKET, S-
2XL
4. MEN'S DUCK TRADITIONAL JACKET, 3XL, 
XL-3XL (TALL)

5. MEN'S DUCK TRADITIONAL COAT, S-2XL
6. MEN'S DUCK TRADITIONAL COAT, 3XL-
5XL, M-3XL (TALL)
7. MEN'S DUCK VEST, S-2XL
8. MEN'S DUCK VEST, 3XL-5XL, L-4XL (TALL)
9. MEN'S RELAXED FIT JEANS, 28-50
10. MEN'S RELXAED FIT JEANS, 52-54

DEDUCT, EMBROIDERY OF NAME
DEDUCT, IRON-ON PATCH VS EMBROIDERY
GROUP B - CARHART HEAVY DUTY 
1. MEN'S DUCK ACTIVE JACKET, S-2XL
2. MEN'S DUCK ACTIVE JACKET, 3XL-6XL, 
2XL-4XL (TALL)

11. MEN'S RELAXED FIT JEANS, 52-54
12. MEN'S RELAXED FIT JEANS, STRAIGHT 
LEG, 28-50
13. MEN'S RELAXED FIT JEANS, STRAIGHT 
LEG, 52-54
14. MEN'S TRADITIONAL FIT JEANS, 28-50
15. MEN'S TRADITIONAL FIT JEANS, 52-54



400950_WORK CLOTHING

BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

13.00$   100 1,300.00$  34.00$    100 3,400.00$  33.00$   100 3,300.00$  36.85$   100 3,685.00$  

 UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL  UNIT QTY TOTAL
19.50$   5 97.50$       25.00$    5 125.00$     17.98$   5 89.90$       19.10$   5 95.50$       
21.50$   5 107.50$     25.00$    5 125.00$     17.98$   5 89.90$       24.50$   5 122.50$     
17.50$   5 87.50$       22.50$    5 112.50$     15.25$   5 76.25$       16.15$   5 80.75$       

19.50$   5 97.50$       22.50$    5 112.50$     15.25$   5 76.25$       16.80$   5 84.00$       
15.50$   5 77.50$       20.00$    5 100.00$     13.25$   5 66.25$       15.50$   5 77.50$       

17.50$   5 87.50$       20.00$    5 100.00$     13.25$   5 66.25$       17.70$   5 88.50$       

13.00$   5 65.00$       18.25$    5 91.25$       9.80$     5 49.00$       13.90$   5 69.50$       

15.00$   5 75.00$       18.50$    5 92.50$       9.80$     5 49.00$       14.90$   5 74.50$       

26.00$   5 130.00$     31.75$    5 158.75$     24.10$   5 120.50$     19.10$   5 95.50$       

28.00$   5 140.00$     31.75$    5 158.75$     24.10$   5 120.50$     24.50$   5 122.50$     

26.00$   5 130.00$     29.90$    5 149.50$     20.19$   5 100.95$     25.40$   5 127.00$     

28.00$   5 140.00$     30.50$    5 152.50$     20.19$   5 100.95$     27.70$   5 138.50$     
33.00$   5 165.00$     40.50$    5 202.50$     29.00$   5 145.00$     41.50$   5 207.50$     
35.00$   5 175.00$     40.50$    5 202.50$     29.00$   5 145.00$     48.05$   5 240.25$     
31.00$   5 155.00$     35.50$    5 177.50$     24.52$   5 122.60$     33.00$   5 165.00$     

33.00$   5 165.00$     36.00$    5 180.00$     24.52$   5 122.60$     33.75$   5 168.75$     
27.00$   5 135.00$     31.50$    5 157.50$     21.29$   5 106.45$     28.00$   5 140.00$     
29.00$   5 145.00$     31.50$    5 157.50$     21.29$   5 106.45$     30.60$   5 153.00$     

COMPUTED TOTAL FOR ABOVE ITEMS IN 
GROUP B 15,897.00$                             INCOMPLETE13,085.00$                            15,936.60$                            

16,081.10$                            14,452.75$                            16,024.00$                             

1.CLASS 3 LONG SLEEVE T-SHIRT, M-XL
2. CLASS 3 LONG SLEEVE T-SHIRT, 2XL-5XL
3. CLASS 3 SHORT SLEEVE T-SHIRT, M-XL

4. CLASS 3 SHORT SLEEVE T-SHIRT, 2XL-5XL
5. CLASS 2 SHORT SLEEVE T-SHIRT M-XL

GROUP C - HIGH-VISIBILITY WORK 
13,085.00$                            

22. FLEECE 2-IN-1 KNIT HAT

TOTAL GROUP B AS READ AT BID OPENING

12. PREMIUM LONG SLEEVE WICKING, 2XL-
5XL
13. FULL ZIP HOODIE, M-XL
14. FULL ZIP HOODIE, 2XL-5XL
15. CLASSIC LIGHTWEIGHT HOODIE, M-XL
16. CLASSIC LIGHTWEIGHT HOODIE, 2XL-
5XL
17. CLASSIC LIGHTWEIGHT CREW 
18. CLASSIC LIGHTWEIGHT CREW 

7. WICKING BIRDSEYE SHORT SLEEVE, M-XL
8. WICKING BIRDSEYE SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL-
5XL

9. CLASS 3 MICROFIBER LONG SLEEVE, M-XL
10. CLASS 3 MICROFIBER LONG SLEEVE, 2XL-
5XL
11. PREMIUM LONG SLEEVE WICKING, M-
XL

6. CLASS 2 SHORT SLEEVE T-SHIRT, 2XL-5XL
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BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

69.50$   5 347.50$     64.00$    5 320.00$     61.83$   5 309.15$     68.50$   5 342.50$     
40.50$   5 202.50$     50.50$    5 252.50$     40.49$   5 202.45$     65.00$   5 325.00$     

42.50$   5 212.50$     50.50$    5 252.50$     40.49$   5 202.45$     70.00$   5 350.00$     
71.50$   5 357.50$     85.70$    5 428.50$     68.60$   5 343.00$     65.00$   5 325.00$     
73.50$   5 367.50$     85.70$    5 428.50$     68.60$   5 343.00$     72.00$   5 360.00$     
67.50$   5 337.50$     69.00$    5 345.00$     54.52$   5 272.60$     65.50$   5 327.50$     
69.50$   5 347.50$     69.00$    5 345.00$     54.52$   5 272.60$     71.90$   5 359.50$     
71.50$   5 357.50$     69.00$    5 345.00$     54.52$   5 272.60$     72.00$   5 360.00$     
40.00$   5 200.00$     49.50$    5 247.50$     38.05$   5 190.25$     38.00$   5 190.00$     

42.00$   5 210.00$     49.50$    5 247.50$     38.05$   5 190.25$     45.00$   5 225.00$     

40.00$   5 200.00$     47.00$    5 235.00$     38.35$   5 191.75$     13.00$   5 65.00$       

42.00$   5 210.00$     47.00$    5 235.00$     38.35$   5 191.75$     15.00$   5 75.00$       
10.50$   5 52.50$       15.50$    5 77.50$       10.45$   5 52.25$       22.00$   5 110.00$     
12.50$   5 62.50$       15.50$    5 77.50$       10.45$   5 52.25$       24.00$   5 120.00$     
12.00$   5 60.00$       19.20$    5 96.00$       11.77$   5 58.85$       25.00$   5 125.00$     
14.00$   5 70.00$       19.20$    5 96.00$       11.77$   5 58.85$       25.00$   5 125.00$     

44.50$   1 44.50$       53.50$    1 53.50$       41.71$   1 41.71$       NO BID 1 NO BID

47.50$   1 47.50$       56.00$    1 56.00$       41.71$   1 41.71$       NO BID 1 NO BID

84.50$   1 84.50$       93.00$    1 93.00$       89.00$   1 89.00$       NO BID 1 NO BID

86.50$   1 86.50$       96.00$    1 96.00$       89.00$   1 89.00$       NO BID 1 NO BID

32.50$   1 32.50$       44.00$    1 44.00$       36.72$   1 36.72$       NO BID 1 NO BID

31. ZIPPER FRONT VEST, M-2XL
32. ZIPPER FRONT VEST, 3XL-5XL

34. BLACK BOTTOM VEST, 2XL-5XL
33. BLACK BOTTOM VEST, S-XL

35. BRILLIANT SERIES LONG RAIN COAT, S-
XL

28. BLACK SERIES WINDBREAKER, 2XL-5XL
29. PROFESSIONAL SURVEYORS VEST, M-
2XL
30. PROFESSIONAL SURVEYORS VEST, 3XL-
5XL

36. BRILLANT SERIES LONG RAIN COAT, 2XL-
5XL
37. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR JACKET, S-
XL
38. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR JACKET, 
2XL-5XL
39. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR PANTS, S-
XL

27. BLACK SERIES WINDBREAKER, M-XL

22. 360 PRO SERIES PARKA, M-XL
23. 360 PRO SERIES PARKA, 2XL-5XL
24. PREMIUM  INSULATED COLD WEATHER 
25. PREMIUM  INSULATED COLD WEATHER 
26. PREMIUM  INSULATED COLD WEATHER 

19. SPEED COLLECTION PREMIUM WORK 
JEAN, 32-42
20. FLEECE LINED BOMBER JACKET, M-XL

21. FLEECE LINED BOMBER JACKET, 2XL-5XL
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BIDDERS
NORTHEAST UNIFORM 

SERVICES
DIVAL SAFETY & SUPPLIESNEW YORK POLICE SUPPLYALSCO INCBidder/Item Description

35.50$   1 35.50$       35.50$    1 35.50$       36.72$   1 36.72$       NO BID 1 NO BID

33.50$   1 33.50$       39.00$    1 39.00$       36.50$   1 36.50$       NO BID 1 NO BID

35.50$   1 35.50$       43.00$    1 43.00$       36.50$   1 36.50$       NO BID 1 NO BID
37.50$   1 37.50$       45.00$    1 45.00$       36.25$   1 36.25$       NO BID 1 NO BID
39.50$   1 39.50$       45.00$    1 45.00$       36.25$   1 36.25$       NO BID 1 NO BID
53.00$   1 53.00$       44.00$    1 44.00$       20.50$   1 20.50$       NO BID 1 NO BID
55.00$   1 55.00$       65.80$    1 65.80$       20.50$   1 20.50$       NO BID 1 NO BID

5.50$     1 5.50$          5.95$      1 5.95$          6.00$     1 6.00$          NO BID 1 NO BID
13.00$   1 13.00$       12.50$    1 12.50$       12.10$   1 12.10$       NO BID 1 NO BID

7,263.00$                               5,497.31$                              6,373.50$                              INCOMPLETE
INCOMPLETE7,263.00$                               5,497.35$                              6,373.50$                              

COMPUTED TOTAL FOR ABOVE ITEMS IN 
GROUP C

48. FLEECE BALACLAVA

TOTAL GROUP C AS READ AT BID OPENING

40. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR PANTS, 
2XL-5XL

41. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR BIB, S-XL
42. BRILLIANT SERIES RAINWEAR BIB, 2XL-
5XL
43. ECONOMY RAIN SUIT, S-XL
44. ECONOMY RAIN SUIT, 2XL-5XL
45. STORM STOPPER RAINWEAR, S-XL
46. STORM STOPPER RAINWEAR, 2XL-5XL
47. HIGH-VIZ KNIT BEANIE
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