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Department of Finance
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281

www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/23/2013
Number: 401040
Title: RESIDENTIAL ROADWAY SNOWPLOWING, 2013-14 SEASON 3RD ROUND
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description SCC SERVICES PIEDMONT EQUIPMENT MANEL EXCAVATING MICHAEL TANDOI GPD90 SERVICES
SECTION 1 Bt ST S il SO P Ob s UL b DU 0 0 R 0 0 S0t s O 0 O b 0 LS et 1 0 SO L Ol U S
MAXIMUM NUMBER OF ROUTES 1 1 1 1 3
TOTAL BID SECURITY $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00
CASH, CHECK, LETTER OF CREDIT CHECK CHECK MONEY ORDER CHECK 2 CHECKS
SECTION 2 - ROUTES PERVEHICLE | ".".".".".". R | B ER N N R R R
A. 6-WHEEL DUMP 1 1 1
B. 10-WHEEL DUMP
C. 24,000 LB FRONT END LOADER 1 1 2
SECTION 3 - ROUTES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE | VEHICLETYPE [ PRICE | VEHICLETYPE| PRICE | VEHICLETYPE| PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
30 NO BID NO BID $1,850.00 | FRNTENDLDR | $1,775.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,389.00 6-WHEEL | $2,600.00 | FRNTEND LDR
32 NO BID NO BID $1,850.00 | FRNTEND LDR| $1,785.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,575.00 6-WHEEL | $2,600.00 [ FRNT END LDR
36 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | FRNTEND LDR| $1,595.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,478.00 6-WHEEL | $1,950.00 6-WHEEL
42 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | FRNTEND LDR | $1,695.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,425.00 6-WHEEL | $2,600.00 | FRNTEND LDR
48 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | FRNTEND LDR| $1,525.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,390.00 6-WHEEL | $1,950.00 [ FRNTEND LDR
50 NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 | FRNTEND LDR| $1,550.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,410.00 6-WHEEL | $1,950.00 [ FRNTEND LDR
52 NO BID NO BID $1,850.00 | FRNTENDLDR | $1,725.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,378.00 6-WHEEL [ $1,792.00 6-WHEEL
54 $1,400.00 | FRNTENDLDR | $1,850.00 | FRNTENDLDR[ $1,895.00 | 6-WHEEL | $1,600.00 6-WHEEL | $2,600.00 [ FRNTEND LDR
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