
401050_DIAMOND SAW BLADES 14", 16", 18"

Bid Date: 11/6/2013
Number: 401050
Title: DIAMOND SAW BLADES 14", 16", 18"

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

52.27$       12 627.24$     188.00$     12 2,256.00$  129.99$     12 1,559.88$  
96.00$       12 1,152.00$  244.00$     12 2,928.00$  164.99$     12 1,979.88$  

154.88$     12 1,858.56$  315.00$     12 3,780.00$  214.99$     12 2,579.88$  

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description
NATIONAL DIAMOND 

ENTERPRISES

3,637.80$                                    

16 IN
18 IN
TOTAL PRICE

14 IN

COMBINATION ASPHALT & 
CONCRETE WET/DRY HIGH-
SPEED DIAMOND SAW 
BLADES

8,964.00$                                    6,119.64$                                    

SKYWORKS EQUIPMENT
DESERT DIAMOND 

INDUSTRIAL

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  How   

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contr    



401050_DIAMOND SAW BLADES 14", 16", 18"

Bid Date: 11/6/2013
Number: 401050
Title: DIAMOND SA     

Bidder/Item Description

16 IN
18 IN
TOTAL PRICE

14 IN

COMBINATION ASPHALT & 
CONCRETE WET/DRY HIGH-
SPEED DIAMOND SAW 
BLADES

Department of Finan
City Hall Room 105A    
Rochester, New York 
www.cityofrochester

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

88.00$       12 1,056.00$  95.62$       12 1,147.44$  283.50$     12 3,402.00$  87.65$       12 1,051.80$  
135.00$     12 1,620.00$  126.23$     12 1,514.76$  311.50$     12 3,738.00$  126.50$     12 1,518.00$  

NO BID 12 NO BID NO BID 12 NO BID 368.50$     12 4,422.00$  145.90$     12 1,750.80$  

BIDDERS BIDDERS

INCOMPLETE 4,320.60$                                    

HILTI INC

INCOMPLETE

ADMAR SUPPLY CO

11,562.00$                                  

MJ PIPE84 LUMBER CO

          wever, they 
         ract award.   

Bureau of 
Purchasing 
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