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www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 1/29/2014

Number: 401270

Title: Radio Read Cold Water Meters

BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description HD Supply Neptune Technology Group
UNIT Q1Y TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

5/8" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter
1.1|Interface Units No Bid 1600 No Bid S 142.00 |1600( S 227,200.00 -
1.2|Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

5/8" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter
1.3|Interface Units Pit Type w/18" antenna No Bid 100 No Bid S 156.00| 100 | S 15,600.00 -
1.4|Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

5/8" x 3/4" Radio Frequency Reading Water

Meter w/Integrated Encoder Registers &
2.1|Meter Interface Units No Bid 400 No Bid S 142.00| 400 S 56,800.00 -
2.2|Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

3/4" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter
2.3]Interface Units Pit Type w/18" antenna No Bid 25 No Bid $ 156.00| 25 [ $  3,900.00 -
2.4|Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid
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3/4" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter
w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units No Bid 400 No Bid 177.00 | 400 [ S 70,800.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

3/4" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units Pit Type w/18" antenna No Bid 100 No Bid 191.00 | 100 [ § 19,100.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

1" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units No Bid 25 No Bid 212.00| 25 | $ 5,300.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

1" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units Pit Type w/18" antenna No Bid 25 No Bid 22800 25 | S 5,700.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

1-1/2" Radio Frequency Reading Water

Meter w/Integrated Encoder Registers &

Meter Interface Units No Bid 200 No Bid 324.00 | 200 | S 64,800.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

1-1/2" Radio Frequency Reading Water

Meter w/Integrated Encoder Registers &

Meter Interface Units Pit Type w/18"

antenna No Bid 10 No Bid 34400 10 | $  3,440.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

2" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units No Bid 300 No Bid 422.00 | 300 | $ 126,600.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid

2" Radio Frequency Reading Water Meter

w/Integrated Encoder Registers & Meter

Interface Units Pit Type w/18" antenna No Bid 10 No Bid 44200 10 [ S 4,420.00
Net with trade-in No Bid No Bid
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Encoder R900L Registers for Inside Sets 5/8"

to 2" sizes No Bid 100 No Bid S 118.00| 100 | $ 11,800.00
Encoder R900L Registers for Pits Sets w/ 18"

Antenna 5/8" to 2" sizes No Bid 20 No Bid S 136.00| 20 [ $ 2,720.00
MXR 920 Mobil Data Collector w/out laptop

P/N 13120-000 No Bid 2 No Bid $6,500.00( 2 |S 13,000.00
GIS Mapping Module for use with MRX920

unit No Bid 2 No Bid $1,650.00( 2 |S 3,300.00
Trimble 900B Nomad handheld collector w/

Bluetooth P/N 13193-001 No Bid 2 No Bid $1,950.00( 2 |S 3,900.00
Trimble 900B Nomad handheld collector w/

Bluetooth, WIFI, GPS, Camera & Scanner P/N

13193-002 No Bid 2 No Bid $2950.00( 2 |[S 5,900.00
Trimble Nomad charging & communication

cradle p/n 13245-001 No Bid 2 No Bid $ 325.00| 2 |S 650.00
R900 Belt Clip Receiver p/n 13253-000 No Bid 2 No Bid $1,550.00( 2 |$ 3,100.00
Encoder R900i Registers for Pit Sets 5/8" - 2"

w/ snub antenna No Bid No Bid S 128.00| 20 | § 2,560.00
5/8" R900i double check backflow meter

inside set No Bid No Bid $ 29500 10 | S  2,950.00
TOTAL BID PRICE S 653,540.00
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