
401310_WINDSHIELD WASHER SOLVENT, BULK DELIVERY

Bid Date: 2/11/2014
Number: 401310
Title: WINDSHIELD WASHER SOLVENT, BULK DELIVERY

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

1 NO BID 2200 NO BID NO BID 2200 NO BID $1.39 2200 $3,058.00 $1.17 2200 $2,574.00

2 $7.58 55 $416.90 $1.72 55 $94.60 $1.49 55 $81.95 $1.77 55 $97.35
3
4

FINGER LAKESBidder/Item Description

$3,139.95

BIDDERS

ONE (1) DRUM (55 GAL PER 
DRUM)
Total Bid Price (1 +2)
NOTES:

$94.60

SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS CO 
INC

$2,671.35

ONE (1) TANK (2,200 GAL 
PER TANK)

$416.90
Exceptions Taken

SOLVENTS & PETROLEUMAMERICAN LUBRICANTS

Department of Finance 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   
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