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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

LAWMEN'S SHOOTERS' SUPPLY

EAGLE & POINT GUN/ TJ MORRIS

AMCHAR WHOLESALE INC

& SON
SERVICE AMMUNITION UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
1. .45 ACP CALIBER, FEDERAL 230 GRAIN |NO BID 100,000 |NO BID $0.326 | 100,000 | $ 32,600.00 | $0.36245 | 100,000 | S 36,245.00
2. RIFLE .223 CAL. FEDERAL 77 GRAIN NO BID 50,000 |[NO BID $0.724 50,000 | $ 36,200.00 | $0.80462 | 50,000 | $ 40,231.00
QUALIFICATION AMMUNITION UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL
3. HANDGUN .45 CAL FMJ NO BID 250,000 (NO BID $0.278 | 250,000 | S 69,500.00 | $0.31148 | 250,000 | $ 77,870.00
4. HANDGUN .45 CAL 175 GRAIN PPMF [NO BID 40,000 |NO BID $0.438 40,000 | $ 17,520.00 | $0.43866 | 40,000 | $ 17,546.40
5. HANDGUN .38 SPECIAL CAL 130
GRAIN FMJ NO BID 30,000 |[NO BID $0.293 30,000 [ $ 8,790.00 | $0.32847 | 30,000 [ S 9,854.10
6. HANDGUN .38 SPEC CAL 135 GRAIN
SPEER GDHP NO BID 15,000 [NO BID $0.333 15,000 | S 4,995.00 | $0.37367 | 15,000 | S 5,605.05
7. HANDGUN .38 SPEC CAL WINCHESTER
BLANKS NO BID 2,000 |[NO BID NO BID 2,000 |NO BID NO BID 2,000 [NO BID
8. HANDGUN .38 SPEC CAL SNC
SIMUNITION FX NO BID 5,000 [NO BID NO BID 5,000 |[NO BID $ 0.64820 5,000 [ $ 3,241.00
9. HANDGUN 9MM CAL SNC
SIMUNITION FX NO BID 20,000 (NO BID NO BID 20,000 [NO BID $ 0.53560 [ 20,000 | $ 10,712.00
10. RIFLE .308 CAL 168 GRAIN FEDERAL |NO BID 12,000 (NO BID $ 0.695 12,000 | S 8,340.00 | $ 0.78125 12,000 [ S 9,375.00
11. RIFLE .223 CAL FEDERAL 55 GRAIN
FVJ NO BID 80,000 |NO BID $ 0.302 80,000 | S 24,160.00 | $ 0.33980 [ 80,000 | $ 27,184.00
12. RIFLE .308 CAL FEDERAL 175 GRAIN |NO BID 2,000 [NO BID $ 0.725 2,000 | S 1,450.00 | $ 0.81365 2,000 [ $ 1,627.30
13. SHOTGUN 12 GAUGE LE132-00 NO BID 10,000 (NO BID $ 0.424 10,000 | S 4,240.00 | $ 0.47572 | 10,000 [ S 4,757.20
14. SHOTGUN 12 GAUGE 2-3/4
FRANGIBLE LEAD FREE 00 BUCKSHOT NO BID 15,000 (NO BID $ 0.728 15,000 | $ 10,920.00 | $ 0.67128 | 15,000 | S 10,069.20
15. SHOTGUN 12 GAUGE SLUGS NO BID 20,000 [NO BID $ 0.392 20,000 | S 7,840.00 [ NO BID 20,000 [NO BID
16. RIFLE .308 HORNADY $0.9706 [ 12,000 | $11,647.20 | NO BID 12,000 [NO BID $0.93300 [ 12,000 | $ 11,196.00
TOTAL BID PRICE S 11,647.20 | S 226,555.00 | S 265,513.25
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