&b City of Rochester

w

“ Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

Bid Date: 6/12/2014
Number: 402140
Title: Athletic Equipment & Accessories for Billiards/Softball/Lacrosse

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

Aluminum Athletic

Buddy's All Stars

BSN Passon's US Games

Laux Sporting Goods

UNIT QTy

TOTAL

UNIT

QTty

TOTAL

UNIT

Qary

TOTAL

UNIT

Qarty

TOTAL

Group 1 - Billiard Equip

1 Billiard - Stick 48™
Aluminum w/Screw-in Tip
Gamecraft NA261XXX 48

S 2353

48

$ 1,129.44

15.97

48

766.56

23.50

48

$ 1,128.00

2 Billiard - Stick 52™
Aluminum w/Screw-in Tip
Gamecraft NA259XXX 48

S 26.14

48

S 1,254.72

16.24

48

779.52

26.50

48

S 1,272.00

3 Billiard - Screw-in Cue Tip
for Aluminum Sticks BSN
NASCRTIP 48

S 8.66

48

S 415.68

0.33

48

15.84

8.99

48

S 43152

4 Billiard - Slip-On Cue Tip
11mm NA252100

100

§ 2511

100

$ 2,511.00

0.14

100

14.00

26.50

100

$ 2,650.00

5 Billiard - Slip-On Cue Tip

13mm NA252100 100

$ 2511

100

$ 2,511.00

0.14

100

14.00

26.50

100

$ 2,650.00

6 Billiard - Triangle Ball Rack,
Plastic NATRPLXX 12

S 7.22

12

S 86.64

5.88

12

70.56

4.29

12

S 51.48

7 Billiard - Chalk (12 per box)
NACHK122

120

S 4.33

120

S 519.60

2.76

120

331.20

3.95

120

S 474.00
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8 Billiard - Wood Bridge Stick
w/Aluminum Head BSN
1378290

12

16.97

12

S 203.64

11.73

12

S 140.76

S 10.75

12

S 129.00

9 Billiard - Table Cover, 8'
Mizerak 1375538

15.68

S 94.08

12.46

S 74.76

S 12.05

S 72.30

Total Bid Price Group 1

S 8,725.80

S 2,207.20

S 8,858.30

Group 2 - Softball Equipment

10 Softball - Mush Rubber

12

8.55

12

S 102.60

2.86

12

S 34.32

no bid

12

11 Softball - Bases, Throw-
Down(4 per set) Franklin
W5676

$

39.00

234.00

26.99

S 161.94

5.94

S 35.64

S 19.95

S 119.70

12 Softball - Bat, Aluminum
31" for Slow-Pitch Easton
Hammer 1373422

15.63

S 93.78

16.32

S 97.92

S 2350

S 141.00

13 Softball - Bat, Aluminum
32" for Slow-Pitch Easton
Hammer 1373422

15.63

S 93.78

16.32

S 97.92

$ 23.50

S 141.00

14 Softball - Bat, Aluminum
33" for Slow-Pitch Easton
Hammer 1373422

15.63

S 93.78

16.32

S 97.92

S 23.50

S 141.00

15 Softball - Bat, Aluminum
34" for Slow-Pitch Easton
Hammer 1373422

15.63

S 93.78

16.32

S 97.92

$ 2525

$  151.50

16 Softball - Bat, Aluminum
33" for Slow-Pitch Easton
Hammer 1373422

12

15.63

12

S 187.56

16.32

12

S 195.84

S 2350

12

S 282.00

17 Softball - Glove, Youth
12.5" - for Right Hand
BBMESHRX

12

22.38

12

S  268.56

14.42

12

S 173.04

S 23.75

12

S 285.00

18 Softball - Glove, Youth
12.5" - for Left Hand
BBMESHXX

24

22.38

24

$ 537.12

14.42

24

S  346.08

S 2375

24

S 570.00

19 Softball - Glove, Adult 13.5
" - Right Hand MacGregor
BBFSPROR

12

45.19

12

S 542.28

36.18

12

S 434.16

S 48.50

12

S 582.00
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20 Softball - Glove, Adult 13.5
" - Left Hand MacGregor

BBFSPROX 12 - 4519 [ 12| S 542.28 36.18| 12 |S 43416 | S 4850(12|S 582.00
21 Softball - Chest Protector -
Youth MCB74 1298376 12 - 3013 | 12| S 361.56 276812 |S 33216 S 2495(12|S 299.40
22 Softball - Shinguards for
Catcher, Youth Single-Knee
B65 MacGregor 1159370 24 - 2654|124 S 636.96 183224 |S 43968 | S 23.15|24|S 555.60
23 Softball-Replacement
Padding for Catcher's Mask,
Red(1 set) MCB27PAD 48 - 6.38(48|S 306.24 567 |48 |S 272.16 no bid 48 | S -
24 Softball-Helmet, Catcher's
with Mask, Fits Sizes 6"-7"
Black MacGregor 1298284 12 - 55.74| 12 | S 668.88 3901212 |$S 46944 | S 3785(12|S 454.20
25 Softball - Batting Tee,
Offical Heavy Duty MacGegor
BBBATTEE| S 25.00 | 12 300.00 2093|112 |S$ 251.16 1484 |12 |S 17808 |S 1465|12|S 175.80
26 Softball-Score Book
MacGregor MSBASBOK 24 - 3664 |24 |S 879.36 29624 |S 71.04| S 3.15( 24| S 75.60
27 Umpire Indicator, Plastic
MacGregor BBUMPIND 24 - 361245 86.64 1.48 |24 | S 3552 | S 199|245 47.76
28 Wiffle Bat 30", w/Taped
Handle, Black Spectrum
W8385 24 - 9.94 |24 |S 23856 232(24|5S 55.68 no bid 24| S -
29 Wiffle Ball, White (3 per
pack) Spectrum W9828 48 - 423 48|S$S 203.04 246 |48 | S  118.08 no bid 48 | -
Total Bid Price Group 2 534.00 S 6,349.86 S 4,016.76 S 4,603.56
Group 3 - Lacrosse Equipment no bid
30 Lacrosse - Stick - STX AV8U
Complete 1075144 40 - 40| S - 2824|140 | S 1,12960| S 27.79(40| S 1,111.60
31 Lacrosse - Ball - NCAA
Approved, Yellow or White
(12 per set) VLCBALL| $ 24.00| 4 96.00 4 1S - 2232 4 | S 89.28| S 16.22| 4 | S 64.88
(Size - Xsmall) CPV - various
colors 5 - 518 - 11078 5 |$ 553.90| S 8750 5 |S 43750
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33 Lacrosse - Helmet - CPV
(Size - Small/Medium) CPV -
Various colors 15| $ - 15| S - S 11078 15| S 1,661.70 S 8750 15| S 1,312.50

34 Lacrosse - Helmet - CPV
(Size - Medium/Large) CPV -

various colors 15| S - 15| S - S 11078 15| S 1,661.70( S 8750 15| S 1,312.50
35 Lacrosse - Helmet, Youth -
CS 1098266 - various colors 15| S - 15| S - S 8856|15|S$ 1,32840|S 8350 15| $ 1,252.50

36 Lacrosse - Goal - Steel,
Official B100 SX, Foldable

6'X6'X7' 1375528 2 |S - 2 (S - S 25472 | 2 |S 50944 |S 22900 2 |[$S 458.00

37 Lacrosse - Glove - STX,
(Size 10_ 1334388 10| S - 10| S - S 2998|10|S 299.80|S 2995(10|S 299.50

38 Lacrosse - Glove - STX,
(Size 12) 1334388 10| S - 10(S - S 2998 |10|$S 29980|S$S 2995(10|S 299.50

39 Lacrosse - Glove - STX,
(Size 13) 1334388 10| S - 10($ - S 2998|10|$S 29980|S$S 2995(10|S 299.50

40 Lacrosse - Glove - Maverik,
(Size - XSmall) 1375338 10| S - 10| $ - S 2736|10|S 27360|S 2750|10(|S 275.00

41 Lacrosse - Glove - Maverik,
(Size - Small) 1375338 10| S - 10(S - S 2736|10|$ 27360 S 2750(10|S 275.00

42 Lacrosse - Glove - Maverik,
(Size - Medium) 1375338 10| S - 10| $ - S 2736|10|S 27360|S 2750|10(|S 275.00

43 Lacrosse - Glove - Maverik,

(Size - Large) 1375338 10| S - 10($ - S 2736|10|$8 27360 S 2750(10|S 275.00

44 Lacrosse - Dry Erase Board
1366487 60| S - 60| S - S 21.18|60|S 1,270.80 | $ 57560 |S 345.00

45 Lacrosse - Score Book
1377127 20| S - 20| S - S 572|120 |S 11440 S 9.95|20|S$ 199.00
Total Bid Price Group 3 S 96.00 S - $10,313.02 S 8,491.98
Total Bid Price S 630.00 $ 15,075.66 $ 16,536.98 $21,953.84
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Metuchen S&S Flaghouse
UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QrYy TOTAL
no bid
48 | S - no bid 48 S - S 19.21 48 S 922.08
48 | S - no bid 48 S - S 25.36 48 $1,217.28
48 | S - no bid 48 S - S 0.50 48 S 24.00
100 no bid 100 1.00 100
$ i, S - > S 100.00
100 S - no bid 100 S - S 0.75 100 S 75.00
12| S - no bid 12 S - S 2.00 12 S 24.00
120 S - S 072 120 S 8640|S 3.00 120 S 360.00
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12 | S - no bid 12 S - S 9.44 12 S 113.28

6 | S - no bid 6 S - no bid 6 S -
S - S  86.40 $ 2,835.64
no bid 123 - no bid 12 $ - $  6.42 12 $  77.04

750 6 | S 4500 | S 7.24 6 S 4344|S 6.30 6 S 37.80

1495| 6 | S 89.70 | no bid 6 S - S 23.72 6 S 142.32
1495| 6 | S 89.70 | no bid 6 S - S 22.87 6 S 137.22
1495| 6 | S 89.70 | S 18.50 6 $ 111.00| S 22.87 6 S 137.22
1495| 6 | S 89.70 | S 18.50 6 $ 111.00 | S 22.87 6 S 137.22

1495 | 12 [ S 179.40 | S 18.50 12 S 222.00 (S 22.87 12 S 274.44

2595| 12 | $ 311.40| no bid 12 S - S 37.36 12 S 448.32
2595| 24 | S 622.80| nobid 24 S - S 37.36 24 S 896.64
55.00 | 12 | $ 660.00 | no bid 12 S - S 42.99 12 $ 515.88
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S 5500|112 |S 660.00 no bid 12 S - S 4299 12 S 515.88
S 3545| 12 | S 42540 | $ 20.00 12 S 240.00| $ 17.94 12 S 215.28
S 310024 |S 744.00 | S 18.50 24 S 444.00| S 22.07 24 S 529.68
no bid 48 | S - no bid 48 S - no bid 48 S -
S 6550| 12 |S 786.00 no bid 12 S - S 42.93 12 S 515.16
S 1595| 12 | S 19140 [ S 16.80 12 S 201.60| $ 15.39 12 S 184.68
S 275124 |S 66.00| S 2.89 24 S 69.36 | S 3.00 24 S 72.00
S 150| 24 | S 36.00| S 0.70 24 S 16.80 S 1.50 24 S 36.00
S 1.89| 24 | S 4536 | S 3.68 24 S 88.32 no bid 24 S -
S 1.16 | 48 | S 55.68|S 2.98 48 S 143.04 no bid 48 S -
S 5,187.24 S 1,690.56 S 4,872.78
no bid
S 2995| 40 | $ 1,198.00 40 S - S 33.84 40 S 1,353.60
S 1890 4 | S 75.60 4 S - no bid 4 S -
S 11995 5 | S 599.75 5 S - no bid 5 S -
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119.95 | 15 | S 1,799.25 15 S - no bid 15 S -
119.95| 15 | S 1,799.25 15 S - no bid 15 S -
109.95 | 15 | S 1,649.25 15 S - no bid 15 S -

165.00| 2 | S 330.00 2 S - $ 325.85 2 S 651.70
2895| 10 | §  289.50 10 S - no bid 10 S -
3295| 10 | $ 329.50 10 S - no bid 10 S -
3295| 10 | $ 329.50 10 S - no bid 10 S -
2999 | 10 | S  299.90 10 S - no bid 10 S -
2999 | 10 | S  299.90 10 S - no bid 10 S -
2999 | 10 | S  299.90 10 S - no bid 10 S -
2999 | 10 | S  299.90 10 S - no bid 10 S -
6.95| 60 | S 417.00 60 S - no bid 60 S -
395|20 | S 79.00 20 S - no bid 20 S -

$ 10,095.20 S - $ 2,005.30

$ 15,282.44 $1,776.96 $9,713.72
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