
Bid Date: 7/21/2014

Number: 402290

Title: Decorative Street & Area Light Fixtures

QTY TOTAL QTY TOTAL QTY TOTAL QTY TOTAL QTY

100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                 100

100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                 100

141,560.00$  127,068.00$  125,800.00$  93,000.00$     

25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25

25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25

25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25

47,550.00$    42,212.25$    39,850.00$    27,250.00$     

-$                

25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25

37,500.00$    33,029.00$    no bid -$                20,250.00$     

-$                

25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25
25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 25

42,500.00$    37,782.00$    no bid -$                25,000.00$     no bid

269,110.00$  240,091.25$  165,650.00$  165,500.00$  

Heritage Castings

8. Suspension Bracket 

Yoke Tear Drop Luminaire

BIDDERS

Total Bid Amount

Cyclone LightingCortland Wholesale ElectricBonnie Curran-Bell ElectricalBidder/Item Description

Total Group 4

Group 1

Group 4

Port of Rochester Suspended 

7. 250 HPS Polycarbonate 

Large Tear Drop

1. 250 HPS_Glass Refractor, 

2. Supension Bracket 

Total Group 1

Group 2

Pedestrian Style Tear Drop

6. 100 HPS-Glass Refractor-

Total Group 3

3. 100 HPS-Glass Refractor-

4. Bracket Arm Pole 

5. Ped Bracket Arm

Total Group 2

Group 3

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   
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TOTAL QTY TOTAL QTY TOTAL QTY TOTAL QT TOTAL

-$                    100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                 

-$                    100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                100 -$                 

150,000.00$      128,180.00$  134,364.00$  137,979.00$  87,600.00$     

-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 

-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 

-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 

24,750.00$        40,582.00$    44,636.50$    45,837.25$    27,425.00$     

-$                 

-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 

30,000.00$        33,318.00$    34,925.50$    35,865.25$    no bid -$                 

-$                    -$                 

-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 
-$                    25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                25 -$                 

-$                    38,112.75$    39,951.50$    41,026.25$    no bid -$                 

204,750.00$      240,192.75$  253,877.50$  260,707.75$  115,025.00$  

Heritage Castings Kovalsky Carr Electric Supply Maynards Electric Mid- Island Electrical Sternberg Lighting
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