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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 9/2/2014
Number: 402480
Title: REPAIR COUPLINGS, SLEEVES & CLAMPS
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description HD SUPPLY VELLANO CORP. MJ PIPE & SUPPLY BLAIR SUPPLY
GROUP 1 S 44560 | S 277.68 NO BID| $ 182.70
GROUP 2 S 1,146.85 | S 1,676.31 NO BID| S 1,515.85
GROUP 3 S 2,606.00 | $ 4,020.25 NO BID| $ 3,875.10
GROUP 4 S 5,325.00 | S 6,343.85 5,194.15 | S 5,562.00
GROUP 5 S 2,619.00 | $ 2,708.75 NO BID| $ 2,791.05
GROUP 6 NO BID| S 2,703.40 NO BID| S 2,668.00
GROUP 7 NO BID| S 3,048.09 NO BID| $ 3,010.00
GROUP 8 NO BID| S 3,048.09 NO BID| S 3,010.00
GROUP 9 NO BID| $ 6,339.40 NO BID| $ 6,190.00
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