S

Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing

City of Rochester

City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/23/2014

Number: 425750

Title: SNOWPLOWING CITY PARKING GARAGES AND LOTS, 2014-2015 SEASON

BIDDERS BIDDERS BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Oxford East L&D Acme Powerwashing Central Roadways Bell Development

SECTION 1 e e e e T T T T T T T e T T e T e e T e D T T e T T e T T e T T T e T T e e e e e T e T T T e D T e e T T e e T e e e T e T T T T T
MAXIMUM NUMBER OF ROUTES 8 8 8

TOTAL BID SECURITY $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

CASH, CHECK, LETTER OF CREDIT check check check check

SECTION 2 - ROUTES PER VEHICLE TYPE

A. Tractor/Rubber Tire

B. Track Vehicle

PRICE TO PLOW & DE-ICE PER CALL VEHICLE
PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
GARAGES TYPE
1 High Falls, 240 State Street $1,000.00 $700.00 $925.00 $650.00
2 Sister Cities, 28 N. Fitzhugh St. $1,000.00 $700.00 $925.00 $650.00
3 Court Street, 194 Court St. $1,000.00 $700.00 $900.00 $550.00
4 Washington Square, 11 Woodbury Blvd | $1,000.00 $700.00 $1,050.00 $650.00
5 Mortimer Street, 83 Mortimer St. $1,000.00 $700.00 $825.00 $500.00
6 East End Garage, 475 E. Main St $1,000.00 $700.00 $875.00 $650.00
7 Midtown Entries/ Exits $500.00 $700.00 $800.00 $350.00
GARAGE SUBTOTAL $6,500.00 $4,900.00 $6,300.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
PARKING LOT
8 Wadsworth, Corner of Wadsworth &
Marshall $500.00 $700.00 $850.00 $300.00
PARKING LOT SUBTOTAL $500.00 $700.00 $850.00 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL BID PRICE $7,000.00 $5,600.00 $7,150.00 $4,300.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPTION 1-PRICE TO LOAD & HAUL PER VEHICLE
PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
CALL GARAGES TYPE
1 High Falls, 240 State Street $300.00 $1,800.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
2 Sister Cities, 28 N. Fitzhugh St. $275.00 $1,520.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
3 Court Street, 194 Court St. $300.00 $1,800.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
4 Washington Square, 11 Woodbury Blvd $225.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
5 Mortimer Street, 83 Mortimer St. $200.00 $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
6 East End Garage, 475 E. Main St $300.00 $6,400.00 $1,100.00 $150.00
7 Midtown Entries/ Exits $100.00 $500.00 $500.00 $75.00
8 Wadsworth, Corner of Wadsworth &
$250.00 $1,800.00 $500.00 $100.00
Marshall
VEHICLE
OPTION 2 - GARAGES PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE PRICE VEHICLE TYPE
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<> City of Rochester

W

Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street

Rochester, New York 14614-1281
The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 10/23/2014
Number: 425750
Title: SNOWPLOWING CITY PARKING GARAGES AND LOTS, 2014-2015 SEASON
BIDDERS BIDDERS BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description Oxford East L&D Acme Powerwashing Central Roadways Bell Development
4x4 picku toolcat 2012 GMC 2500
1 High Falls, 240 State Street no bid PIKUP 1 ¢300.00 p/u loader no bid . $750.00 | with plow &
truck with salter pickup
spreader
4x4 picku toolcat 2012 GMC 2500
2 Sister Cities, 28 N. Fitzhugh St. no bid PICKUP | ¢300.00 p/u loader no bid : $700.00 |  with plow &
truck with salter pickup
spreader
3 Court Street, 194 Court St. no bid bobeat plus | 355 09 p/u loader no bid toolcat | ¢ jengp | Kubota 1100 with
salter pickup plow & spreader
bobcat plus toolcat 2012 GMC 2500
4 Washington Square, 11 Woodbury Blvd no bid salteir) $300.00 p/u loader no bid kU $600.00 with plow &
P P spreader
4x4 picku toolcat 2012 Polaris 850 4
5 Mortimer Street, 83 Mortimer St. no bid p P $300.00 p/u loader no bid . $600.00 |whee with plow &
truck with salter pickup
spreader
6 East End Garage, 475 E. Main St no bid bobeatplus | 355 09 p/u loader no bid tooleat | 50,09 | Kubota 1100 with
salter pickup plow & spreader
bobcat 4x4
. . . . . . . Kubota 1100 with
7 Midtown Entries/ Exits no bid pickup truck $300.00 p/u loader no bid pickup $250.00 Y W
. plow & spreader
with salter
PARKING LOT
8 Wadsworth, Corner of Wadsworth & 4x4 pickup ) i 2012 GMC 2500
Marshall truck with salter p/u loader no bid pickup »200.00 with plow &
W-9 INCLUDED
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