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425970_FIREFIGHTER TURNOUT GEAR

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 1/29/2015
Number: 425970
FIREFIGHTER
Title: TURNOUT GEAR
BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description PGI Municipal Energy Services Churchville Fire Equipment
UNIT QTY| TOTAL UNIT Qry TOTAL UNIT Qry TOTAL
1. TURNOUT COATS, 29", 32",
35", 40" NO BID
Charcoal Black 75 N/A $1,145.00| 75 | S 85,875.00 | $1,195.00| 75 | S 89,625.00
White 12 N/A $1,045.00| 12 | $ 12,540.00| S 972.00| 12 | S 11,664.00
Khaki 12 N/A $1,145.00 | 12 | § 13,740.00| $1,195.00 | 12 | $§ 14,340.00
2. BUNKER PANTS WITH
SUSPENDERS NO BID
Charcoal Black 75 N/A S 900.00| 75 | $ 67,500.00 S 975.00| 75 | $ 73,125.00
Khaki 12 N/A S 900.00| 12 | $ 10,800.00 | S 955.00| 12 | § 11,460.00
3. SUSPENDERS NO BID
H-style suspender (per set) 25 N/A S 3500 25 |S 875.00 $30.00| 25 | S 750.00
4. HOODS
H-style suspender (per set) 21.27] 100 | $2,127.00 $35.00 | 100 | S  3,500.00 $32.00 | 100 | S 3,200.00
5. REFLECTIVE TRIM NO BID
3M Schotchlite triple trim,
Lime/Yellow with silver center, 3"
width, per roll 2 N/A $880.00| 2 |S 1,760.00 $891.00| 2 |S 1,782.00
6. REFLECTIVE TRIM NO BID
Lime/Yellow with silver center 3"
width per roll 2 N/A $550.00| 2 |S$ 1,100.00 $780.00| 2 |S 1,560.00
7. REFLECTIVE LETTERS NO BID
3M Scotchlite Lime/Yellow letters
2" height 100 N/A $2.68 | 100 | $ 268.00 $2.40 1100 | S 240.00
8. REFLECTIVE LETTERS NO BID
3M Scotchlite Lime/Yellow Letters
3" height 100 N/A $2.68 | 100 | $ 268.00 $2.40 1100 | S 240.00
9. ACCESSORIES NO BID
Metal D-Clasps 50 N/A $0.00| 50 | S - $2.50| 50 | S 125.00
10. ACCESSORIES NO BID
Metal Snaps 100 N/A S0.00 | 100 | S - $5.15] 100 | S 515.00
Guaranteed Delivery Days ARO: 30 Days 30-45 Days




