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“Department of Finance
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www.cityofrochester.gov

Bid Date: 3/14/2016
Number: 427060
Title: OUTDOOR SITE FURNITURE

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

Denzak Recreational Design &

Supply Inc.

Gerber Recreation Inc. DBA Thomas

Steele

American Eagle Precast, LLC

Blue Valley Industries

Qry

TOTAL

UNIT

Qry

TOTAL

UNIT

Qrty

TOTAL

UNIT

QTY

TOTAL

1.) THOMAS STEELE OUTDOOR BENCH
CARNIVAL BENCH - STYLE CRB-8C-CA-VS-P
- 8FT BECH W/CENTER LEG

- VERTICAL STRAPS

- CENTER ARMREST

- POWDER COATED E-STEELE FINISH

- COLOR BLACK

OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL

$1,214.23

22 |S

26,713.06

$1,255.30

22 |$

27,616.60

NO BID

22

NO BID

$1,167.50

22

$

25,685.00

2.) OUTDOOR PRECAST PLANTERS
AMERICAN EAGLE PRE-CAST 21ST
CENTURY ROUND PLANTER

36" ROUND

HEIGHT: 22"

WEIGHT: 920 LBS

OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL

$ 581.88

16 | S

9,310.08

$ 400.05

16 | S

6,400.80

S 497.00

16

$7,952.00

NO BID

16

NO BID

3.) 46" ROUND SIGNATURE STYLE 4 SEAT
SUPERIOR FRAME INGROUND SPECIALTY
SERIES GAME TABLE

- STYLE SP211P

- PATTERN: PERFORATED

- COLORS:

TABLE TOP - BLACK

SEAT - BLACK

INSERT BASE - BLACK

LEG COLOR - BLACK

CHECKER BOARD - GREEN

OR CITY APPROVED EQUAL

$1,206.90

16 | S

19,310.40

$1,758.55

16 |S

28,136.80

NO BID

16

NO BID

NO BID

16

NO BID




