
Bid Date: 10/26/2015

Number: 427290

Title: ICE MELT PELLETS

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY SLACK CHEMICAL CO. MSC CORR DISTRIBUTORS, INC WB MASON 84 Lumber

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      9.42  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid 7-10 days 1-7 business days  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid 49 Bags No  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      9.42  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      9.42  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      9.42  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      8.67 7.95$                                Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      8.67  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      8.67  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  $                                      8.67  $                               7.95  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  Kissner Melts Smart  Kissner Great White  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  Y  N  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  Y  N  Non responsive 

 Non responsive  No Bid  No Bid  Y  Y  Non responsive 

BIDDERS

No. of Bags per Shipment: 100-150

Bidder/Item Description

Product Name & Manufacturer

95% Potassium Choride (Y/N)

Net Delivered Cost per 50 lb. Bag (1-15 bag shipment)

Delivery made within ____ days after notification

Minium Order?

95% Calcium Magnesium Acetate (Y/N)

Is this Bid in Conformance w/ Specifications?

No. of Bags per Shipment: 1-15

No. of Bags per Shipment: 16-25

No. of Bags per Shipment: 26-35

No. of Bags per Shipment: 36-50

No. of Bags per Shipment: 51-75

No. of Bags per Shipment: 76-100

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   


