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427950_MECHANICAL JOINT CUTTING-IN SLEEVES ACCESSORIES

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they do
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 4/12/2016
Number: 427950
Title: MECHANICAL JOINT CUTTING-IN SLEEVES & ACCESSORIES
BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description HD WATERWORKS M.J. PIPE & SUPPLY BLAIR SUPPLY CORP COMMERCIAL PIPE
UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT QTy TOTAL UNIT Qrty TOTAL UNIT | QTY | TOTAL
R.W.W. P.N. 1501 S 2.00] 100 | S 200.00 | S 200|100 | $ 200.00 | S 212 100 | S 212.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 1502 S 212|100 | $ 212.00 | S 2.10( 100 | $ 210.00 | S 225 100 | $ 225.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 1503 S 224]1 100 | S 22400 | S 222100 | S 222.00 | S 2.38] 100 | S 238.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 1504 S 235] 100 | S 235.00 | S 233|100 | S 233.00 | S 3.00| 100 | S 300.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 1505 S 259|100 (S 259.00 | $ 3.16 [ 100 | $ 316.00 | S 263 | 100 | $ 263.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 1506 S 3.06| 100 | S 306.00 | S 327|100 | $ 327.00 | S 2.81] 100 | S 281.00 NO BID
Total Bid Price Group 1 S 1,436.00 | $ 1,508.00 | $ 1,519.00 NO BID
Guaranteed Delivery ARO 5-7 Days Stock - 28 Days 14-21 Days NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 0961 S 35200| 4 |S 1,408.00($ 44055| 4 |$S 1,762.20| S 550.00 4 S 2,200.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 0962 S 450.00| 24 | $ 10,800.00 (S 592.75| 24 | S 14,226.00| S 740.00( 24 | S 17,760.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 0963 S 60600 2 |S 1,212.00($ 770.50 S 1,541.00 S 965.00 2 S 1,930.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 0964 S 840.00 S 840.00 S 94360 1 | S 943.60 | S 1,185.00 S 1,185.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 0965 S 996.00 S 996.00 [ $ 1,233.20 $ 1,233.20 | $ 1,720.00 S 1,720.00 NO BID
Total Bid Price Group 2 S 15,256.00 | S 19,706.00 | $ 24,795.00 NO BID
Guaranteed Delivery ARO 5-7 Days 14-28 Days 10-14 Days NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 4961 S 2551 6 |S 153.06 | $ 220 6 |S 13.20 | S 4.90 6 S 29.40 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 4962 S 3313 6 |S 198.78 | S 300 6 |S 18.00 | S 5.00 6 S 30.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 4963 S 43.03]| 6 |S 258.18 [ S 380 6 | S 22.80 | $ 6.00 6 S 36.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 4964 S 4997 6 |S 29982 | S 430 6 | S 25.80 | $ 8.50 6 S 51.00 NO BID
R.W.W. P.N. 4965 S 6142] 6 |S 368.52 | S 78| 6 |S 47.10| S 22.00 6 S 132.00 NO BID
Total bid Price Group 3 S 1,278.36 | S 126.90 | $ 278.40 NO BID
Guaranteed Delivery ARO 5-7 Days Stock - 14 Days 7-10 Days NO BID
TOTAL BID PRICE S 17,970.36 | S 21,340.90 | S 26,592.40 NO BID
w9 YES NO NO NO BID
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