
Bid Date: 4/25/2016

Number: 428000

Title: ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

745.00$        12 8,940.00$        950.00$        12 11,400.00$     2,200.00$      12 26,400.00$     744.00$         12 8,928.00$      

1,040.00$     12 12,480.00$      1,225.00$     12 14,700.00$     1,825.00$      12 21,900.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

140.00$        12 1,680.00$        150.00$        12 1,800.00$       140.00$         12 1,680.00$       180.00$         12 2,160.00$      

75.00$           12 900.00$           100.00$        12 1,200.00$       95.00$           12 1,140.00$       61.00$            12 732.00$         

145.00$        12 1,740.00$        1,200.00$     12 14,400.00$     150.00$         12 1,800.00$       180.00$         12 2,160.00$      

75.00$           12 900.00$           100.00$        12 1,200.00$       90.00$           12 1,080.00$       94.00$            12 1,128.00$      

95.00$           12 1,140.00$        120.00$        12 1,440.00$       208.00$         12 2,496.00$       184.00$         12 2,208.00$      

140.00$        12 1,680.00$        150.00$        12 1,800.00$       132.00$         12 1,584.00$       147.00$         12 1,764.00$      

140.00$        12 1,680.00$        150.00$        12 1,800.00$       132.00$         12 1,584.00$       147.00$         12 1,764.00$      

1,445.00$     12 17,340.00$      1,475.00$     12 17,700.00$     2,765.00$      12 33,180.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

530.00$        12 6,360.00$        575.00$        12 6,900.00$       715.00$         12 8,580.00$       NO BID 12 NO BID

215.00$        12 2,580.00$        250.00$        12 3,000.00$       280.00$         12 3,360.00$       317.00$         12 3,804.00$      

70.00$           12 840.00$           100.00$        12 1,200.00$       95.00$           12 1,140.00$       98.00$            12 1,176.00$      

140.00$        12 1,680.00$        150.00$        12 1,800.00$       157.00$         12 1,884.00$       147.00$         12 1,764.00$      

148.00$        12 1,776.00$        150.00$        12 1,800.00$       240.00$         12 2,880.00$       NO BID 12 NO BID

780.00$        12 9,360.00$        790.00$        12 9,480.00$       2,050.00$      12 24,600.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

135.00$        12 1,620.00$        120.00$        12 1,440.00$       208.00$         12 2,496.00$       214.00$         12 2,568.00$      

500.00$        12 6,000.00$        600.00$        12 7,200.00$       910.00$         12 10,920.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

225.00$        12 2,700.00$        300.00$        12 3,600.00$       475.00$         12 5,700.00$       NO BID 12 NO BID

690.00$        12 8,280.00$        900.00$        12 10,800.00$     900.00$         12 10,800.00$     NO BID 12 NO BID

420.00$        12 5,040.00$        440.00$        12 5,280.00$       480.00$         12 5,760.00$       482.00$         12 5,784.00$      

Oil and Grease 1 

Sedgwick dumbwaiter

Full Maintenance 1 Whirte 

Hydraulic Passenger Elevator

Group 5: (CVMF Building)

Group 10: (Charlotte Branch Library)

BIDDERS

DOWNEY-GOODLEIN ELEVATOR THYSSENKRUPP ELEVATORSCHINDLER ELEVATORBISON ELEVATORBidder/Item Description

Group 1:(City Hall)

Group 2: (Public Safety Building)

Group 3: (Sahlen Stadium)

Group 4: (Records Management)

Group 11: (400 Dewey Ave)

Group 7: (417 Andrews Street)

Group 8: (Adams Street Rec Center)
Group 8 Contd: (Clinton Baden Rec 

Center)

Group 9: A. (Rundel Library)

Group 9: B. (Bausch & Lomb Library)

TOTAL A & B

Group 12: (Edgerton Rec Center)

Group 13: (Hemlock Water Filtration)

Group 14: (Port of Rochester)

Group 16: (Sister's City Garage)

Group 17: (Midtown Garage Atlas St.)

Group 15: (Monroe Branch Library)

Group 18: (Court Street)

Group 19: (Washington Square)

Repair Work: Hourly Rate

$ _____ per mile

23,700.00$                                                  

1.25/mile

185.00/hr

NO BID

143.95$                                                   

0.54$                                                        

24,600.00$                                               

170.00$                                                    

NOTHING

41,760.00$                                                  

180.00$                                                       

0.55$                                                            

Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.  


