<> City of Rochester

W

‘Department of Finance
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City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 6/7/2016
Number: 428160
Title: GRANITE CEMETERY MEMORIALS
BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Coldspring Everlasting Granite Co. Woodside Granite Industries
ITEM1-1.2'x1"x 4"
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 271.46| S 342.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 187.84 | S 423.00
GREY S 265.00 | S 157.71|S 300.00
ROSE S 315.00 | S 215.46| S 434.00
MAHOGANY S 301.00 | S 212.66|$ 497.00
BLACK S 321.00( S 240.62|S$ 413.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #1 S 1,202.00 | S 1,285.75 | S 2,409.00
ITEM2-3'x1"'x 4"
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 395.19| S 476.60
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 269.76 | S 612.14
GREY S 388.00 | S 230.70| S 450.00
ROSE S 463.00 | S 311.19| S 938.00
MAHOGANY S 442.00| S 306.99| S 868.00
BLACK S 472.00| S 348.93| S 728.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #2 S 1,765.00 | $ 1,862.76 | $ 4,072.74
ITEM3-2'x10'x1'6"
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 539.96 | S 552.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 377.43 | S 950.00
GREY S 737.00 | S 252.66 | S 357.00
ROSE S 788.00 | S 447.96 | S 882.00
MAHOGANY S 749.00 | S 430.56 | $ 959.00
BLACK S 803.00 | S 512.79 | S 1,050.00




BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Coldspring Everlasting Granite Co. Woodside Granite Industries
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #3 S 3,077.00 | S 2,561.36 | $ 4,750.00
ITEM4-3'x10" x 1'4"
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 728.72 | S 1,309.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 554,51 | S 2,177.00
GREY S 978.00 | S 367.08 | S 486.00
ROSE S 1,046.00 | S 660.02 | S 1,309.00
MAHOGANY S 994.00 | § 633.92 | S 1,442.00
BLACK S 1,066.00 | S 757.55 | S 1,157.50
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #4 S 4,084.00 | S 3,701.80 | S 7,880.50
ITEMS5 - 20" x 10" x 1'4"
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 429.15 | S 445.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 331.13 | S 660.00
GREY S 614.00 | S 22455 | S 215.00
ROSE S 652.00 | S 439.35 (S 445.00
MAHOGANY S 623.00 | S 421.95 | S 640.00
BLACK S 663.00 | $ 503.09 | $ 630.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #5 S 2,552.00 | S 2,349.22 | S 3,035.00
ITEM6-3'6x1'x1'6" ON BASE: 4'6" x
1'6 x 6"
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY S 1,719.00 No Bid S 2,125.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK S 2,025.00 | S 1,368.28 | S 3,415.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #6 S 3,744.00 | S 1,368.28 | S 5,540.00
ITEM7-1'4x10" x 4"
(0) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 156.01 | S 336.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 110.86 | S 135.00
GREY S 204.00 | S 96.33 | S 320.00
ROSE S 232.00 (S 126.14 | S 336.00
MAHOGANY S 224.00 | S 124.58 | S 190.00
BLACK S 235.00 | S 139.97 | S 156.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #7 S 895.00 | § 753.89 | S 1,473.00
ITEM 8 - DIE SIZE 1'8 x 8" x 2'4"
FINISH: POL2 ROCK SIDES
BASE SIZE: 2'6" x 1' 8"
FINISH: PFT ROCK SIDES
INCLUDES TWO STANDARD CARVINGS




BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Coldspring Everlasting Granite Co. Woodside Granite Industries
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 1,027.72 | S 1,301.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 770.59 | S 1,785.00
GREY S 1,208.00 | S 48991 | S 520.00
ROSE S 1,314.00 | S 849.12 | S 1,301.00
MAHOGANY S 1,221.00 | S 874.65 | S 1,870.00
BLACK S 1,343.00 | S 1,051.35 (S 1,575.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #8 S 5,086.00 | S 5,063.34 | S 8,352.00
ITEM 9 - DIE SIZE 3'6" x 8" x 1'8"
FINISH: POL2 ROCK SIDES
BASE SIZE: 4'6" x 1" x 6"
FINISH: PFT ROCK SIDES
INCLUDES TWO STANDARD CARVINGS
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 1,465.88 | S 1,950.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 1,080.42 | S 2,585.00
GREY S 1,608.00 | S 657.21 | S 790.00
ROSE S 1,693.00 | S 1,199.60 | $ 1,950.00
MAHOGANY S 1,629.00 | S 1,238.28 | S 2,769.00
BLACK S 1,836.00 | S 1,504.80 | $ 2,265.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #10 S 6,766.00 | S 7,146.19 | S 12,309.00
ITEM 10 - DIE SIZE 3' x 8" x 1'10"
FINISH: POL2 ROCK SIDES
BASE SIZE: 4'x 1'x 6"
FINISH: PFT
INCLUDES TWO STANDARD FLORAL
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY S 1,482.00 | S 1,357.39 (S 1,345.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK S 1,691.00 | S 1,003.59 | $ 2,390.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #6 S 3,173.00 | S 2,360.98 | S 3,735.00
ITEM 11 - DIE SIZE 2' x 8" x 2'2"
FINISH: POL2 ROCK SIDES
BASE SIZE: 2'8 x 1' x 6'
FINISH: PFT ROCK SIDES
SHAPE: HEART
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 1,205.63 | S 1,345.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 924.68 | S 1,780.00




BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Coldspring Everlasting Granite Co. Woodside Granite Industries
GREY S 1,212.00 | S 588.92 [ S 550.00
ROSE S 1,331.00 | $ 979.43 | S 1,345.00
MAHOGANY S 1,226.00 | S 1,024.03 | $ 1,910.00
BLACK S 1,366.00 | S 1,189.34 (S 1,560.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #11 S 5,135.00 | S 5,912.03 S 8,490.00
ITEM 12 - DIE SIZE 4' x 8" x 2'8"
FINISH: POL2 ROCK SIDES
BASE SIZE: 5'x 1'2 x 10"
FINISH: PFT ROCK SIDES
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 2,672.95|$ 3,685.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 1,970.75 | $ 5,190.00
GREY S 2,716.00 | S 1,196.65 | $ 1,420.00
ROSE S 3,003.00 | S 2,205.42 | S 3,685.00
MAHOGANY S 2,749.00 | S 2,275.95 | $ 5,215.00
BLACK S 3,091.00 | S 2,765.18 | § 4,845.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #12 S 11,559.00 | S 13,086.90 | S 24,040.00
ITEM 13 -10" x 8" x 1'6"
FINISH: POL3, BRP
6" x 9" Cremation Hole in Bottom
(0) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 472.71 | S 3,295.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 163.79 | S 453.00
GREY S 631.00( S 16491 | $ 530.00
ROSE S 650.00 | $ 296.91 | S 3,295.00
MAHOGANY S 632.00 | S 308.91 | S 453.00
BLACK S 662.00 | S 359.03 | $ 483.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #13 S 2,575.00 | S 1,766.26 | S 8,509.00
ITEM 14 - Memorial 7' x 3' x 0-6"
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 2,489.47 | S 3,295.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 1,869.07 | S 4,890.00
GREY S 2,848.00 | S 1,036.83 | S 1,250.00
ROSE S 3,079.00 | S 1,925.76 | 3,295.00
MAHOGANY S 2,890.00 | S 2,211.99 | $ 4,560.00
BLACK S 3,163.00 | S 2,715.70 | S 4,615.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #14 S 11,980.00 | S 12,248.82 | S 21,905.00

ITEM15- 24'x 1" x 8"




BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description Coldspring Everlasting Granite Co. Woodside Granite Industries
(1) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 370.12 | S 395.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 308.62 | S 530.00
GREY S 421.00 | S 195.12 | S 150.00
ROSE S 457.00 | S 336.52 | S 395.00
MAHOGANY S 427.00 | S 32532 S 610.00
BLACK S 467.00 | S 379.66 | S 495.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #15 S 1,772.00 | $ 1,915.36 | $ 2,575.00
ITEM16- 3'x1'x 8"
(3) VERMONT BARRE GREY No Bid S 543.17 | S 595.00
CHINESE IMPERIAL BLACK No Bid S 450.93 | S 895.00
GREY S 617.00 | S 293.07 | $ 225.00
ROSE S 671.00 | S 492.77 | S 595.00
MAHOGANY S 626.00 | S 47597 | S 900.00
BLACK S 686.00 | S 557.49 | S 785.00
TOTAL BID PRICE, ITEM #16 S 2,600.00 | S 2,813.40| S 3,995.00
OVERALL TOTAL BID PRICE S 64,792.00 | S 63,835.36 | S 119,335.24
Manufacturer Cold Spring Granite Co. Matthews Granite Woodside Granite Industries
Price List Effective Date 3/1/2016 6/6/2016 6/1/2016
Percentage Discount 0% N/A N/A

. , . Up to 90 Days for Gray or Rose

Guaranteed Delivery ___ ARO 45 Usually ships within 120 Days Up to 180 Days for all other colors
Exceptions (Y/N)? Y Y Y




