
Bid Date: 5/31/2016

Number: 428200

Title: GRAVEL, STONE, SAND & TOPSOIL HEMLOCK AND RUSH

UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL UNIT QTY TOTAL

NO BID

NO BID

46.35$                                           

NO BID

EMPIRE ENTERPRISES

18.95$                                           

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$ ____/Ton > 25 tons

1. #2 Crushed Grave

2. #3 Stone

SPALLINO MATERIALS INC.TAOUK DEVELOPMENTHANSON AGGREGATESDOLOMITE INCBidder/Item Description

BIDDERS

NO BID

17.95$                                       

NO BID

3. #1 Crusher Run

4. #2 Crusher Run

5. #3 Crusher run

6. Shot Rock: Light weight

7. Shot Rock: Medium weight

8. Shot Rock: Heavy Weight

9. Screened Topsoil

10. Sand

75.00$                                       

22.00$                                           

26.00$                                           

29.00$                                           

NO BID

15.25$                                           

15.25$                                           

NO BID 7.50$                                             10.00$                                             

NO BID

24.50$                                       

13.25$                                       

17.50$                                           

17.50$                                           

12.75$                                           

12.75$                                           

12.75$                                           

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

20.00$                                           

18.50$                                           

15.25$                                           15.20$                                       

15.00$                                       

15.00$                                       

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

25.00$                                             

NO BID

Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.  


