
Bid Date: 8/29/2016

Number: 428430

Title: CEMETERY/CREMATIONS URNS & MATERIALS

Matthews International Cold Spring

 $                            17,820.00  $                            28,080.00 

 $                            29,700.00  $                            46,230.00 

 $                            16,410.00  $                            25,620.00 

 $                            21,780.00  No Bid 

 $                            37,730.00  No Bid 

 $                              9,440.00  No Bid 

 $                          132,880.00  $                            99,930.00 

15% 20%

 Matthews Tri Divisional 

Urns 

 2016 Bronze Wholesale 

Price Guide 

 $                              1,070.00  No Bid 

 $                              1,675.00  No Bid 

 $                                  980.00  No Bid 

 $                                  430.00  No Bid 

 $                                  790.00  No Bid 

 $                                  300.00  No Bid 

 $                                  540.00  No Bid 

 $                                  640.00  No Bid 

 $                              3,575.00  No Bid 

 $                                  840.00  No Bid 

 $                            10,840.00  No Bid 

15%  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $                          143,720.00  $                            99,930.00 

Bidder/Item Description

1. Memorial 16" x 24" with 

Vase - Companion

2. Memorial 44" x 14" with 

Vase - Companion

3. Memorial 24" x 14" with 

Vase - Single

Group 1 Bronze Cemetery Urns 

& Memorials

2. Marble Urn

4. Urn Mathews Cube

5. Urn Matthews Victory

6. Urn Mattthews Tablet

Group 1 Total Bid Price

Discount off Catalog Price for 

Similar Items: Less

GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE

BIDDERS

Catalog Name and Effective 

Date

8. Gold Plated Brass Heart

9. Marble Companion Earn

10. Urn Vault

Group 2 Total Bid Price
Discount off Catalog Price for 

Similar Items: Less

3. Solid Wood Photo Urn

4. Majestic Keepsake Urn

5. Copper Cylinder Urn

6. Natural Earth Biodegradable

7. Large Sterling Silver Cross

Catalog Name and Effective 

Date

Group 2 Cremations Urns and 

Memorials (Excluding Bronze)

1. Procelain Urn

Department of Finance
Bureau of Purchasing
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street
Rochester, New York 14614-1281
www.cityofrochester.gov

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they 
do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.  


