
Bid Date: 8/25/2015

Number: C04360

Title: PUBLIC MARKET RENOVATION AND EXPANSION_GENERAL CONTRACT

Whitney East 

Inc.

Manning Squires 

Henning

Javen 

Construction

NO BID Yes Yes

NO BID Yes Yes

NO BID Yes Yes

NO BID Yes Yes

NO BID Yes Yes

NO BID  Yes  Y 

NO BID  Yes  Y 

NO BID $7,250,000.00 $7,825,000.00

NO BID $576,000.00 $530,000.00

NO BID $11,000.00 $10,000.00

Y Y

 Y  Y Addendum 2

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

OCSD-4

BID BOND

AP1

AP3

AT10

Form P

OCSD-1

Addendum 1

TOTAL BASE BID

Add Alternate #1

Add Alternate #2

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

C04370_PORTLAND AVE REVITALIZATION



Bid Date: 8/25/2015

Number: C04360

Title: PUBLIC MARKET RENOVATION AND EXPANSION - MECHANICAL CONTRACT

M.A. Ferrauilo Nairy Mechanical T. Bell Mechanical Leo J. Roth

Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes NOT INCLUDED Yes

NOT INCLUDED Yes Yes Yes

NOT INCLUDED Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes

 NON 

CONFORMING 
 $          469,600.00 

 NON 

CONFORMING 
 $     672,000.00 

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Addendum 3

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

TOTAL BASE BID

BID BOND

AP1

AP3

AT10

Form P

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

C04370_PORTLAND AVE REVITALIZATION



Bid Date: 8/25/2015

Number: C04360

Title: PUBLIC MARKET RENOVATION AND EXPANSION - ELECTRICAL CONTRACT

Callea Electric Billitier Electric
Kaplan-Schmidt 

Electric

Schuler-Haas 

Electric

Concord 

Electric

Hewitt Young 

Electric
Connors-Haas

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes N/A

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NOT INCLUDED

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes  Yes Yes N/A

 $      612,000.00  $          560,000.00  $        686,000.00  $     629,000.00  $  743,000.00 567,900.00$  NON CONFORMING

Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

BID BOND

AP1

AP3

AT10

Form P

TOTAL BASE BID

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Addendum 3

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

C04370_PORTLAND AVE REVITALIZATION



Bid Date: 8/25/2015

Number: C04360

Title: PUBLIC MARKET RENOVATION AND EXPANSION - PLUMBING CONTRACT

Nairy 

Mechanical LLC
Leo J. Roth

T. Bell 

Construction

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes NOT INCLUDED

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

$598,888.00 $649,870.00
NON 

CONFORMING

 Y  Y  Y 

Y Y  Y 

Y Y  Y 

Addendum 1

Addendum 2

Addendum 3

BIDDERS

Bidder/Item Description

TOTAL BASE BID

BID BOND

AP1

AP3

AT10

Form P

Unit Price (3 Bay Sink, faucet & 

drain - each)

Department of Finance 
Bureau of Purchasing 
City Hall Room 105A, 30 Church Street 
Rochester, New York 14614-1281 
www.cityofrochester.gov 

The figures provided below are based on the bid opening.  However, they do 
not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.   

C04370_PORTLAND AVE REVITALIZATION


