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The figures provided below are based on the bid opening. However, they

do not necessarily indicate which bidder will receive the contract award.

Bid Date: 5/30/2013
Number: D00030
Title: DEMOLITION PACKAGE 9-13
BIDDERS
Bidder/Item Description THOMPSON BUILDS INC GEITER DONE OF WNY EMPIRE WRECKING CO EMPIRE ENTERPRISES JUPITER ENVIRONMENTAL
BID BOND $9500 BB $9500 CHECK $9500 BB $9500 CHECK $9500 BB
GROUP 1 s e e ey e R e e My e e e M M R S T e S T S S T o S R S M o M S R R T e M S T R e e R R R S M R R R S e M R
6.3 679 COLVIN ST S 9,337.00| S 10,717.00 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 7,870.00 NO BID
6.6 361 FOURTH ST S 5,657.00 | S 6,977.00| S 7,300.00 | $ 6,140.00 NO BID
6.14 280 SIXTH ST S 5,657.00 | S 6,977.00| S 7,300.00 | $ 4,600.00 NO BID
6.15 396 SIXTH ST S 6,657.00 | S 6,452.00| S 7,600.00 | $ 5,290.00 NO BID
6.19 135 WELD ST S 7,667.00 | S 7,750.00( $ 7,500.00 | $ 6,880.00 NO BID
GROUP 1 LUMP SUM BID| $ 34,975.00 | $ 38,873.00 | $ 37,600.00 |$ 30,780.00 NO BID
LT 1 (o] 1 < ] L L L L
6.1 348 CHILD ST S 26,790.00 | S 15,541.00 | $ 15,000.00 | S 36,800.00 (S 18,980.00
6.2 573 CHILD ST S 22,190.00 | S 14,753.00 | $ 13,200.00 | S 21,500.00 (S 21,265.00
6.7 7 FULTON AVE S 23,300.00 | S 16,049.00 | $ 13,970.00 | S 32,500.00 |$ 18,250.00
6.11 762 N PLYMOUTH AVE S 24,605.00 | S 13,446.00 | $ 14,600.00 | S 18,500.00 | S 16,750.00
6.12 224-226 OTIS ST S 21,040.00 | S 18,276.00 | $ 17,900.00 | S 32,500.00 |$ 18,250.00
6.16 54 THORN ST S 19,800.00 | $ 17,003.00 | $ 14,500.00 | S 22,480.00 (S 16,750.00
GROUP 2 LUMP SUM BID| $ 137,725.00 | $ 95,068.00 | S 89,170.00 | $ 164,280.00 | $ 110,245.00
LT 1 (o] 1 < I L L L
6.4 190 COTTAGE ST S 18,165.00 | $ 13,926.00 | $ 13,000.00 | S 18,800.00 | S 16,750.00
6.5 140 DEPEW ST S 18,165.00 | $ 14,926.00 | $ 13,900.00 | S 19,800.00 | S 16,750.00
6.9 579 MAPLE ST S 18,800.00 | $ 13,926.00 | $ 14,000.00 | S 19,580.00 | S 16,750.00
GROUP 3 LUMP SUM BID| $ 55,130.00 | $ 42,778.00 | S 40,900.00 | $ 58,180.00 | $ 50,250.00
GROUP 4 s e o ey e R e e My B e My M S T e S S T o M S R S M M M S R R T e M e T R e e R R S M R R R S M R
6.8 31 LAFORCE ST S 18,800.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,400.00 | S 15,900.00 | S 14,750.00
6.10 118 MORRILL ST S 22,300.00 | S 15,200.00 | $ 15,700.00 | S 19,900.00 | S 22,150.00
6.13 36 SCRANTON ST S 18,740.00 | S 14,700.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 31,500.00 | S 20,875.00
6.17 29 WADSWORTH ST S 17,960.00 | S 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 15,900.00 | $ 13,750.00
6.18 83 WATKIN TER S 19,400.00 | S 17,600.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 28,500.00 | S 18,785.00
GROUP 4 LUMP SUM BID| S 97,200.00 | S 73,500.00 | S 74,100.00 | S 111,700.00 | $ 90,310.00
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